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* NATIONAL BREAKOUTS 

No National Breakouts This Week 

* REGIONAL BREAKOUTS 

These new records, not yet on Billboard's 

Hot 100, have been reported getting strong 

sales action by dealers in major market(s) 
listed In parentheses. 

1a,g; }ur 

Gene Chandler, Vee Jay 468 (Conrad 

forlorn, BMI) (Washington, Cincinnati) 

April Stevens 8 Nino Tempo, Ateo 6248 

(Feist, ASCAP) (Los Angeles) 

THE BOSSE NOVA ',MY HEART SAID),.. 

Tippy K. the Clovers, Tiger 201 

(Trio, BMI) (Houston) 

Conway Twitly, MGM 13112 

( Marielle, BMI) (Milwaukee) 

Boots Randolph, Monument 804 

(Tree, BMI) (Baltimore) 

Ty Hunter, Chess 18 (Kapa, BMI) 

(Miami) 

°.ED'S DREAM .. 
Louisiana Red, Roulette 4469 (Frost, BMI) 

(Memphis.NashviIle) 

Raiders, Van 262 (Glad, BMI) 

(Houston) 

DON'T FENCE ME IN . . . 

George Mahar's, Epic 9569 

(Harms, ASCAP) (Boston) 

ALBUMS 
Page One Albums will be 
found in the LP Review 

Section of this issue 

Crazy Like a Fox 

Fontaine LP Sizzles Like a Meader 

Kill Excise Tax-RIAA Gleason Plug 
By LEE ZHITO 

HOLLYWOOD -The Record Industry Association of America (RIAA) will push for outright ap- lights Fuse 
peal of federal excise tax on disks, it decided here in closed session last month. 

Other issues covered during 
the association's annual Coast 
meeting, which was not open 
to the press, included the neces- 
sity for U. S. record firms to 
rewrite their contracts with 
European labels as a result of 
the Common Market plan, a re- 
port on compulsory copyright 
licensing, and the formation of 
a committee to study uniform 
music licenses. 

Glenn Wallichs, Capitol Rec- 
ords' board chairman, led the 
meeting. In discussing the RIAA 
drive to remove the disk excise 
tax, Wallichs pointed out that a 

book of Shakespeare is not sub- 
ject to excise, but the identical 
contents in disk form is taxed. 

Sir Edward Lewis, head of 

English Decca, among those on 
the dais, reminded American 
record manufacturers that once 
the Common Market is a reality, 
record firms will have to nego- 
tiate new contracts and register 
those agreements in Europe. 
Otherwise, he said, U. S. com- 
panies will not be able to do 
business in Common Market 
countries. 

Ernie Myers, RIAA chief 
counsel, told the meeting that a 

proposal had been made for 
RIAA to study the validity of 
establishing a standard form of 
publishers' mechanical license 
contract. Reason for this, he 
said, is that each publisher uses 
different forms, and that uni- 
formity in the agreements would 

Teener Gets Shot at 
Fame -Thanks to Lenny 

ANDRE 

NEW YORK -Leonard Bern- 
stein, who shot to fame as a 

conductor when he stepped in 
for an ailing senior some years 
back, this week gave a similar 
opportunity to a 16- year -old 
pianist who was totally un- 
known until mid -January. Andre 
Watts was named by Bernstein 
to substitute for Glenn Gould, 
who was reported indisposed, 
in the concerts of January 31 

and February 1. 

The latter concert was slated 

to be recorded and broadcast 

WATTS 

on the CBS Radio network on 
February 2. Columbia Records 
signed the youth last week and 
recorded him on Sunday. 

Thus, the national spotlight 
fell once more on the boy who 
on January 15 performed the 
Liszt Piano Concerto at a New 
York Philharmonic Young Peo- 
ple's Concert and created a con- 
siderable furor when the video- 
tape of the concert was rebroad- 
cast a few days later. Young 
Watts played the Liszt Concerto 
on this latest national exposure 
as well as his forthcoming disk. 

have a stabilizing effect on the 
industry. An RIAA committee 

(Continued on page 6) 

H. Schwartz 
Dies at 73 

WASHINGTON - Harry 
Schwartz, head of Schwartz 
Distributors here, died Friday 
(1) of a heart attack. Schwartz 
was head of one of the largest 
distributing firms in the United 
States, servicing the Washing- 
ton area and covering parts of 
Maryland and V i r gin i a. 

Schwartz, who was 73, was one 
of the founders of ARMADA, 
and was treasurer of the dis- 
tributor association at the time 
of his death. He is survived by 
three sons in the business, Jim, 
Bertram and Stuart, and by his 
widow, Molly. Interment was 
scheduled for Sunday in Wash- 
ington. 

Widely respected as head of 
perhaps the best run distribu- 
torship in the nation, Schwartz 
came out of retirement after 
World War II to set up and 
head the company at the behest 
of his sons when they came out 
of the service. Prior to that time, 
Schwartz had been a successful 
haberdasher. 

By BOB ROLONTZ 

NEW YORK - Another "left 
field" album is picking up sen- 
sational sales across the country, 
following the pattern set by the 
recent successes of the Allan 
Sherman and Vaughn Meader 
LP's. The album features comic 
Frankie Fontaine on his first 
ABC -Paramount LP, "Songs 1 

Sing on the Jackie Gleason 
Show." In one week from Mon- 
day (28) to Friday (1) it has 
sold 117,000 albums, a close to 
record -breaking sales pattern, if 
you throw out the Meader and 
Sherman LP's. 

The sock sales of the album, 
in large part, can be attributed 
to Jackie Gleason and his TV 
show. The LP, issued the week 
of January 7, had -until last 
week - moved slightly more 
than 45,000 copies in its first 
three weeks on the market. Last 
Saturday night (26), Gleason, 
on his TV show, gave a five - 
minute pitch for the Fontaine 
LP, displaying it (upside down 
yet) on camera. 

'Crazy' Bit 
Gleason, as everyone is aware, 

has been featuring Fontaine on 
his TV show, mainly as "Crazy 
Gugenheim," the character that 
the comic has been doing in 
clubs for many years. Fontaine 
usually sings one song at the 

Continued on page 8 

IT TOOK 5 YEARS, BUT 

Firm Wins Court Suit 
Over LP Jacket Copy 

NEW YORK -After chuffing 
its way through legal trackage 
for nearly five years in an unfair 
competition suit against High 
Fidelity Recordings, Inc., Sid 
Frey's Audio Fidelity label was 
highballing down the main line 
last week, having received a 

judgment of $9,915.38 for Hi- 
Fi's "copying' of the jacket of 
A u d i o Fidelity's "Railroad 
Sounds" album. 

Judgment was awarded when 
the United States Supreme 
Court denied a writ sought by 
HiFi's Richard Vaughn, who had 
claimed there were questions of 
law in the case which had never 
been decided by lower courts. 

The case is particularly im- 
portant to the recording industry 
because it bears on the question 
of look -alike record jackets. As 
far as Audio Fidelity is con- 
cerned, the effort was worth 
it even though the judgment 
"cost us more than three times 
what we collected," according 
to Frey. 

HiFi, Audio Fidelity charged 
originally, had put out an on- 
location recording of railroad 
sounds which involved "delib- 
erate copying" of the Audio 
Fidelity jacket and its lettering. 

"Likely to confuse and de- 
ceive the public," reported the 
Circuit Court of Appeals. 

or--- 
8 important musts for you -from DECCA -CORAL or great business in February! 
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London, Carlton, Kapp, MGM -Verve Heads follow 
Distributors, Publishers to Stand in FTC Columbia Case 

Distribs Add Words 
On Transshipping 

NEW YORK - Several dis- 
tributors who frankly admitted 
they were transshippers, and a 
parade of dealer representatives 
who roundly attacked the Co- 
lumbia Record Club, were 
among the witnesses heard last 
week at hearings here on FTC 
charges against the club. The 
Commission has charged the 
club with practices leading to- 
ward monopoly and unfair pric- 
ing of record offerings. 

Among the witnesses last 
week were distributor -rack job- 
ber Leonard Smith of Albany, 
N. Y., who characterized the 
distribution of Caedmon, War- 
ner Bros. and Liberty records 
through the Columbia club as 
"detrimental to our sales." He 
explained that "a record is some- 
thing you buy one of. When 
consumers buy a record through 
the club, they don't buy it from 
a retailer." 

Under cross - examination, 
Smith admitted transshipping 
Warner Bros. and Liberty rec- 
ords, among others. Asked if he 
sees Columbia club ads, he re- 
plied, "Yes, I see too many of 
them." He was also asked which 
Caedmon records were offered 
through the club and whether 
Allan Sherman's "My Son, the 
Folksinger" album had been a 

club offering. To these ques- 
tions he replied that he could 
not specifically recall. 

PIoneer Racker 
In reply to another query, 

Smith said that he believed him- 
self to be "the father of rack 
jobbing." At another point, he 
noted that record stores in the 
New York State capital (Albany) 
district had dwindled from a 
high of about 140 in 1957 to 
about 40 now, tracing this de- 
crease to the fact that "people 
don't buy records in stores any 
MOM." 

Other witnesses heard during 
the week included Irwin Fink, 
All -State Distributors, Newark, 
N. J.; Larry Goldfinger of Abra- 
ham and Strauss stores, New 
York; Paul Kutscher, Chambers 
Record Shop, New York; Ben- 
jamin Press, Downtown Music 
Masters, New York; Sam Stolon, 
Goody's New York; Norman 
Sarkisian, Record and Tape 
Sales Corporation, New York; 
Robert Bialek, Discount Record 
Shops, Washington, and Fred 
Hartstone, Krey's and the Disk 
Shops in Boston and suburbs. 

Kutscher indicated that he 
doesn't sign members to the Co- 
lumbia club because, "I believe 
the club is harmful to our busi- 

(Continued on page 6) 

Publishers 
Say Club OK 
With Them 
NEW YORK - Two leading 

publisher executives appeared 
as witnesses last week for the 
government in hearings being 
held here on a complaint lodged 
against CBS and the Columbia 
Record Club by the Federal 
Trade Commission. Mickey 
Scopp, head of the Big Three, 
affiliated with MGM, Inc., and 
Herman Starr, chief of Music 
Publishers Holding Corporation, 
a subsidiary of Warner Bros. 
Pictures, were heard Thursday 
(31). 

Scopp said he originally made 
a special royalty arrangement 
with the Columbia club of 75 
per cent of the normal statutory 
rate because "we had expecta- 
tions that the club would in- 
crease over -all volume." 

In cross- examination, Scopp 
was asked about the practice of 
record companies of not paying 
royalties on free records dis- 
tributed for promotion and 
bonus purposes. 

"Publishers try to turn away 
from this," Scopp said, "Because 
there is no provision for it." In 
concluding point on the cross 
examination, Scopp stated that 
the over -all volume has in- 
creased and that the ratio of 

Continued on page 8 

Verve Gets Jimmy Smith 
NEW YORK -Verve Records 

picked off one of the high - 
priced top selling jazz acts when 
this week it signed organist Jim- 
my Smith. The star, a long -time 
solid seller in jazz, hit with two 
big singles and albums this past 
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year. He moved to Verve from 
Blue Note Records. 

Smith signed a long -term pact 
with Verve for a figure believed 
to be well over S50,000. Though 
he would not divulge the con- 
tract guarantee, Creed Taylor, 
a. &r. supervisor at Verve, did 
say that Smith and his manager 
Clarence Avant decided on 
Verve though other labels had 
offered more money for the or- 
ganist's services. 

Taylor also revealed that 
Smith's next album for Verve 
will be "Bossa Nova Meets 
Country and Western." The or- 
ganist's first set on the label was 
"Bashin' - the Unpredictable 

Jimmy Smith," which contained 
the hit single "Walk on the Wild 
Side." This album was done on 
a loan while the artist was still 
with Blue Note. Smith's other 
hit of 1962, "Midnight Special," 
in both LP and single form, was 
issued on his former label. 

Jimmy Smith, young pioneer 
of modern jazz on the electric 
organ, first came to the Blue 
Note label in 1956. He was a 
steady seller with the firm for 
years until pop sales on "Mid- 
night Special" sent him into na- 
tional prominence this past sum- 
mer. "Walk on the Wild Side" 
followed closely on the heels of 
the "Midnight" success. 

Manufacturers Hit 
ManyTrade Angles 

By REN GREVATT 

NEW YORK - Testimony 
from more than a score of wit- 
nesses, representing manufac- 
turers, distributors, dealers and 
music publishers, was taken as 
hearings on the Federal Trade 
Commission complaint against 
the Columbia Broadcasting Rec- 
ord Club entered their third 
week. 

Manufacturers testifying rep- 
resented widely varying atti- 
tudes with respect to the club. 
Witnesses included Lee Hart- 
stone of London Records, which 
has never been a Columbia club 
licensor; Joseph Carlton, Carl- 
ton Records, a one -shot licensor 
last year; Dave Kapp, of Kapp 
Records, a current licensor, and 
Arnold Maxin of MGM -Verve, 
a former licensor which has 
since terminated its licensing ar- 
rangement with the club. 

Hartstone appeared Friday 
afternoon (25) for completion of 
cross -examination by Columbia 
counsel, Asa Sokolow. Under 
Sokolow's questioning, Hart- 
stone outlined meetings held 
with Columbia club officials in 
the Oak Room of the Hotel 
Plaza on March 18, 1960 in 
connection with the possible re- 
lease of London opera product 
in the club. He said London's 
suggestion was that a separate 
Opera club be set up for the 
London releases with a guaran- 
teed distribution of 1,000,000 
recordings a year. He said that 
this was viewed as a means for 
London to compete successfully 
with RCA Victor and Angel 
record clubs. 

Other Labels 
Hailstone was queried on 

London's licensing arrangements 
with other labels. He outlined 
London's relationship with such 
firms as Dot, Monument, Pye, 
Durium, Oriole and CGD (of 
Italy). There was also consider- 
able testimony on the prices at 
which such New York discount 
stores as Goody's and Korvette's 
offer London product, with cer- 
tain New York newspaper ads 
being submitted as prices evi- 
dence. 

In connection with earlier 
testimony by Hartstone when he 
said that the Columbia club had 
helped "saturate" the market 
for standard classics, Sokolow 
asked whether the market was 
really saturated at any time - 
in view of the spectacular suc- 
cess of such artists as Van Cli- 
burn and Vladimir Horowitz. 
Sokolow went on to ask whether 
Hartstone felt the classical cata- 
log of such club -affiliated labels 
as Cameo -Parkway, Verve and 
United Artists had damaged 
London's business. 

In concluding testimony Hart- 
stone admitted the need of club 
distribution in view of the avail- 
ability of Mercury and Kapp 
material in the club, and that 
one London answer to the club 
competition was the firm's Rich- 
mond re -issue line of popular 
classics. 

In testimony taken Monday 
(28), Carlton explained the loss 
of Anita Bryant to Columbia by 
stating that he did not choose 
to meet Columbia's offer to the 
singer of a $35,000 annual 
guarantee for three years plus 

payment for recording dates. 
"We could have met that figure, 
but we didn't feel it was worth 
it," he explained. 

Later Deal 
Carlton outlined a later ar- 

rangement to sell 10 Bryant 
tapes to Columbia following 
her signing with that firm, four 
of which were to be released 
through the club on an album. 
When execution of this arrange- 
ment had to be delayed, he 
said, an agreement was made 
for the release of a Valjean 
"Ben Casey" album through the 
club. Asked about his interest 
in the four Bryant tapes, Carlton 
said, "We were the publisher 
of those four sides. That was 
our interest." 

In connection with club re- 
leases of his material, Carlton 
was asked to explain a Carlton 
trade press ad of February 16, 
1959, which declared, "Carlton 
Records are not and will not be 
sold through record clubs." 

He explained that this was an 
attempt to court dealers and win 
their loyalty. "The campaign on 
the retailers was totally unsuc- 
cessful. The stores were indif- 
ferent," he asserted. Carlton was 
also questioned on the relative 
sales of the Valjean LP through 
the club as against retail dealer 
sales. 

An indication of the value of 
club affiliation to an indie man- 
ufacturer was brought out in 
testimony by Kapp Wednesday 
(30). Under examination re- 
garding Kapp offerings, he said 
the Roger Williams album, 
known as "Maria," a club selec- 
tion of the month in February, 
1962, sold 180,000 through the 
club. He said a selection of the 
month in the "listening and 
dancing" category could be ex- 
pected to produce over 100,000 
sales. A so- called "alternate" 
selection of the month could be 
expected to produce anywhere 
from 2,000 to 15,000 sales, he 
noted. 

In a question bearing on the 
exclusivity issue (a key point in. 

the FTC case) Kapp said, "It is 
true I have agreed to stay out 
of the club market through my 
own or anybody else's resources 
other than Columbia." He said 
the entire Kapp catalog is avail- 

(Continued on page 6) 
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THE STORY OF 
THE $1.90 LP 

NEW YORK - The FTC 
hearings brought an answer to 
one question that often has 
plagued industry observers: How 
can a discount house sell an LP 
record for under $27 

The answer, according to one 
witness: transhipping. 

Sam Keenholz, operator of 
Ideal Records in New York and 
a one -stop called Raymar Sales, 
said: "Through Raymar I'll 
transship to anyone anywhere in 
the world. I'd say the 49 states 
are transshipping to the 50- 
and New York is the 50th. 
Transshipped prices average $2 
to $2.47, but if we're slightly 
distressed or loaded, it might 
go to $1.90 or $1.80." 
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Jenkins Gets New 
Victor V. -P. Post 

NEW YORK -Harry Jenkins 
has been named to a newly 
created post at RCA Victor Rec- 
ords as division vice -president of 
marketing. As of this week he 
will take over full responsibility 
for the new marketing activity of 
the record firm. 

Division vice -president and 
operations director Norman Ra- 
cusin, who named Jenkins to his 
new position, said that the mar- 
keting activity was a streamlin- 
ing and strengthening of Victor's 
marketing area. Object of the 
new position is to integrate 
sales, merchandising, advertising 
and tape marketing functions 
into one entity, said Racusin. It 

Finley Quits 
Tops for Dot 

HOLLYWOOD - Dot Rec- 
ords President Randy Wood last 
week appointed Larry Finley to 
the newly created position of di- 
rector of premium sales. Finley 
resigned as president of Preci- 
sion Instruments, Inc. (Tops 
Records) to accept the Dot 
boost. His appointment is effec- 
tive immediately. 

Wood told Billboard that Dot 
will "aggressively pursue pre- 
mium business with tailor -made 
product for clients. Finley is a 
natural choice to head up this 
operation, based on his achieve- 
ments in this highly specialized 
field." 

While at PRI, Finley is cred- 
ited with having concluded 
more than two and a half mil- 
lion dollars in premium sales 
for that firm. 

In his new position, Finley 
will report jointly to Wood and 
to Dot's vice -president in charge 
of sales, Mrs. Christine Hamil- 
ton. 

Big Social Card 

For NARM Meet 
PHILADELPHIA - There'll 

be plenty of social events and 
music industry entertainment at 
the forthcoming NARM conven- 
tion, to be held in San Francisco 
March 3 -7, according to NARM 
executives. 

Cocktail parties sponsored by 
Columbia, Warner Bros. and 
Liberty Records are scheduled, 
starting March 3. A special re- 
cording session featuring the 
Homer & Jethro team has been 
slated for March 4 during an 
RCA Victor -hosted party. 

Also on the agenda are a 
fashion show and city tour for 
the ladies attending the con- 
vention, hosted by Ambassador 
Records and Miller Internation- 
al. Such record personalities as 
the Kingston Trio, Tony Bennett, 
Allan Sherman and Peter Nero 
will be on hand at the awards 
banquet winding up the con- 
vention. 

Bill Mikels Returns 

To Capitol Intl Side 
HOLLYWOOD -Bill Mikels 

returns to Capitol Records after 
a year's absence to serve as the 
firm's International Marketing 
Manager. He reports to Bud 
Fraser, Marketing Director for 
Capitol's International Division. 

Mikels left Capitol a year ago 
to become a partner in Artists 
Management Association, resign- 
ing his post as National Album 
Sales Manager. 

also permits Jack Burgess, divi- 
sion vice -president, commercial 
sales, to concentrate on day to 
day operations with distributors, 
according to Racusin. Burgess 
handles all external operations 
in the marketing activity struc- 
ture, including field sales, rack 
merchandising, and syndicated 
sales, radio -TV relations and 
field promotion, and record dis- 
tributor relations. 

Simultaneously with the Jen- 
kens promotion, Irwin Tarr was 
upped to the position of man- 
ager, planning and merchandis- 
ing, a function formerly super- 
vised by Jenkins. Tarr will over- 
see internal operations at Victor 
encompassing sales and product 
planning, educational sales, pre- 
mium records, and market re- 
search services. 

Bill Alexander continues as 
manager, advertising promotion 
publicity, and Ed Welker re- 
mains manager, tape marketing. 

Jenkins has been with Victor 
since 1941, leaving to serve in 
the Air Force in World War II. 
He became manager of planning 
and merchandising in 1960. 

Solomon in Deal 

For Below Border 
HOLLYWOOD -B e r n i e 

Solomon last week concluded a 

distribution deal for the Everest 
and Challenge labels in Mexico 
and Central America with Dis- 
cos Importadora, S.A., of Mex- 
ico City. Solomon, president of 
Everest and secretary of the 
Challenge firm, agreed to take 
Mexico's Tizoc label for world- 
wide distribution, exclusive of 
Central America. 

Solomn is forming a new la- 
bel, Mexicana, which will be 
used to release the Latin fare 
here, and will serve as a subsid- 
iary firm to Everest. Other 
Everest subsidiaries are the Al- 
cor and Terri -Ann labels. He 
expects to kick off Mexicana 
with a 10 -LP release next 
month. 

Frank Abramson 
Quits Goodman 

NEW YORK -Frank Abram- 
son is ankling the Gene and 
Harry Goodman music publish- 
ing firms to take over as East- 
ern rep for the Lawrence Welk 
music catalogs, Harry Von Til- 
zer Music and Vogue Music. 
Welk purchased the Vogue cata- 
log from E. H. Morris a few 
weeks ago. The Welk office on 
the West Coast will be repped 
by Paul Weirick. Abramson was 
with Sammy Kaye's music firms 
prior to joining the Goodmans. 

Sir Joseph Gets 

VIP Treatment 
HOLLYWOOD - Sir Joseph 

Lockwood, EMI chairman, will 
stop in Hollywood and New 
York next month en route to 
London following an around - 
the -world tour of EMI opera- 
tions. 

He will be squired around on 
both coasts by Capitol President 
Alan Livingston. There will be 
a cocktail party for him here 
Wednesday (6), a reception Fri- 
day (8), and the following week 
he will continue on to New 
York, accompanied by Living- 
ston, who will be joined by his 
wife, actress Nancy Olson, for 
a cocktail party at the Hamp- 
shire House February 14. 
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COL'MBIA AIN'T 
AFRAID OF HER 

NEW YORK -Columbia Rec- 
ords, for years a leader in the 
original -cast album field, has 
acquired the cast rights to the 
hit Broadway straight drama, 
"Who's Afraid of Virginia 
Woolf?" 

Columbia President Goddard 
Lieberson will supervise the re- 
cording of the Edward Albee 
drama. It will be done early in 
February. The cast includes Uta 
Hagen, Arthur Hill, George 
Grizzard and Melinda Dillon. 
Lieberson recently completed 
recording of the off -Broadway 
production, "Brecht on Brecht," 
for early March release. 
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'AIIey'Sheet Sales 

Zoom Into Orbit 
NEW YORK -The Bent Fab- 

ric "Alley Cat" hit has racked 
up a remarkable U. S. sheet 
music sales mark of 200,000. 
Hansen Publishing gave precise 
figures in a letter to Metorian 
Music, the original Danish pub- 
lisher. 

Sheet music sales figures of 
the title are noted in a letter 
to Claes Dahlgren, U. S. agent 
for Metorian. A Hansen spokes- 
man said that total sheet music 
sales of "Alley Cat" hit the 
202,724 mark as of December 
31, some 162,672 in piano solo 
version and 40,052 in the vocal 
version. 

In addition to sheet music 
sales in ,piano and vocal style, 
the tune has been included in a 
Bent Fabric folio. This folio in- 

"Alley Cat" album on Ateo. The 
"Alley Cat" hit was originally 
recorded and released in Europe 
on the Metronome label. "Alley 
Cat" has also been issued in 
arrangements for marching band 
and orchestra. 

Decca Special Meeting 

Points Up February LP's 
CHICAGO -Top Decca exec- 

utives visited Chicago last week 
for a special national division 
manager meeting meant to stim- 
ulate interest and step up pro- 
motion on the new line of prod- 
uct introduced for February. 

Decca believes it has one of 
its strongest product releases in 
some time with this eight -LP 
output because the artists in- 
volved include Brenda Lee, Burl 
Ives, Pete Fountain, Earl Grant, 

Paul Siegel Back 

From Berlin for 
Meeting With Dot 

BERLIN -Paul Siegel, who 
left the United States in 1958 
to make his home in Berlin, will 
make his first trip back when 
the publisher - producer - dee- 
jay flies to Los Angeles on Feb- 
ruary 13 where he will meet 
with Randy Wood of Dot Rec- 
ords on the forthcoming release 
of some Siegel -produced sides. 

Siegel also will seek to pick 
up some new material for re- 
cording in Germany on the Ger- 
man Decca label, for which he 
functions as producer. 

Dot is preparing soon to re- 
lease a single featuring Siegel's 
Oederland Orchestra recording 
of "Atlantis" and the "The Min- 
uteman," the latter a special ar- 
rangement of "Stars and Stripes 
Forever" which drew a letter of 
commendation from President 
Kennedy last month. Since mov- 
ing his family to Berlin, Siegel 
came with "Itsy Bitsy Bikini" 
as German publisher, and on 
the other hand, found a Ger- 
man song, "Tivoli Melodie," 
which became a smash in the 
United States with Lawrence 
Welk's recording under the title 
of "Calcutta." 

TOPS' PARENT FIRM 
IN DEBTORS' PETITION 

HOLLYWOOD - Precision 
Radiation Instruments, parent 
firm of Tops Records, last week 
filed a debtors' petition under 
Chapter 11, listing an excess of 
several million dollars it owes 
creditors. On the heels of this 
action, it offered the court a 
plan whereby Cy Leslie, head of 
the Pickwick international group 
of budget labels, will manage 

BLUEGRASS SERENADE: Earl Scruggs 
and Lester Flan ore caught in a 
scene horn the upcoming (February 
6) CBS TV show, "Beverly Hill- 
billies." Granny (Irone Dunn) ob- 
viously appr the team's per- 
formance. The show marks Flett 
and Scruggs' TV acting debut. The 
Columbia stars are now riding pop 
and country charts with 'The Ballad 
of Jed Clarttpett." 

(Advertisement) 

the Tops operation during an 
interim period during which the 
firm can become financially 
stabilized. Tops wants to con- 
tinue to do business and fulfill 
its production commitments 
during this period. 

As part of the plan, the 
James E. Talcott factoring firm 
agreed to make finances avail- 
able to Tops to see it through 
the reorganization. The Talcolt 
company is PRI's largest se- 
cured creditor, with Tops owing 
the factoring firm more than 
$1,400,000. Largest unsecured 
creditor is Collins, Cauldwell, 
and Dauge, milling firm supply- 
ing Tops with biscuits. 

Leslie's Pickwick international 
group includes Pickwick, De- 
sign, Bravo and Cricket labels, 
among other budget lines. Leslie 
was here to attend a meeting of 
the PRI board and sit in during 
the Tops creditor sessions. His 
attorney, Seymour Stradfeld, told 
Billboard the interim period 
will be for 21 days, in which 
"Leslie has agreed to provide 
sound management to enable 
Tops to keep its obligations to 
its customers and maintain con- 
tinuity of product." 

After that period, a plan 
whereby Tops management will 
be able to satisfy its creditors 
will be presented to the court 
for its approval so that the firm 
can get back on its financial 
feet. 

the late Buddy Holly, Carmen 
Cavallaro, Tiny Little and 
Lenny Dee. 

There are five Decca and 
three Coral LP's in the release. 
The Brenda Lee holds special 
interest for it is the first net she 
has done pointedly for adult 
consumption. Seven evergreen 
standards and three modern 
standard type tunes are in- 
cluded in the set. Among the 
modern type standards are the 
current hit "My Coloring Book" 
and another current revival "Fly 
Me to the Moon." 

Kicking off the new product 
release which will receive in- 
tensive promotion from the la- 
bel were a group of executives 
including Sydney N. Goldberg, 
vice -president of sales; Claude 
Brennan, national sales man- 
ager; Lou Sebok, assistant na- 
tional sales manager; Jack Kier- 
nan, sales promotion, and Lenny 
Salidor, director of promotion 
and publicity. 
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Ray Conniff 
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- RAY CONNIFF 
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MY PRAYER 
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His latest beat! 

The steady beat of all the Conniff albums continues to stir up sales excitement! 
Ray Conniff s wonderful!, 
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Radio Makes an LP Rocket FCC Lays Down Warnings 
On 'Don't' in FM Growth NEW YORK -When an un- 

known album on an unknown 
label sells more than 50,000 sets 
in less than 60 days through 
radio exposure alone, that's 
news. 

The news was made by the 
Mark -Fi label, through a suc - 
cessul radio spot mail -order 
campaign set up by vet record 
man Monte Bruce of the Metlis- 
Lebow Agency in New York. 
The album, which contains 20 
oldie rock and roll hits, retailed 
for $2.98. 

Colpix Winds Up 

2d Distrib Meet 
LAS VEGAS, Nev.- Colpix 

Records wound up its second 
national distributor meeting here 
over the weekend, with the 
label's key executives showcas- 
ing a midwinter sales program 
which offers 20 LP's with each 
100 purchased. 

Displays in keeping with the 
city's gambling activities were 
used to present eight new al- 
bum packages to distributors, 
including waxings by Zoot Sims, 
Sandy Stewart, Paul Petersen, 
James Darren and other Colpix 
artists. The first group of singles 
in Colpix' "Torchlite" series - 
former releases still drawing 
plays from deejays and jukes - 
were also sampled. 

Jerry Baker, Colpix general 
manager, and Ray Lawrence, 
national sales manager, headed 
the label's executive team pres- 
ent. 

IIYUUWUUUU WUUWIIIII111INII11111111111BIII I IBI I111111ItlIIl11IBIIW 

SON PUTS ON 
BLACK 
CAPITAL BASH 

WASHINGTON - Record 
talent continues to be king in 
the entertainment of capital 
VIP's here. Allan Sherman, 
whose Sarah Jackman and Jerry 
Backman folk tunes are perched 
on top of the LP hit lists, was 
imported from his native New 
Yorkian hills to entertain no- 
tables at the National Press Club 
here last Saturday evening. 

The occasion was the inaugu- 
ration of NBC newscaster, Bry- 
son B. Rash, as president of the 
National Press Club, at which 
time Supreme Court Chief Jus- 
tice Earl Warren was to admin- 
ister the oath of office. 

Among the notables on nand 
were Vice -President Lyndon 
Johnson, White House Press 
Secretary Pierre E. Salinger and 
Senate Minority Leader Everett 
Dirksen. 

WIIWUWUUUIUUIUNUUIUIIUIIIIIWIIWIIIIIIIIWIIUIIIIIIIUIIWUUW 

Bruce set up the radio spot 
campaign in 20 U. S. cities, in- 
cluding such key markets as 
New York, San Francisco, Los 
Angeles, Detroit, Chicago, Pitts- 
burgh, Philadelphia, Washing- 
ton, Baltimore, Boston, Dallas - 
Fort Worth and Houston. Key 
jocks were used on key stations 
of many types, including Top 
40, rock and roll, and r. &b. 

More and more firms have 
been using radio spots to sell 
albums. Original Sound, pioneer 
label in the oldies but goodies 
groove, also pioneered in using 

radio for old rock and roll wax, 
and has been eminently success- 
ful with it. Recently, many other 
labels have gone on big radio 
campaigns with striking results. 

Bruce's campaign for Mark - 
Fi, however, is slightly different 
in that the records were sold by 
mail order after the orders came 
in as a result of radio spots. 

Bruce told Billboard that ra- 
dio and TV exposure was still a 
virgin market for LP sales, and 
that he was planning new cam- 
paigns for other labels using 
radio exclusively. 

Distribs Add Words on Transshipping 
Continued from page 3 

ness. I've had customers tell me 
they get war horse items through 
the club." 

Competitors 
Among prime competitors 

listed by Goody's Stolon, were 
Korvette's, the Columbia, RCA 
Victor and Capitol record clubs 
and other dealers. He described 
the club as a competitor be- 
cause it is a retailer and adver- 
tises extensively. "We cannot 
compete successfully with the 
club," he said, "Because we 
can't meet their prices." Also, 
Stolon noted, "Our ability to 
compete is impaired as the Co- 
lumbia club gets more and more 
outside labels." 

Sarkisian, after outlining his 
average prices for LP's and the 
price at which he purchases 
them, admitted under cross - 
examination that his business 
had grown from $800,000 in 
1961 to $1,200,000 in 1962. 
Identifying Korvette as a chief 
competitor, he said, `They've 
sold records at less than I pay 
for them." 

Bialek, formerly the operator 
of Washington Records, outlined 
the arrangements made by him 
for that label for the release of 
the six -LP documentary pack- 
age "FDR Speaks" through the 
Columbia club. The six -disk 
package regularly sold for 
$2.78 per record, he said, but 
that finished records were sold 
to Columbia for club distribu- 
tion at "about $6.50 for a set 
of six." He described the club 
distribution as a failure. 

Takes Issue 
Bialek, under questioning, 

also took issue with certain disk 
packagings which are available 
only through the club. He de- 
scribed one Ella Fitzgerald LP 
on Verve as " ... only for the 
club. We never got a shot at it. 
The record had a special club 
number and we could never lo- 
cate it in catalogs." He also 
pointed to recordings by Or- 
mandy, Casadesus and Serkin as 

never having been available to 
dealers. 

Bialek said he was certain 
that club offers were hurting 
his business because "We're 
asked to redeem the bonus cou- 
pons. It's a nuisance but we do 
it for good will." 

Cross- examined by Sokolow 
on his memory of specific club 
offerings, Bialek noted: "Well, 
sir, after a while you learn to 
live with the club. You don't 
read the ads any more, just like 
some dealers don't read the 
Korvette ads any more on Sun- 
day. They just don't want to 
spoil their day off." Earlier, 
Sokolow had drawn a laugh in 
the hearing room by asking 
Bialek, "Have you heard the 
good news that Korvette is cor- 
ing to Washington soon ?" 

Outlining his own memory of 
the reasons for the club, Bialek 
recalled that "Columbia people 
told me when the club was 
starting that they had to have 
a club because they were on 
the point of losing artists to the 
Music - Appreciation Record 
Club. I have to give them a lot 
of credit. They certainly have 
the best club." 

There was a final reference 
in the questioning to extensive 
Columbia club spot ads on 
WTOP, Washington CBS net- 
work outlet. 

Final dealer witness was Fred 
Hartstone, who said that war 
horse classical sales used to en- 
able dealers to carry complete 
catalog stocks of records, but, 
he claimed, "Columbia's club 
has caused an almost complete 
cessation of retail war horse 
sales. He said the current intro- 
ductory club offer of six records 
for $1.89 makes "any price the 
dealer asks completely indefen- 
sible in the customer's eyes." 
Hartstone also alluded to a 
heavy spot radio campaign for 
the Columbia club on the CBS 
Boston affiliate, WEEI. 
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WASHINGTON - If broad- 
casters can come up with a bet- 
ter answer to the orderly growth 
of the FM service than the 
FCC's proposed allocations ta- 
ble, the agency's mind is wide 
open to suggestions. But it will 
have to be remembered that the 
Commission does not intend to 
let the FM service develop into 
an AM -type jungle with poor 
nighttime coverage, leave small- 
er sized communities without 
primary FM service while the 
scramble goes on for big city 
locations, and permit common 
programming for AM and FM 
outlets indefinitely. 

These warnings, together with 
a strong declaration of faith in 
the future of the FM service, 
were given by the comparatively 
new Federal Communications 
Commissioner E. William Henry 
recently, before the Georgia 
Radio and TV Institute in 
Athens, Ga. 

Commissioner Henry also 
went over the good and bad 
aspects of specialized program- 
ming on FM. The need for spe- 
cialized programming in multi - 
station metropolitan areas is 
obvious, and the FCC has wel- 
comed it as an encouragement 
to the FM broadcasters. How- 
ever, specialization is not the 
sole answer to the problem of 

multi- station markets, "nor the 
sole guideline for their future de- 
velopment," Henry warns. 

Specializing can be overdone, 
the Commissioner said. "If all 
stations in a given market were 
to program for the same seg 
ment of the community, other 
segments would remain unserved 
and the required over -all balance 
would not be achieved. The 
FCC and broadcasters will thus 
have to co-operate to see that 
specialized programming, i f 
sought by licensees, develops 
within the existing framework 
of a balanced program format 
when the market is viewed as a 
whole." 

The Commission looks for the 
day when the FM service may 
be so guided in its development 
that it may in some cases re- 
place rather than be an adjunct 
to AM service, especially in the 
smaller community. FM offers 
the advantage of stereo broad- 
casting and better nighttime 
service than AM. 

Applications for 150 FM li- 
censes are now on file at the 
Commission, even though much 
red ink has crossed FM ledgers, 
with only one in four FM in- 
dependent stations making a 
profit, in 1961, when the group 
as a whole lost $2.6 million, 
said Henry. 

Mfrs. Hit Many Trade Angles 
Continued from page 3 

able for club use and that fre- 
quent contact is maintained 
with club officials regarding 
Kapp product particularly 
suited to club release. 

He stated further that Kapp 
has an agreement with its artists 
for a royalty of one -half the nor- 
mal rate for all sales achieved 
through the club. Kapp also ex- 
plained that prior to club af- 
filiation, a number of artists had 
raised the question of club dis- 
tribution of their records. Fur- 
ther, he stated, "The presence 
of Mercury and Verve in the 
club influenced our own deci- 
sion." 

Ad vs. Interview 
Kapp was also asked to rec- 

oncile a Kapp ad in Billboard 
July 18, 1960, regarding the la- 
bel's not being in a record club 
as "profit insurance to dealers," 
and an interview appearing in 
the same publication later that 
year, discussing his entry in the 
club. A meeting with Columbia 

Kill Excise Tax 
Continued from page I 

will be formed to study this 
further. 

It was also pointed out that 
music publishers lacked informa- 
tion as to the sales necessities 
of the record industry and the 
techniques that labels must em- 
ploy in moving product. 

Many music publishers, it was 
said, are not aware of the fact 
that freebies must be handed 
out to specific prime outlets to 
get product into these desired 
locations. 

A special report on compul- 
sory licensing has been com- 
pleted by RIAA, upon which 
will be based RIAA's recom- 
mendations to Congress for 
changes in the copyright laws 
to make them more favorable to 
record manufacturers. 

NEW YORK - Danny Davis 
has been named new national 
sales and promotion manager for 
Dimension Records, the Aldon 
Music label. Davis was formerly 
in charge of promotion at Big 
Top. 

had taken place before place- 
ment of the ad, he said, 
but no conclusions had been 
reached. 

Cross examination was limted 
to a single question from Soko- 
low, in connection with a suit 
lodged by Kapp against the 
General Electric Company and 
CBS in reference to the use on 
the network by the sponsor of 
a Kapp -identified slogan, "Mu- 
sic of the Fabulous Fifties." The 
question elicited the response 
that the suit was undertaken 
during Kapp's affiliation with 
the record club. 

Testifying Thursday (31) 
Maxin said that MGM inherited 
the Verve club arrangement 
when it acquired the label on 
November 11, 1960. At the 
time, he said, the Verve- Colum- 
bia contract was regarded as an 
asset. Later, however, the agree- 
ment was terminated, in Febru- 
ary 1962. The effective cut -off 
date was June 30, 1962, with 
the cessation of all final Verve 
offerings in ads set for last 
December 31. 

At one time, there were dis- 
cussions on a proposed agree- 
ment for expansion of Verve - 
MGM participation in the club. 
Maxin said this was never con- 
summated because: (1) The firm 
wished to press records for the 
club in its own Bloomfield, N. J. 
plant, (2) a greater voice on 
product for club release was de- 
sired, and (3) more information 
was wanted on the free and 
bonus record provisions. 

These reasons for the break - 
off in negotiations were given 
over sustained objections by 
Columbia counsel and under a 
ruling by hearing examiner 
Moore that they would be a 
part of the record only if the 
case should reach the full Corn- 
mission level. 

Maxin was also questioned 
about the disposition of records 
remaining in Columbia's hands 
after termination of the club 
agreement. He said Columbia 
had offered to turn them over 
to the label for the effective net 
manufacturing cost of 30 cents 
per record. Verve has not yet 
made a counter offer. 
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CHECK 

CHESS 
FIRST! 

a 

THE ORIGINAL VERSION 

"MAMA 

DIDN'T LIE" 
by 

JAN BRADLEY 

Chess #1845 

"EVERY DAY I 

HAVE TO CRY" 
by 

STEVE ALAIMO 

Checker #1032 

"WOULD IT 

MAKE ANY 

DIFFERENCE 

TO YOU" 
by 

ETTA JAMES 

Argo #5430 
\. \\\ 
IT 

OVER" 
by 

JIMMY DONLEY 

Chess #1843 

"LONELY 

BABY" 
by 

TY HUNTER 

C-18 

\ a \ \ \ o o \ \ \ \ \ \ o \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \\\ \ \\ \\\ \ \\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \\ \\ \\\\ \ \\\ \ \ \ 

"MATHILDA" 
by 

ROOSEVELT NETTLES 

Chess #1846 

CHESS 
PRODUCING CORP. 

7120 S. Michigan Chicago 16, III. 

THE NATION'S TOP TUNES 

}LOROR ROLL of H1T5 
FOR WEEK ENDING FEBRUARY 9 

The Honor Roll of Hits comprises the nation's top tunes according 
to record sales and disk jockey performances as determined by 
Billboard's weekly nationwide surveys. 

This Last 
Week Week Tune Composer -Publisher 

Weeks 
OD 

Chart 

0 2 HEY PAULA 4 
By Hildebrand -Published by LeBill- Marbill (BMI) 

® 1 WALK RIGHT IN 
By Darling- Svanoe- Published by Ryerson (BMI) 

4 

O3 THE NIGHT HAS A THOUSAND EYES 
3 By Weisman- Wayne.Garrett- Published by Blen -Mobs (ASCAP) 

® 6 LOOP DE LOOP 
By Vann -Dong- Publisbed by Tobi -Ann & Vann (BMI) 

5 

Q 7 UP ON THE ROOF 
By Goffin- King -Published by Alden (BMI) 

® 16 WALK LIKE A MAN 2 
By Crewe. Gaudio -Published by Saturday-Gavadema (ASCAP) 

14 RUBY BABY 
By Lieber -Stotler- Published by Tiger (BMI) 

2 

® 11 YOU'VE REALLY GOT A HOLD ON ME 4 
By Robinson -Published by Jobete (BMI) 

® 5 MY COLORING BOOK 
By Ebb- Kander- Published by Sunbeam (BMI) 

4 

10 
19 RHYTHM OF THE RAIN 2 

By Gummoe- PublIshed by Sherman- DeVorzon (BMI) 

11 4 GO AWAY LITTLE GIRL 10 
By Goffin- King -Published by Aldon (BMI) 

12 
18 FROM A JACK TO A 

By 
KING 

Miller-Published by Dandelion (BMI) 
3 

13 15 HALF HEAVEN -HALF HEARTACHE 
By Schroeder- Gold- Goehring- Published by Arch (ASCAP) 

5 

14 
8 IT'S UP TO YOU 

By Jerry Fuller- Published by Four Star (BMI) 
7 

15 
9 TELL HIM 

By Ben Russell- Published by Mellln (BMI) 
8 

1G 
12 TWO LOVERS 

By W. Robinson -Published by Jobete (BMI) 
8 

17 
26 FLY ME TO THE BMOON--$OSSSA INOVAby 

Almanac (ASCAP) 
2 

18 29- HE'S SURE THE BOY I LOVE 
By Mann -Weil -Published by Alden (BMI) 

2 

19 
- MAMA DIDN'T LIE 

20 10 MY DAD 

By Mayfield -Published by Cunom (BMI) 
1 

By Mann-WO-Published by Alden (BMI) 
8 

2) 30 YOU'RE THE REASON I'M LIVING 2 
By Darin -Published by Adaris (BMI) 

22 
17 I SAW LINDA YESTERDAY 

By Lee-Reynolds- Published by Jack (BMI) 
6 

g WILD WEEKEND 
23. By Shannon.Todaro- Published by Shan -Todd & Tupper (BMI) 

14 
28 LITTLE TOWN FLIRT 

By Shannon -McKenzie -Published by Vicki -McLaughlin (BMI) 

25 
25 CINNAMON CINDER 

By Regan -Published by Algrace (SMI) 

2G 
21 DON'T MAKE ME OVER 

By David -Bacharsch- Published by Bacharach -Jac (ASCAP) 

21 - SEND ME SOME LOVIN' 
By Price- Marascalco- Published by Venice (BMI) 

2 - PROUD 
By Mann -Weil -Published by Alden (BMI) 

29 - CALL ON ME 
By Malone -Published by Lion (BMI) - LOVE (Makes the World Go 'Round) 
By Anita- Published by Spanks (BMI) 

1 

4 

3 

5 

RECORDINGS AVAILABLE 

Masi Selling Record Listed In hid Face) 

I. HEY PAULA -Paul & Paula 
Philips 35017. 

2. WALK RIGHT IN- Moments, 
Era 3099; Rooftop Singers, Van- 
guard 35017. 

3. THE NIGHT HAS A THOU- 
SAND EYES -Bobby Vet, LIb- 
erty 55521. 

4. LOOP DE LOOP--Johnny Thao- 
0m, Diamond 129. 

5. UP ON THE ROOF - Drifters, 
Atlantic 2162. 

6. WALK LIKE A MAN - Four 
Seasons. Vet Jas 485. 

7. RUBY BABY -Dbo, Columbia 
42662; Drifters, Atlantic 1089. 

8. YOU'VE REALLY GOT A 
HOLD ON ME - Miracles, 
Tamale 54073. 

9. MY COLORING BOOK -George 
Chakiris. Capitol 4892; Kitty 
Kalle.. RCA Victor 81241 Sandy 
Stewart, Col,. 669: Barbara 
Streisand. Columbia 42648. 

IS. RHYTHM OF THE RAIN - 
Caswdes, Valiant 6026. 

11. GO AWAY LITTLE GIRL - 
Steve Lawrence, Columbia 42601. 

12. FROM A JACK TO A KING - 
Ned Maler, Faber 114. 

13. HALF HEAVEN - HALF 
HEARTACHE - Gene Pitney, 
Moslem 1026. 

14. ITS UP TO YOU -Rick Nel- 
son, Imperial 5901. 

15. TELL HIM - Eucken, United 
Artists 244; Ed Townsend, Lib- 
coy 55516. 

16. TWO LOVERS - Mary Welly 
Motown 1035. 

17. FLY ME TO THE MOON - 
BOSSA NOVA - Eydie Germe, 
ABC -Paramount 10383; Joe Har- 
Bes & His Ork, Kapp 497; Tony 
Manin, Dot 16361; Mark Mur- 
phy, Riverside 4526; Susan Rafey, 
Kapp 382; Felicia Sanders, Decca 
31335; Rhoda Scott Trio, Tru 
Sound 418; April Stevens. Im- 
perial 5907. 

18. HE'S SURE THE BOY I LOVE 
-Crystals, Mille' 109. 

19. MAMA DIDN'T LIE -Jae Brad- 
ley, Choca 1845; Fascinations, 
ABC -Paramount 10387. 

20. MY DAD -Paul Petersen, Cob 
pl. 663. 

21. YOU'RE THE REASON PM 
LIVING-Bobby Darin, Capitol 
4897. 

22. I SAW LINDA YESTERDAY - 
Dickey Lee. Smash 1719. 

23. WILD WEEKEND - Rebels, 
Swan 4125. 

24. LITTLE TOWN FLIRT - 
Shaanon, Big Top 3131. 

25. CINNAMON CINDER- Claders, 
Warner Bros. 5326; Pastel Sic, 
Zen 102. 

26. DON'T MAKE ME OVER - 
Dlonne Warwick. Scepter 1239. 

27. SEND ME SOME LOVIN'- 
Sam Cooke, RCA Victor 8129. 

28. PROUD -Johnny Crawford, Del - 
FI 4193; Vic Dana, Dolton 51. 

29. CALL ON ME -Bobby Bland, 
Duke 360. 

30. LOVE (Makes the World Go 
'Rooadi -Paul Auks, RCA Vic- 
tor 8115. 

WARNING -The title 'HONOR ROLL. OF HITS' is a registered trade -mark and the listing of 
the hits has been copyrighted by Billboard. Use of either may not be made without 
Billboard's consent. Requests for such consent should be submitted in writing to the publishers 
of Billboard at 1564 Broadway, New York 36, N. Y. 

Fontaine LP Sizzles 
Continued from page 1 

end of his "Crazy" routine each 
week. 

Gleason's pitch for the Fon- 
taine LP created a wild five 
days at ABC- Paramount last 
week. According to Larry New- 
ton, sales manager of the label, 
never one for understatements, 
"It's unbelievable." 

On Monday (28) the orders 
started to pour in. As of 
Wednesday, orders had hit 50; 
000 for the first three days. 
On Thursday alone there were 
orders for about 45,000 sets. 
Friday morning new orders to- 
taled 21,300. 

Newton told Billboard that 
distributors were starting to send 
their own trucks to the plant to 
pick up Fontaine LP's by 
Wednesday. He said that the 
J. C. Penney chain had ordered 
a large quantity for all of its 
stores, and that Woolworth's had 
ordered sets for every one of its 
5,000 outlets. 

Newton also said that the rec- 
ord was selling not only in big 
city markets, but in smaller 
markets as well. "It is breaking 
in every part of the country,' 
said Newton, "East, West, 
North and South." He told Bill- 
board that ABC -Paramount was 
already getting the record 
pressed outside. 

So far the Fontaine LP is fol- 
lowing in the pattern of the 
Meader and Sherman LP's, al- 
though neither of them had the 
advantage of such sustained TV 
exposure. The trade is jumping 
on it as it did the Sherman and 
Meader LP's, and there are 
many trade estimates that the 
Fontaine set is sure to crack 
500,000 and has a chance to 
go to the million mark. Reports 
are that it is selling faster at 
the moment than the Ray 
Charles country album at ABC - 
Paramount last year, which 
went over the 600,000 mark. 

Gleason has long been an ad- 
vocate of pushing record wax 
on his show. His own albums on 
Capitol have long been strong 
sellers, and many singles and 
LP's were kicked off on his TV 
show during the early 1950's. 
Elvis Presley rose to national 
fame during his appearance on 
the Gleason summer show with 
the Tommy and Jimmy Dorsey 
orks. 

If the Fontaine LP continues 
its meteoric sales pace, it will 
mark the third singles -type hit 
LP in the past four months. 

Publishers Okay 
Continued from page 3 

dealer sales to over -all sales has 
been "sustained and steady." 

Starr outlined the standard 
mechanical royalty formula, not- 
ing that in general the 2-cent 
rate is in effect. In special cases, 
such as the recording of an en- 
tire show score with more than 
12 songs, the 24 -cent rate for 
the entire LP would still hold, 
he noted. 

A club sale rate of 75 per 
cent of the standard rate is now 
observed, he said. Thus for an 
LP of 12 tunes, the rate is 11 
cents per tune or 18 cents per 
LP. At the start of the club, 
Starr said he granted a royalty - 
free license for a full year. 

"My reason for the lower rates 
with clubs," he said, "was the 
same as the reason we cut the 
rate at the inception of the LP. 
I thought it would be a stimu- 
lant to more business." 

Starr said he was a believer 
in clubs and that a special ar- 
rangement on royalties has just 
been granted a mail -order disk 
selling campaign launched by 
RCA Victor and Life magazine. 
"I feel that record clubs have 
been a great help to the busi- 
ness," Starr concluded. 

Copyrighted material 
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Meet one 
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territory. 
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Agencies Dig Those 
Diamonds in Rough 

By JACK MAHER 
NEW YORK -While major and independent record companies 

bid madly for teen -age talent, a number of agencies in the music 
business have quietly been conducting talent hunts of their own. 

ASCAP, the Bon Soir night 
club and the GLG Productions 
(the Eydie Gorme -Steve Law- 
rence -Ken Greengrass firm) 
have all conducted talent tryouts 
over the last three months. All 
but GLG have turned up talent 
they believe well worth watching. 
GLG, seeking fresh song mate- 
rial for forthcoming Gorme and 
Lawrence albums, was deluged 
with material from nonprofes- 
sionals. According to Ken Green - 
grass, spokesman for the firm, 
none of it was acceptable. 

Bon Soir has been holding 
weekly tryouts for new talent in 
the club on Tuesday afternoons. 
Like GLG, management of the 
club has been deluged with non - 
pro pleas. Diamonds in the 
rough are so rare, however, the 
club has re- established strict 
rules which dictate representa- 
tion by agents and managers. 

The comedy team of Brill and 
McCall was one of the first acts 
to be discovered at the audi- 
tions. They opened at the club 
January 19. Other artists singled 
out by club owners were singer 
Mimi Dayane and comic Larry 
Wilde. These few acts have been 
chosen out of more than 200 
who sought auditions. 

The ASCAP Showcase, which 
concluded in November, opened 
the door, at least a bit, for a 
number of musical show writers. 
The Showcase was held at the 
conclusion of an eight -week sem- 
inar which saw outstanding 
members of the profession advise 
young writers on the techniques 
of their art. The Showcase itself 

presented more than 30 of these 
embryonic composers with cap- 
sule versions and highlights of 
their musical endeavors. 

Some of the talented people 
heard and brought to the atten- 
tion of agents and publishers 
Clark Gesner, who has had dis- 
cussions with a number of pro- 
ducers and an audition with 
Chappell Music. Others to have 
an audition with Chappell are 
the team of Clay Boland Jr. 
(talented son of cleffer Clay Bo- 
land), Pearl Mood and Betty 
Solomon and Bernie Spiro, Al 
Frisch and Irwin Andrews. 

Bernice Cohen and Jay Remer 
have been auditioned by Sha- 
piro- Bernstein, Phoebe Ray of 
the writing team of Ray and Ar- 
thur Blake credits their forth- 
coming appearance in the show 
"Compact '63" directly to the 
ASCAP Showcase. "Compact 
'63" breaks in at the Open End 
in Manhattan January 31. An- 
other author who sold a song as 
a result of the Showcase is Har- 
riette Ballin. 

Larry Alexander and Gary 
Popkin are currently working on 
a show with an Idlewild Theater 
group in Queens. It's called 
"The Co- Operative Way" and 
stands a chance of an off- Broad- 
way production. Bob Randall 
and Bob Denis have been ap- 
proached by agents and pro- 
ducers as has David Denoon. 
The team of Ben Finn, Dan 
Rustin and Aver Corman has 
sold a tune, "All We Do Is 
Sing," to Joy Music. 

TALENT TOPICS 
NEW YORK 

Another S. Hurok concert- 
the fourth -postponed because 
of the newspaper strike: Italian 
lyric tenor Cesare Valletti, origi- 
nally set for Town Hall last 
week, now due April 16. . . . 

Most other concerts going on as 
scheduled, though audiences held 
down substantially because of 
publicity draught. 

A dream nurtured for 12 
years by singer Jerry Vale comes 
true: a date at the Copa this 
summer. . . With her current 
"Rusty in Orbit" away out near 
the 400,000 mark, Rusty War- 
ren's albums in two years have 
sold almost 3 million, all told - 
or, as she might say, "All told? 
No a couple of guys kept their 
mouths shut." ... Drums rolling 
for Carlton Record's Gayle Har- 
ris ( "Honest, fellows, she's really 

only 16) and her "Here Come 
the Hurt." . Lena Horne 
again melting them at the Wal- 
dorf. 

The Highwaymen's current 
tour, which takes them to 25 
West Coast colleges, is introduc- 
ing their big single, "March on, 
Brothers!" . Little Eva's sis- 
ter, Walla Boyd, has her first re- 
lease on Dimension, "Hula Hop - 
pin'." . Woody Woodbury, 
the "Who Do You Trust" emsee 
on television, signed by William 
Morris.... After current Jersey 
Latin Casino return for Steve 
and Eydie ( "we came back one 
baby and 26 months later," 
Eydie said), couple goes to Dip- 
lomat, Miami Beach, February 
27.... Ken Colman into Miami 
Playboy Club and George Kir- 
by into the local one.... Vienna 

(Continued on page 12) 

TALENT ON TOUR 
EAST' 
Ella Fitzgerald headlines con- 
cert in Philadelphia on February 
3 at the Academy of Music... . 

Oscar at The Embers, New York, 
for two-weeker starting February 
4. . Count Basic for one - 
niter at House of Cards in W. 
Haven, Conn., on February 4. 

SOUTH 
The Lettermen make a con- 

cert appearance on February 9 
at the Vermont Military tasti- 

tute, Lexington, Va. . . . Bar- 
bara Lynn starts a one -week 
engagement on February 8 at 
the Royal Theatre in Baltimore. ... Count Basic on a series of 
one -niters hits Fairfax, Va. 
(Fairfax High School); Hamp- 
ton, Va. (Hampton Arena); 
Blacksburg, Va. (Virginia Poly. 
Inst.). and Baltimore, Md. (Fifth 
Regiment Armory) on February 
6, 7, 8. 9.. . . Damita Jo will 
he in Hollywood. Fla.. February 
7 -13. . . . Jackie Mason tops 

DINAH 

Hearing Soon 
On Dinah's 
'Insult' Rap 

PITTSBURGH -The Ameri- 
can Guild of Variety Artists 
(AGVA) will hold a hearing in 
Pittsburgh into charges of John 
Bertera, owner of the Holiday 
House night club in nearby Mon- 
roeville that singer Dinah Wash- 
ington insulted his guests by 
making anti - Semitic remarks 
during a performance last 
November. 

The hearing arrangements 
were made by Nat Nazarro, 
AGVA representative, after Ber- 
tera agreed to pay the remain- 
ing $1,671 of the $7,500 salary 
Miss Washington received at 
Holiday House. Bertera has been 
withholding the money because 
of Dinah's alleged actions when 
she played Holiday House. 

Attorney Hubert I. Teitel- 
baum, counsel for the night 
club, said a certified check for 
the amount - less $409 for a 
check that Bertera cashed for 
her and that Bertera claims 
bounced - would be sent to 
AGVA to clear the contract with 
the union. 

Nazarro had been negotiating 
with Bertera for two months for 
the balance of payment on Miss 
Washington's contract before 
proceeding with Bertera's griev- 
ance. Fearing AGVA might put 
Holiday House on its unfair list 
which would deny it top acts, 
Bertera had obtained a tempo- 
rary restraining order against the 
union in Federal Court recently. 

At last week's hearing Fed- 
eral Judge Joseph P. Willson 
upheld the argument of attorney 
Ben P. Jubelirer that the court 
had no jurisdiction since the 
AGVA was an unincorporated 
organization with a diversity of 
members, many of whom reside 
in Pennsylvania. 

In his petition for the restrain- 
ing order Bertera had charged 
Miss Washington "behaved in an 
unprofessional manner and con- 
tinuously harassed patrons." She 
is accused of making insulting 
anti -Semitic remarks to the 
guests. Bertera said he refunded 
$1,300 to dissatisfied customers 
because of the incident. 

Attorney Jubelirer said the 
hearing will be conducted to de- 
termine "if there is substance to 
the complaint" and if the singer 
merits disciplinary action. 

the bill at the Hotel Diplomat, 
same city, February 7 -12. 

MIDWEST 
Smothers Brothers make a stop 
at Michigan Tech. College in 
Houghton, Mich., on February 
8. 

WEST 
Smothers Brothers on another 
concert stop at the University of 
Kansas in Lawrence, Kan., on 
February 9. 

TV GUEST APPEARANCES 
BY RECORD TALENT 

The national network TV guest appearances listed below provide outstanding promotional op- 
portunities for alert, aggressive record dealers and for all others who can benefit from the 
exposure of these record artists to millions of consumers. This chart should be used es a 
calendar around which to plan window, counter and other displays by which the TV appear. 
ances can be merchandised to the record -buying public. 

FEBRUARY 4-10 
(All Times Eaetern Standard) 

MONDAY 4 -PAT BOONE, JOHN BROWNING, JOAN SUTHERLAND 
All entertain en the "Bell Telephone Hour" (NBC -TV, 9:3040:30 p.m.). 
Pat Boone's latnt Dot single is "Days of Wine and Roses" b.w. "Medita- 
tion"; Concert pianist John Browning has numerous recordings oa the 
Capitol label and Met opera star Joan Sutherland will tiny selections 
from latest opera recording for London "La Sennabula" by Ralliai. 

TUESDAY 5 -KEELY SMITH 
Miss Smith l,(tt the Garry Mente show (CBS -TV, 10.11 p.m.). Her current 
Dot LP (s titled "Cherokeeh Swings." 

WEDNESDAY 6 -ANITA BRYANT 
The 
9 -lo 

CpotbH 
er new 

d ing 
luamrbt a 

Nest: 
"A nita BryPeary 

Como show 
H 

(s" C -V, 

THURSDAY 7- KINGSTON TRIO 
The boys are guests on the Westinghouse late night tape -syndicated Steve 
Allen show (now seen in 30 cities). The trio's latest recorded efforts 
for Capitol are: "My Frontier"- album -and single, "Greenback Dells," 
b.w. "New Frontier." 

FRIDAY B -VI VELASCO 
The Cotpix songstress again guests on the Tonight show (NBC -TV, 11:15 p.m, 
1 a.m.). Ho current COO: album is "Cantando Bona Nova." 

FRIDAY B- SMOTHERS BROTHERS, JACKIE MASON 
The boys perform on the lack Par show (NBC -TV, 10.11 p.m.). Their 
Mercury album Is titled "Smothers Brothers at the Purple Onion." Comedian 
Mason's new Verve LP Is "I Want to Leave You With Words of a Great 
Comedian." 

SUNDAY 10- NICOLAI GEDDA, ROBERTA PETERS 
Both Metropolitan opera stars perform on the "Voice of Fimtut.,' (ABC-TV, 
10.10:30 p.m.). Mr. Gedda has many recordings available on Angel, and 
Miss Peters' recorded efforts un be beard on RCA Victor. 

ONE MAN'S FAMILY, Chap. 23, Book 7 

Meader Gives In, Does the Date 
SAN FRANCISCO -Vaughn 

Meader has yielded to demands 
of the hungry i that he fulfill 
his four -week contract at the 
San Francisco night spot -but 
with modifications. He did not 
open on Monday night (28) as 
originally signed, but he did 
nine days later (6) and will work 
three and a half weeks instead 
of four. 

His salary will remain at $750 
a week, as agreed upon. 

Enricco Banducci, club own- 
er, also holds a second four- 

week option at $1,250. Meader 
will return for that stint after 
working elsewhere. 

Meanwhile, the club signed 
Garry Merrill as a fill -in for 
Meader with French diseuse 
Ondine and the Wayfarers per- 
forming peacefully under sec- 
ond billing for the entire period. 

In New York, plans were still 
up in the air for Meader's sec- 
ond LP for Cadence, the firm 
that launched him to national 
prominence with "The First 
Family." 

Four Saints Embark on 

Extended College Swing 
DAYTON, Ohio -The Four 

Saints, Warner Bros. artists, con- 
cluded a fortnight's stand at 
Suttmiller's here, downtown 
nitery, January 26. and Tuesday 
(29) played the University of 
Oklahoma, Stillwater, in the first 
of a string of more than 30 col- 
lege dates all in the Midwest, 
arranged by their personal man- 
ager, Walter A. Bouillet. 

Bouillet left here Tuesday 
(29) for New York, after set- 
ting up a route of concert dates 
in this area to begin April 25. 
Already set are Dayton, Colum- 
bus, Cincinnati, Ohio, and Indi- 
anapolis. During their engage- 
ment at Suttmiller's the Four 
Saints made their 27th guest 
appearance on the Ruth Lyons 
"50 -50 Club." which is simul- 
cast on the Crosley Broadcast- 
ing four -station network via 
WLW -T, Cincinnati. 

ARTISTS' BIOGRAPHIES 
For your programming use here are pertinent facts about hot disk crusts. If clipped and 
pasted on 3 by 5 cords these biographies will help you build a convenient file of such data. 

JOE HARNELL 
(Kapp) 

HOME TOWN: New 
York. EDUCATION: Uni- 
versity of Miami and the 
Trinity College of Music in 
London. BACKGROUND: 
Joe Harnell began playing 
the piano at age six. At 14 
he formed his own band. 
After completing studies at 
the Trinity College of Music, 
Harnett studied with Aaron 
Copland for four years and 
then continued under such 
well - known composers as 
Darius Milhaud, Ernst Toch and Leonard Bernstein. A man 
with diverse talents, Harnell has arranged, played and con- 
ducted popular, Latin and classical albums and has served as 
musical director for such stars as Jane Morgan, Peggy Lee and 
Robert Goulet. He is currently musical director for the day- 
time network TV show "Play Your Hunch." This hot chart 
single is his first hit record. 

LATEST SINGLE: "Fly Me to the Moon -Bossa Nova" 
is scoring well on the Hot 100. 

LATEST ALBUM: Just out this week titled, of course, "Fly 
Mc to the Moon -Bossa Nova." 
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Their strongest release 
since "EXODUS" 

FERRANTE 
TEICHER 

OFABABIAT 
UNITED ARTISTS RECORDS UA 563 

TWO WEEKS OLD AND THE 
ONLY VERSION ON THE CHARTS 

Produced By Jerry Leiber and Mike Stoller 

They're 

The Hi 
SWING1NG4 

aga n 

W1011 
WITH A NEW HIT 

" pnETORIA" 
UNITED ARTISTS RECORDS UA 568 6.00, 

CURRENT CHART RIDERS 
BABY JANE "DOGGIE IN THE WINDOW" GENE PITNEY 

UNITED ARTISTS RECORDS UA 560 

WN I'I'EI) 
RTISTS 

MIKE CLIFFORD 
"HALF HEAVEN HALF HEARTACHE" 

MUSICOR RECORDS MU 1026 

"WHAT TO DO WITH LAURIE" THE EXCITERS "TELL HIM" 
UNITED ARTISTS RECORDS UA 557 UNITED ARTISTS RECORD UA 544 

UNITED ARTISTS RECORDS 729 SEVENTH AVENUE NEW YORK 19. NEW YORK 
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HATTIE LIMES 

"HERE YOU 

COME" 
Gordy °7007 

MOTOWN /TAMLA RECORDS 
Detroit, Mich. 

r\\ \ \ \ \\y 
BARBARA GREENE 

LONG TALL SALLY 

SLIPPIN' 'N p 

SLIDIN' o 

Atco 6250 

ATCO RECORDS 
1617 B'wey, New York 23, N. Y. I 

AN ABSOLUTE SMASH! 

OUR SONGS 

OF LOVE 
The Lovenotes 

Wilshire 200 
Nationally distributed by 

JAYGEE RECORD CO., IPIC. 

318 W. 48th St., N. Y. 36 

when answering ads . . . 

Say You Saw It 

In Billboard 

TALENT TOPICS 
Continued from page 10 

Choir Boys' national tour takes 
it to Las Vegas, Pittsburgh, Hol- 
lywood and Toronto next 
month. . . Hard -to -check but 
ominous statistic: 300 record 
firms folded in 1962. 

JACK ORR 

BOSTON 
RCA's Asher Shuffer reports 

excellent results from a personal 
appearance promotion by Arthur 
Fiedler at the Jordan Marsh de- 
partment store record depart- 
ment. The Boston Pops con- 
ductor signed albums of his 
"Our Man in Boston" for a host 
of fans. 

Peter Lawford has canceled 
out for his appearance with 
Jimmy Durante, Sonny King 
and Eddie Jackson for the Blin - 
strub's date. . . . Stanley Blin - 
strub has grabbed Robert Goulet 
for a return engagement late in 
March after his smash appear- 
ance there last month. Tony 
Bennett and Ray Charles (a sur- 
prise booking here) also have 
been signed. 

Vaughn Meader visited Blin - 
strub's Village and promised to 
sign a contract after his concert 
hall tour is finished. . . Herb 
Dale, of Dale Enterprises, has 
taken on the Everest label and 
is happy with the response to 
Troy Shondell's records. 

SAN FRANCISCO 
Dick Stewart, long a teen fa- 

vorite on KPIX, is also taking 
on a radio deejay stint. He has 
started as substitute staffer on 
KSFO here every Sunday for 
two hours starting at noon... 

Two youthful amateur singers 
have turned professional upon 
winning an appearance on the 
Tennessee Ernie Ford variety 
show, originating in San Fran- 
cisco and seen weekdays on 
KGO -TV at noon. Their first 
air ventures have also landed 
them a recording with RCA. 
The pair are Hank Jones and 
Dean Kay, 22 -year olds, who 
bill themselves as Hank and 
Dean. 

Art Blakey, scheduled for a 
Jazz Workshop opening last 
week, got stuck in Japan. 
His opening has been delayed 
several days. .. . Mel Tonne's 
first 10 -day stint at the Off 
Broadway has been so success- 
ful, he has extended the engage- 
ment another sgven days. . 

June Christy and Dick Contino 
follow him, starting February 
15. GODFREY LEHMAN 

PHILADELPHIA 
Pep's Musical Bar returns to 

a name policy January 28 with 
Cannonball Adderley relighting 
the room. . . . A long -range 
booking will bring Damita Jo to 
Atlantic City's Club Harlem for 
June and August, with the July 
month at the Bolero in Wild - 
wood, N. J. . Irving Gran. 
will bring the Kingston Trio to 
the Academy of Music for a 
March 22 concert.... It will be 
a June wedding for maestro 
Sonnee Davis and songbird 
Phyllis (Cookie) Schwartz. . . 

Vaughn Meader returns here 
next month for a private appear- 
ance before the membership of 
the Union League, Republican 
Party stronghold. . . Tony 

Mammarella has taken Billy 
Cook, who bowed with "This 
Little World," under his mana- 
gerial wing.... Membership of 
the local AFTRA chapter en- 
dorsed the union's strike against 
WIBG. 

MAURIE H. ORODENKER 

HOUSTON 
June Christy has been signed 

to open an engagement at the 
Tidelands opening on January 
28. . . The Wanderers Three 
have returned to the Tidelands 
for an engagement. . Tim 
Evans, Ernest Mills and John 
James recently cut their first al- 
bum for Dolton called "We Sing 
Folk Songs," which will be out 
soon. Also on the bill is come- 
dian Stagg McMann.... Don 
Goldie, former trumpet player 
for Jack Teagarden, will replace 
the Don Cannon band on Feb- 
ruary 4. 

PITTSBURGH 
The Horizon Room at the 

Greater Pittsburgh Airport has 
an April commitment with 
Rusty Warren. Also set for the 
Horizon Room are the Four 
Coins and organist Earl Grant. 

Tenor Marco Valenti, former 
RCA Victor singer, has been 
booked into the Twin Coaches 
as of January 26.... Promoter 
Fay Olmstead has set a "A 
Leonard Bernstein Gala" on 
February 5 into Mt. Lebanon 
Auditorium with Robert Roun- 
seville, Claire Alexander, Rob- 
ert Goss and Mary Hensley as 
vocalists. . Pianist Benno 
Moiseiwitsch will play a concert 
on January 30 at Carnegie Hall. 
Glenn Miller's orchestra, led by 
Ray McKinley, played to ca- 
pacity audiences at two per- 
formances in the Memorial 
Theater in nearby McKeesport 
on January 20. 

LEONARD MENDLOWITZ 

CINCINNATI 
Jose Greco, on his first stand 

of a national tour, grossed $8,- 
700, at a $4.40 top, at Memorial 
Hall, Dayton, Ohio, January 18. 
Greco appeared under the ban- 
ner of W -B Productions, Inc., 
Dayton -based promoters, who 
now have experienced four con- 
secutive sellout concerts, the 
previous ones being with Lib - 
erace, the Limeliters and Fer- 
rante and Teicher. W -B has the 
Stan Getz Quintet, with Homer 
and Jethro set for Dayton Feb- 
ruary 24, and Peter Nero and 
ork March 10. They also have 
booked Tony Bennett for Vet- 
erans Memorial, Columbus, 
Ohio, March 1, and Music Hall, 
Cincinnati, April 20. 

Max Falcon, Fraternity Rec- 
ords artist, in town early last 
week to appear on the Skipper 
Ryle show on WKRC -TV, the 
Bob Braun "March of Dimes" 
seg and "Bandstand" on 
WLW -T, and the latter station's 
"Midwestern Hayride." He left 
here Tuesday (29) on a two -week 
road trip to plug his new release, 
"I Thought I Heard You Call 
My Name," accompanied by 
disk promoter, Pat Nelson. 
Thursday (31) Falcon appeared 
on the Buddy Dean TV-er in 
Baltimore. . . . Peter Nero set 
for the Taft Theater here 
March 9. BILL SACHS 

Distrib Switch 
HENDERSONVILLE, Tenn. - Monument Records an- 

nounced a change in distribu- 
tors in two cities last week. 

Supreme Distributors will re- 
place Ohio Appliances in Cin- 
cinnati, and Raymond Rosen, 
Inc., will be replaced by David 
Rosen, Inc., Phonograph Record 
Dvision, headed by Harry Rosen 
in Philadelphia. 

SPREADING ACROSS THE NATION! 
A Two -Sided Smash! 

BOBBY BLAND 

LALL ON ME 

THAT'S THE WAY 

LOVE IS 

JUNIOR PARKER 

DUKE #360 

DUKE #357 

I'M GONNA 
TELL IT ON YOU 

James Davis 
DUKE =359 

At Last Here's Jackie! 

JACKIE VERDELL 

YOU 

KNOW IT 

AIN'T 
RIGHT 

HOMEWORK 

Otis Rush 
DUKE X356 

BACKBEAT #537 

DUKE & PEACOCK RECORDS, INC. 
2809 Erastus Street, Houston, Texas OR 3 -2611 

/.. 

WHY NOT 

GIVE ME 

A 

CHANCE 
PEACOCK #1921 
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Oscar Davis 
$116,000 in 

By MARK -CLARK BATES 

NASHVILLE -Packed houses 
plus turnaways on the recently 
completed Ray Price package 
tour have spurred Price's per- 
sonal manager, Oscar Davis, to 
begin plans for a similar annual 
tour. 

This year's tour, which opened 
January 10 in Fort Worth and 
closed January 20 in Austin, 

Hap Peebles Sets 

Five -State Tour 
WICHITA, Kan. -Five Mid- 

western States will be visited on 
a country music tour arranged 
by Harry (Hap) Peebles, Wichi- 
ta agent. Featured in the pack- 
age will be Hank Thompson and 
His Brazos Valley Boys, Kitty 
Wells, Johnny and Jack and the 
Tennessee Mountain Boys, Billy 
Gray, Bill Phillips, and the 
Plainsmen Quartet. 

Cities to be visited are Salina, 
Kan., February 15; Sioux City, 
Ia., February 16; Kansas City, 
Mo., February 17; Sioux Falls, 
S. D., February 19; Omaha, 
February 20; Lincoln, Neb., 
February 21; Topeka, Kan., 
February 22, and Wichita, Feb- 
ruary 23. 

The Topeka engagement will 
be for the Shawnee County 
Sheriff's Benefit Association, the 
fourth consecutive year that 
c. &w. talent has been used for 
that purpose. 

e 

COUNTRY MUSIC lim"r 
Unit Grosses 

11 -Day Trek 
Tex., covered cities in Louisiana, 
Texas, New Mexico and Cali- 
fornia. 

In five of the nine cities 
visited, advance sales topped the 
$10,000 mark, according to 
Davis. 

Total take for the tour hit 
$116,000, with total expendi- 
tures budgeted at $80,000. The 
largest single house was Long 
Beach, Calif., where the gross 
totaled S16,000. 

Shreveport, La., the one stop 
where box- office sales were dis- 
appointing ($4,700), could be at- 
tributed to a last- minute change 
in plans, Davis said. Originally, 
the Shreveport date was not 
scheduled. However, when ar- 
rangements for a scheduled 
Portland, Ore., date fell through. 
the Shreveport show was hooked. 
Consequently, the Louisiana 
hooking did not get proper pro- 
motion, Davis said. Both radio 
and local newspapers were used 
for promotion, with emphasis 
on radio. 

On tour with Price were Webb 
Pierce, Minnie Pearl, Carl 
Smith, George Jones, Stonewall 
Jackson, Red Sovine, Claude 
King and Billy Deaton. 

Davis, who set up the tour 
for the Ray Price Enterprises 
through the Jim Denny Artists 
Bureau, said he has booked a 
similar Price show for Cobo 
Hall, Detroit, for May 5. The 
Detroit show will carry an 
$8,000 price tag for talent. 

BIGGER THAN "THAT'S LIFE" 
THE 

PEANUT 
BUTTER 

50.E 

ALL WORK 
NO PLAY 

GABRIEL mF ANGELS 
S -4133 

*Watch It Race "WILD WEEKEND" 
Up To The Top Ten!!! 

Order This Hit Album Now! 

"WILD WEEKEND 
by 

ROCKIN' REBELS 
SLP -509 

RECORDS 

11 

1 

COUNTRY 
MUSIC 

CORNER 
By BILL SACHS 

The Lima, Ohio, Jaycees bring 
another "Grand Ole Opry" 
package to Memorial Hall, that 
city, February 16, the fifth such 
annual affair. Featured in the 
package will be Marty Robbins, 
Jerry Byrd, Bobby Sykes, Don 
Winters, and the Teardrops. 
Tom Francis, of WIMA Radio, 
will emcee the two performances. 

The Stanley Brothers were 
in Cincinnati early last week to 
cut a new country folk album 
for King Records under the di- 
rection of King general man- 
ager, Hal G. Neely.... Kathy 
Dee, working tender the guid- 
ance of Reed Welty, of B -W 
Music, Inc., Wooster, Ohio, 
played Youngstown, Ohio, last 
Friday (1), and then hopped to 
Greensburg, Pa., for a fair man- 
agers' banquet show Satur- 
day (2). 

Rocky and Hal, currently 
working nitery dates six nights 
a week in the Seattle, Wash: 
Vancouver, B. C., sector, have 
just had their first release on 
Bafco Records, "Innocent Fun," 
a country vocal, b.w. and instru- 
mental arrangement of the mod- 
ern standard, "Solitude." Mean- 
while the lads continue their 
daily deejay stanza on Station 
KOQT, Bellingham, Wash- . - 

Rose Maddox heads back to Las 
Vegas soon for show dates, fol- 
lowing which she embarks on a 
Canadian trek during March. 
Plans are being made for a 
European tour in April. Heading 
up the recently organized Rose 
Maddox Fan Club are Paul C. 
Groah, Roanoke, Va., and Pat 
White, San Francisco. 

At the BMI Award Dinner in 
New York January 23, Hank 
Cochran received pop awards on 
three tunes penned by him in 
1962 -"A Little Bitty Tear," 
"She's Not You" and "Funny 
Way of Laughin'." J. Hal Smith, 
general manager of Pamper Mu- 
sic, Inc., and Wayland (Stubby) 
Stubblefield, also of the Pamper 
firm, made the trip to New York 
with Hank for the presentation. 

Oklahoma country singer Abe 
Mulkey, who records under the 
name of Marshall West, has just 
signed a recording pact with the 
Cameo label Ir a deal arranged 
by Merle Kilgore, writer of 
"Wolverton Mountain." West's 
first for Cameo is a Kilgore 
tune, "Sheepskin Valley," slated 
for release this week. ... James 
T. Murphy Jr., Providence, R. I., 
and Ted Powers, of Columbia, 
S. C., have formed Country Star 
Promotions and Maycourt Re- 
cording Company, with head- 
quarters in Sumter, S. C. Pur- 
pose of the firm, according to 
Murphy, is to promote new 
country singers. Murphy for- 
merly toured the South as an 
entertainer under the name of 
Cowboy Pete Murphy but has 
been out of the country music 
field several years. He and Pow- 
ers also plan to promote country 
music shows in the South Caro- 
lina sector. 

Bobby Hankins and his group 
are routed for Forrest Park, 
Marshalltown, Ia., February 5; 
Lake Robbins, Perry, Ia., 6; Lar- 
amar, Fort Dodge, Ia., 7; Mel- 
ody Hill, Dubuque, Ia., 8; Mat- 
ter's, Decorah, Ia., 9; Coliseum, 
Oelwein, Ia., 12; Star Ballroom, 
Dakota City, la., 14; Castle 
Club, Charles City, Ia., 15; Coli- 
seum, Oelwein, Ia., 16, and Ar- 
mar, Marion, Ia., 20. George 
Hamilton IV appears with the 
Hankins combo at the February 
5, 7, 8 and 9 stops. Hankins, 
now in his third year with his 

BllRoard 

FEBRUARY 9, 1963 

HOTCO _ ù sr 
This Last By special survey for week ending 2/9 Weeks a. 

Week Week Title, Artist, Label L No. CAM 

1 BALLAD OF JED CLAMPETT 10 
Lester Flott t. Earl Scruggs, Columbia 42606 

2 2 DON'T LET ME CROSS OVER 10 
Carl Butler, Columbia 42593 

3 3 RUBY ANN 10 
Marty Robbins, Columbia 42614 

4 4 SECOND HAND ROSE 8 
Roy Drusky, Decca 31443 

5 8 T FOR TEXAS 9 
Grandpa Jones, Monument 801 

6 5 SING A LITTLE SONG OF HEARTACHE 14 
Rose Maddox, Capitol 4845 

7 10 FROM A JACK TO A KING 7 
Ned Miller, Fobar 114 

8 6 DOES HE MEAN THAT MUCH TO YOU, 10 
Eddy Arnold, RCA Victor 8102 

9 9 I'VE ENJOYED AS MUCH OF THIS 
AS I CAN STAND 10 
Porter Wagoner, RCA Victor 8105 

10 19 HELLO TROUBLE 12 
Orville Couch, Vey Joy 470 

11 13 I'VE GOT THE WORLD BY THE TAIL 6 
Claude King, Columbia 42630 

12 12 I TAKE THE CHANCE 7 
Ernest Ashworth, Hickory 1189 

13 11 DOWN BY THE RIVER 8 
Faran Young, Capitol 4868 

14 14 BAYOU TALK 7 
Jimmy "C" Newman, Decca 31440 

15 7 WALL TO WALL LOVE 14 
Bob Gollion, Hickory 1181 

17 CAN'T HANG UP THE PHONE 3 
Stonewall Jackson, Columbia 42628 

20 END OF THE WORLD 8 
Skeeter Davis, RCA Victor 8098 

18 BLACK CLOUD 7 
Leroy Von Dyke, Mercury 72057 

- NOT WHAT I HAD IN MIND 1 

George Jones, United Artists 528 

20 16 I'VE BEEN EVERYWHERE 22 
Hank Snow, RCA Victor 8072 

21 ROBERT E. LEE 3 
Ott Stephens, Chancellor 107 

23 YOU'RE FOR ME 7 
Buck Owens, Capitol 4872 - FADED LOVE 4 
Leon M,Auliff, Cimarron 4057 - MR. HEARTACHE, MOVE ON 4 
Coleman O'Neal, Chancellor 108 

16 

17 

18 

19 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

30 HOW COME YOUR DOG DON'T BITE 
NOBODY BUT ME? 3 
Webb Pierce E. Mel Tillis, Decca 31445 - IS THIS ME? 1 

Jim Reeves, RCA Victor 8127 

29 THE WAY IT FEELS TO DIE 3 
Vernon Stewart, Chart 501 - KNOCK AGAIN, TRUE LOVE 1 

Claude Gray, Mercury 72063 - ALL GROWN UP 1 

Johnny Horton, Columbia 42653 - WALK ME TO THE DOOR 1 

Roy Price, Columbia 42658 

hour- and -a -half platter show on 
KOEL, Oelwein, Ia., on Satur- 
day nights, has just inaugurated 
a half hour daily seg on KCRG 
Radio, Cedar Rapids, Ia., and 
says he's in need of spinning 
material from the major labels. 
Hankins' address is 10 Eighth 
Street, N. E., Oelwein, Ia. 

Latest bookings by Otto De- 
vine, talent chief of WSM's 
"Grand Ole Opry," Nashville, 
stack up as follows: Flatt and 
Scruggs, Cleveland, Ohio, Feb- 
ruary 9; Oneonta, Ala., 15; 
George Hamilton IV, Marshall- 
town, Ia., February 5; Perry, 
Ia., 6; Fort Dodge, Ia., 7; Du- 
buque, Ia., 8; Decorah, Ia., 9; 
Davenport, Ia., 17; Bill Ander- 
son and Ray Price, Red Deer, 
Alta., February 5; Edmonton, 
Alta., 6; Calgary, Alta., 7; Med- 
icine Hat, Alta., 8; Lethbridge, 
Alta., 9; Spokane, Wash., 10; 
Vancouver, B. C., 11, and Ta- 
coma, Wash., 12; Carl Butler, 
Oklahoma City Okla.. Febru- 
ary 9; Odessa, Tex., 10; Justin 
Tubb, Secaucus, N. J., February 
22; Jackson, N. J., 23, and New 
Melford, Conn., 24. 

ANOTHER SMASH HIT! 
for 

Ernest 
Ashworth 

I TAKE THE 
CHANCE 

HICKORY 1189 

GOOD GOLLY 
MISS MOLLY 

6/w 

I CAN'T TRUST ME 

(In Your Arms Anymore) 

JERRY LEE LEWIS 
San #382 

SUN RECORDS 
639 Madison Mernphh, Tenn. 
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BUMS 

by PAUL K U H N (45 rpm JAY JAY 280) 

by the 
NEW YORKERS 

Qty. 

A BILLBOARD PICK 

AL 
that SELL! 
1 FREE 

with purchase of 10 
PLUS SPECIAL 10% CASH DISCOUNT 

FOR PROMPT PAYMENT 

MONO 1055 STEREO 5055 MONO 1052 

I)tiric'iiiq 

Qty. 

Qty. 

STEREO 5052 MONO 1053 STEREO 5053 

ithr- Qty 

Authentic Polish Songs. Instru- 
mental BILLBOARD PICK featuring Clarinet solos. 

ORDER FROM YOUR DISTRIBUTOR NOW ! 

A & L DIST. CO., Philadelphia, Pa. 

APEXMARTIN SALES, Newark, New Jersey 
ARC DIST., Detroit, Michigan 
METRO RECORD DIST., Buffalo, New York 
BIG TOWN OF CLEVELAND, Cleveland, O. 
CODA DIST., Minneapolis. Minnesota 
COMMERCIAL MUSIC CO., St. Louis, Mo. 
DALE ENTERPRISES, Boston, Mass. 

EASTERN RECORD DIST., East Hartford, 
Conn. 

FENWAY RECORD INC., Pittsburgh, Pa. 

GENERAL DIST. CO., INC. Baltimore, Md. 
HUFFINE DIST., Seattle, Washington 
LEN SMITH, Albany 4, New York 
LIEBERMAN MUSIC, Omaha, Nebraska 
JAN's RECORD DIST. CO., Chicago, III. 

BETA RECORD DIST., INC., N. Y., N. Y. 

PEP RECORD SALES, INC., Los Angeles, 
California 

TELL MUSIC CO.. Madison 5, Wisconsin 
DEMAIN RECORD SALES CO., Phoenix, 

Arizona 
TANNER "N" TEXAS SALES CORP. 

San Antonio, Texas 
FIELD MUSIC SALES INC., San Francisco, 

California 

Qty. 

. 
.......,..r..:i... ,S3r:'i«:4-_.úati>Éi:;:i.,.:l..S.-_>. 4.7í:::>`d...,:. 

Manufactured by 

JAY JAY POLKA RECORD CO. 

2452 S. Kedzie Ave., Chicago 23, III. 

Phone: RO 26000 

Copyrighted material 
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16 BILLBOARD 
RHYTHM & BLUES )L 

R & B ROUNDUP 
By NICK BIRO 
(Chicago Office) 

The National Association of 
Radio Announcers is planning a 
West Coast regional meeting in 
San Francisco February 23. All 
rhythm and blues jockeys in the 
12 Western States are invited. 
Anyone interested, c o n t a c t 
NARA's Western Regional Di- 
rector Bugs Scruggs, Box 170, 
San Francisco.... The Western 
group will host NARA's big na- 
tional convention in San Francis- 
co next August. Agenda at the 
regional meeting will cover plans 
for the convention plus regional 
organization (the Coast group 
wants jockeys from each area), 
and the setting up of a job 
placement bureau. The Coast 
group will also be working with 
the national association on job 
placement, a retirement plan and 
the upgrading of the level and 
quality of rhythm and blues pro- 
gramming. Aim is to assist mem- 
ber jockeys in producing better 
programs for their respective sta- 
tions. In Scruggs' own words: 
"Our organization is not new, 
but it has just crossed a thres- 
hold of real solidarity among 
jocks with common interests and 
common problems. We hope 
that we can not only improve 
our image in the broadcast in- 
dustry but that we can add to 
the uplifting of every station 
we represent, not only in image 
but in revenue." 

With the holidays out of the 
way, a lot of rhythm and blues 
jockeys are again getting in- 
volved in record hops and com- 
munity shows. Sir Walter Ra- 

leigh, WAMO, Pittsburgh, is 
putting together a five -city re- 
view that will feature Ray 
Charles plus a host of other 
artists. Raleigh's show kicks off 
in Pittsburgh's Civic Arena (seat- 
ing 13,000), March 29. It then 
goes to Louisville, Cleveland, 
Detroit and St. Louis. Raleigh, 
incidentally, is one of the few 
jockeys to have two shows per 
day, one r. &b., one jazz. . . . 

Bugs Scruggs, KSAN, San Fran- 
cisco, is emsee and promoter of 
a review featuring Jimmy Mc- 
Cracklin to be held at San Fran- 
cisco's Fillmore Auditorium Feb- 
ruary 3. McCracklin's latest hit 
was "I Just Got to Know." 
Others on the show: Bob and 
Earl of "Deep Down Inside" 
fame on Tempe; Lonnie Russ 
( "My Wife Can't Cook" on Four 
Jay); The Four Rivers, new Jubi- 
lee group backing on the Coast; 
and Daisy Dial, who Raleigh is 
tabbing as a "sensational female 
performer who's a cross between 
Aretha Franklin and Dinah 
Washington." 

Jim Lounsbury is emseeing a 
combination TV show and rec- 
ord hop to be telecast out of the 
Aragon Ballroom in Chicago 
later this month. Stars will in- 
clude Jimmy Clanton, Oscar 
Brown Jr., the Four Seasons 
and Ral Donner. Lounsbury and 
Jack Hilton, producer, will tape 
two one -hour segments to be 
syndicated nationally. If the 
show clicks, the pair hope to 
convert to a weekly program. 

Detroit will have a new 
television segment devoted to 
rhythm and blues artists. It'll be 

Selling Strong! 
THE GROOVIEST 

BOSSA NOVA ALBUM 
on Blue Note 

KENNY BURRELL /GUITAR 
WILLIE BOBO /DRUMS 

WENDELL MARSHALL /BASS 
GARVIN MASSEAUX /CHEKERE 

BOSSA 
NOVA 

MBE 

SOO IK E QUEBEC /TENOR SAX 

samba 

SOUL SAMBA IKE QUEBEC BLP 4114 

2 BIG SINGLES FROM THIS ALBUM 

"BLUE "LOIE" "BLUE 

BLU 

SAMBA" 
b,w 

"LLORO TU DESPEDIDA" 
E NOTE 45x1876 BLUE NOTE 45x187.1 

BLUE NOTE Records, Inc. Ne.: k° °376 Ner'York 

FEBRUARY 9, 1963 

called "Club 1270," on WKYZ 
(Channel 7) on Sunday from 
3-4. First stars will include Mary 
Wells, Marvin Gaye and the 
Vandellas. Scheduled soon will 
be the Miracles, the Marvellet- 
tes, Little Jimmy Wonder and 
the Contours. 

Amos Milburn, one of the 
big names in blues, is due for 
his first release on Motown this 
week. Tamla- Motown is plan- 
ning a company newsletters, the 
better to keep everyone informed 
of what's new.... C. T. Trem- 
mel left KSAN, San Francisco 
and will announce a new affilia- 
tion shortly.... Bill Summers is 
back at work after being out 
for a week recovering from in- 
juries suffered in an auto ac- 
cident. . Ken Knight has 
renewed his Jacksonville, Fla. 
television program for another 
year. . Eddie O'Jay moves 
from WUFU, Buffalo, to 
KCAC, Phoenix, Ariz. . . 

Sunny Jim Kelsey, a protege of 
Sir Walter on Pittsburgh's 
WAMO, moves to Buffalo to fill 
O'Jay's spot. Both WAMO and 
WUFU are Dynamic Broad- 
casting Company outlets. 

HOT PICKS OF THE 
WEEK: Bill Summers, WLOU, 
Louisville: "Hula Hopping," 
Idalia Boyd, Dimension. 

Sir Walter Raleigh, WAMO, 
Pittsburgh: "Record Company 
Blues," Gloria Lynne, Everest, 
a combination r. &b. and jazz of- 
fering taken from her album, 
"Gloria Lynne Live at Las 
Vegas' Thunderbird "; "Jive Sam - 
ba' Riverside, Cannonball Ad- 
derley and the Sextette; "Any 
Way You Wanna," by Harvey 
on Tri Fi. "Harvey" is Harvey 
Fuqua, owner of the Tri Fi la- 
bel, formerly with the Moon - 
glows. 

Bugs Scruggs, KSAN, San 
Francisco: "Red's Dream" Loui- 
siana Red on Roulette; "Slow 
Motion" Don and Dewey on 
Rush; "Soul Plus Soul' Tommy 
Smith Jr. Trio on Orchestra, and 
"Shookup Over You" Jimmy 
(Soul) Clark on Peek. Scruggs 
is also picking Miss Daisy Dial 
as the "hottest new artist in these 
parts." 

Monument's 1st 

Label: Gaylord 
HENDERSONVILLE, Tenn. - Fred Foster, president of 

Monument Records here, an- 
nounced this week plans to dis- 
tribute Gaylord Records as its 
first affiliate label. 

The first Gaylord release 
under the new arrangement is 
planned for about February 15 
with a Hank Cochran rendition 
of "Yesterday's Memories" b -w 
"When You Gotta Go, You 
Gotta Go." The second release 
planned on the Gaylord label 
under the Monument pact will 
feature Millie Brown, a veteran 
Houston vocalist. 

Gaylord is the creative entity 
of Pamper Music, Goodlettsville, 
Tenn.. a BMI firm headed by 
Hal Smith. 

ONE OF ENGLAND'S BIGGEST! 

NOW BIG IN U.S. A. 

"ANGELA 
#4060 

by 

// 

Jay and Tommy Scoff 
D. 1.'s 8 Distributors, write: 

FIDELITY RECORDS, INC. 
P. O. Box 1411 Phone: 723 -2811 

Wichita Falls, Texas 

Billboard. 

H OT Rats SINGLES 
This Last By settler survey for week hilag 2/' Meab on 

Weak Week Title, Artist, label a Re. tiet 

1 1 TWO LOVERS 10 
Mary Wells, Motown 1035 

2 2 YOU'VE REALLY GOT A HOLD ON ME 7 
Miracles, Tornio 54073 

3 4 HOTEL HAPPINESS 10 
Brook Benton, Mercury 72055 

4 5 UP ON THE ROOF 10 
Drifters, Atlantic 2162 

5 7 THAT'S THE WAY LOVE IS 4 
Bobby Bland, Duke 360 

6 3 YOU ARE MY SUNSHINE 10 
Ray Charles, ABC -Paramount 10375 

7 12 WALK RIGHT IN 3 
Rooftop Sing:ers, Vonguord 35017 

8 10 HEY PAULA 2 
Paul E Paula, Philips 40084 

9 9 LOOP DE LOOP 4 
Johnny Thunder, Diamond 129 

10 8 MAMA DIDN'T LIE 2 
Jan Bradley, Chess 1845 

11 6 DON'T MAKE ME OVER 5 
Dionne Warwick, Scepter 1239 

12 21 ALL ABOUT MY GIRL 2 
Jimmy McGriff, Sue 777 

13 11 TELL HIM 8 
Excitors, United Artists 544 

14 27 THE NIGHT HAS A THOUSAND EYES 6 
Bobby Vee, liberty 55521 

15 17 STRANGE I KNOW 7 
Marvelettes, Tornio 54072 

16 20 CALL ON ME 2 
Bobby Blond, Duke 360 

17 15 EVERYBODY LOVES A LOVER 6 
Shirelles, Scepter 1243 

18 30 HE'S SURE THE BOY I LOVE 3 
Crystals, Philles 109 

19 16 STUBBORN KIND OF FELLOW 17 
Marvin Gaye, Tornio 54068 

20 - RAINBOW 1 

Gene Chandler, Vee Jay 468 

21 - PUDDIN' N' TAIN 1 

Alley Cats, Philles 108 

22 - HITCH HIKE 1 

Marvin Gaye, Tamlo 54075 

23 - RUBY BABY 1 

Dion, Columbia 42662 

24 19 I SAW LINDA YESTERDAY 4 
Dickey Lee, Smash 1791 

25 - SEND ME SOME LOVIN' 1 

Sam Cooke, RCA Victor 8129 

26 - WALK LIKE A MAN 1 

Four Seasons, Vee Jay 485 

13 YOU'RE GONNA NEED ME 4 
Barbara Lynn, Jamie 1240 - THE DOG 1 

Rufus Thomas, Stox 130 - SHAKE SHERRY 2 
Contours, Gordy 7012 - YOU'RE THE REASON I'M LIVING 1 

Bobby Darin, Capitol 4897 

27 

28 

29 

30 

Headed for the Top! 

"COOL 
WATER" 

THE BLUE BELLES 
Newtown #5009 

NEWTOWN RECORDS 
Harold B. Robinson 

6600 N. Broad St., Philadelphia, Pa. 

Livingstone 8 -5010 

ANOTHER HIT! 

BRIAN HYLAND 

IF MARY'S THERE 

I Bustin' 

WIND ME UP 

(I CRY) 

JAN HOWARD 

Faron Young's 
Youngest Hit! 

"THE YELLOW 

BANDANA" 

"HOW MUCH I MUST 

HAVE, LOVED YOU" 
7Y08 
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Capitol Jumps Back Into Jazz, ß1°aooro Beet 8.111 ac 

Stressing Lesser Known Names VJAZZ ALsvsS 
HOLLYWOOD - Capitol 

Records is back in the jazz busi- 
ness with a vengeance. The label 
is kicking off a new line of al- 
bum product featuring modern 
jazz artists that will he key- 
noted by youth and indi- 
viduality. 

The new series on the West 
Coast major is being referred to 
as "Dimensions in Jazz" and it 
will share a special trade -mark 
space with the usual Capitol 
logo. 

Emphasis for the "Dimensions 
in Jazz" line will be new talent. 
The label is centering on lesser 
known names on the general 
market. Men Like Jimmie 
Rowles, Joe Bucci, Jack Sheldon 
and John Grey are certainly not 
new to those familiar with the 
jazz trade. 

Rowles is the pianist on the 
West Coast who has arranged 
for and recorded with Peggy 
Lee and a variety of top line 
artists. His first Capitol set in 
the new series features a quartet 
in "Kinda Groovy." Sheldon was 
in the vanguard during the pop- 
ularity of the so- called West 
Coast school of jazz. The trum- 
peter has always been among 
the top clique of studio jazz 
men and has played with the 
leading jazz musicians on the 

JazzScope 
A program of jazz films will 

be shown at the Wilkie Memo- 
rial Building in New York City 
February 6. Clark Terry, Charlie 
Rouse and others play in the 
background of "Morning With 
Jimmy," the Max Roach Quintet 
plays in "The Delinquent, the 
Hipster and the Square,' Bessie 
Smith is heard and seen in the 
1928 experimental sound film 
"St. Louis Blues," and a Jazz 
Arts Society flick "At Home 
With Jazz," will also be shown. 

Big band devotees will be dis- 
appointed to hear that Les 
Brown is seriously thinking of 
retiring.... Herbie Mann took 
the pop artist retail store and 
deejay promotion route recent- 
ly in Baltimore and Philadelphia 
to promote his latest on the At- 
lantic label, "Do the Bossa No- 
va." . . . Sunday get -together 
jazz sessions are being held on 
a permanent basis at the new 
Five Spot. The club, which re- 
cently moved location, has Les 
Davis as host for the Sunday 
dates and features talks between 
musicians and audience along 
with much blowing. ... Prestige 
continues to push the bossa nova 
as prime disk ammunition and 
also stars the first jazz version 
of the music from "Oliver." 
Dave Pike, Jimmy Raney and 
Tom Flannagan are prime mov- 
ers in the set. 

"Newport Comes to N. H." 
is the title of a concert being 
planned at the University of 
New Hampshire for Saturday 
afternoon (23). Coleman Haw- 
kins, the Herb Pomeroy ork, Pee 
Wee Russell, Ruby Braff and a 

good many others will he on 
hand. 

Early in March, Lionel Hamp- 
ton will produce a jazz festival 
for Macy's Department store 
in this city. . . In addition to 
Hamp, Benny Goodman, Gene 
Krupa, Teddy Wilson will 
re- create the old days. This is 
the second year in a row that 

(Continued on page 37) 

Coast. Bucci is a jazz organist 
who scored impressively at the 
Newport Festival last year. His 
first set is "Wild About Basie." 
John Grey is a newcomer on 
guitar who has played with a 
good many groups, Buddy De- 
Franco among them. 

Leading the new "Dimensions 

in Jazz" series is an album which 
showcases George Shearing 
playing minus his quartet. The 
pianist, instead, is showcased 
with an all -star rhythm team 
that includes the late Israel 
Crosby and Vernet Fournier. 
These two men make up two - 
thirds of the Ahmad Jamal trio. 

COLUMBIA PROMISES: 

Jazz Reissues Will 
Roll With Regularity 

NEW YORK -Jazz collectors and dealers can expect the 
stream of prime reissue material to continue from Columbia Records. 
John Hammond, who is in charge of the program at the label, says 
that many of the bugs have been worked out of the program and 
the reissue packages are moving nicely. As a result the regular re- 
lease of collector's fare should continue to gain momentum. 

Hammond handed F rank 
Driggs much of the credit for 
the systematizing and collating 
of the reissue program. The 
sets are being planned on a f ive- 
year basis with the entire jazz 
catalog of product in the Co- 
lumbia house the source of ma- 
terial. 

The last four jazz packages 
released by the label have done 
very well, according to Ham- 
mond. Leader is the Billie Holi- 
day package, which has passed 
the 20,000 copy mark. The 
Fletcher Henderson set has sold 
5,000 copies, the Mildred Bailey 
7,000 and "Swing Street" is 
over the 1,500 mark. This is 
particularly encouraging, accord- 
ing to Hammond, because each 
of the sets contains two or more 
LP's, and is scholarly in nature. 

Part of the sales strength of 
these packages, according to the 
reissue chief at Columbia, is 
the total package. Besides disks, 
the sets include artfully pro- 
duced program notes which pro- 
vide a history not only on the 
actual recordings, but the era 
and the lives of the artists as 
well. 

Among the projects,which will 
be released during the coming 
year are a three -LP set of 

Woody Herman on Columbia, a 

three -disk Jack Teagarden pack- 
age on Epic, a Big Bill Broonzy 
blues package on the Okeh label 
and unreleased Huddie (Lead - 
belly) Leadbetter masters which 
will appear on Columbia. 

According to Hammond, the 
jazz public can except four pack- 
ages a year, at least, from the 
label's archives. 

11111IIIIIIHI11111111IIIIIIIIIII11111111IIIIIIIIIINIIIlIII11111111NIIIII11111111I11 

JOHN LEWIS 
ON BROADWAY 

NEW YORK -John Lewis 
has composed and recorded in- 
cidental music for the forth- 
coming William Inge Broadway 
play, "Natural Affection." The 
show stars Kin Stanley and is 
produced by Oliver Smith in 
association with Manuel Seff. 
The Lewis score has been re- 
corded on tape and will be 
played during and between acts 
of the play. In recording the 
score, Lewis used a 12 -man 
group featuring such artists as 
drummer Connie Kay, alto saxist 
Phil Woods and guitarist Jim 
Hall. The play opened January 
31 at the Booth Theater. 
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11a0arted be Jars Dealers In Malor Market, for January, 1967 

This 
Month 7itle, Artist, label 6 No. 

1. JAZZ SAMBA -Stan Getz & Charlie Byrd, Verve V 8432 

2. HERBIE MANN AT THE VILLAGE GATE -Atlantic 1380 

3. BIG BAND BOSSA NOVA -Quincy Jones, 
Mercury MG 20751 

4. JAZZ IMPRESSIONS OF BLACK ORPHEUS- 
Vince Guaraldi Trio Fantasy 3337 

5. I'VE GOT A WOMAN -Jimmy McGriff, Sue LP 1012 

6. SINATRA -BASTE -Frank Sinatra & Count Basie, 
Reprise R 1008 

7. BIG BAND BOSSA NOVA -Stan Getz, Verve 8494 

8. RIGHT NOW -Herbie Mann, Atlantic 1384 

9. BASHIN' -THE UNPREDICTABLE JIMMY SMITH - 
Verve V 8474 

10. BAD BOSSA NOVA -Gene Ammons, Prestige PR 7257 

11. HELLO YOUNG LOVERS -Nancy Wilson, Capitol T 1767 

12. SOUL SUMMIT -Gene Ammons with Sonny Stitt & Jack 
McDuff Prestige PR 7234 

13. DIZZY ON THE FRENCH RIVIERA -Dizzy Gillespie, 
Philips PHM 200 -048 

14. JIMMY SMITH PLAYS FATS WALLER -Blue Note 4100 

15. FROM THE HEART -Honk Crawford, Atlantic 1387 

16. DO THE BOSSA NOVA WITH HERBIE MANN - 
Atlantic 1397 

17. BLACK AND BLUE -Lou Rawls, Capitol T 1824 

18. GLORIA LYNNE AT THE LAS VEGAS THUNDERBIRD - 
Everest 1208 

19. THE JAZZ CRUSADERS AT THE LIGHTHOUSE - 
Pacific Jazz 57 

20. THE OSCAR PETERSON TRIO BURSTING OUT WITH THE 
ALL STAR BIG BAND Verve V 8476 

21. TOKYO BLUES- Horace Silver, Blue Note 4110 

22. AHMAD JAMAL AT THE BLACKHAWK -Argo S 703 

NEW ACTION JAZZ ALBUMS 

TROMBONE JAZZ SAMBA -Bob Brookmeyer, Verve 8498 

WOODY HERMAN- 1963 -Philips PHM 200 -065 

PROFILE OF A JAZZ MUSICIAN -The Paul Horn Quintet, 
Columbia CL 1922 

SCREAMIN'- Brother Jack McDuff, Prestige 7259 

BALLADS -John Coltrane, Impulse A 32 

Formula: Build for Jazz, Score Pop 
NEW YORK - There's a that means more prestige and 

growing belief among jazz a. &r. loot for jazz artists and pro - 
men that their music has arrived ducers. 
commercially. Fads and freaks Creed Taylor at Verve Rec- 
aside, there's a feeling of high ords is one of the optimistic. 
optimism around the jazz trade With Stan Getz bossa nova album 

TROMBONE SAMBA: Bob Brookmeyer has one of his biggest 
LP's ever in his current item on Verve. Creed Taylor has high 
hopes for him. 

hits and Jimmy Smith safely 
stashed away under contract, 
Taylor probably has good reason 
for optimism. 

As a. &r. chief at Verve, Tay- 
lor plans and produces the ma- 
jority of dates on the label. 
When he took over the job two 
years ago, he inherited a stable 
of modern jazz stars who sold 
moderately well in the jazz mar- 
ket but had little or no impact 
on the pop field. Taylor took 
the post when MGM Records 
purchased the label from Nor- 
man Granz. Since then the a. &r. 
producer has tried new things 
with established artists and has 
taken chances on what the jazz 
purists might call commercial 
ideas. This to him is the basis of 
building a strong, salable jazz 
line. 

Commercial ideas, of course, 
are open to wide interpretation. 
To Taylor they are merely new 
and different vehicles of produc- 
tion and material. Taylor ex- 
plains it this way: "We work 
with the artist to find a new 
frame for his talent. Nothing 
gimmicky, just an original con- 

cept which showcases the art- 
ist's ability. I never ask an artist 
to change his style of playing, 
just to play sometimes within a 
new frame of reference." 

The new frame of reference 
worked admirably well with 
Stan Getz. "Jazz Samba" kicked 
off the bossa nova rage. "It was 
Charlie Byrd's idea," says Tay- 
lor, "and none of us expected 
it to be this big." 

The Verve a. &r. chief is cur- 
rently working on new ideas for 
a number of other well -known 
jazz names. Guitarist Jim Hall 
will soon be out with an LP 
titled "Jazz Limbo." Bob Brook- 
meyer, the redoubtable trom- 
bonist, has a new set out called 
"Trombone Jazz Samba." The 
pitch is obvious on both these 
sets. Taylor also has the Jim 
Smith set, "Bossa Nova Meets 
County and Western" ready 
to go. 

Other artists Taylor plans to 
use extensively in jazz -oriented 
packages with wide appeal are 
Wynton Kelly and Johnny 
Hodges. 
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HITS OF THE WORLD 
ARGENTINA 

(Courtesy Escalera a la Fama) 
*Denotes local orytI. 

This Last 
Week Welt 

1 2 DAME FELICIDAD - 
Enrique Guzman (CBS); 
Sim San Roman (Music 
Hall) -Korn 

2 I SPEEDY GONZALES- 
Pat Boone (Dot -Music Hall); 
David Dante (Victor); 
Pepino di Capri (Odeon) 

3 3 DI PAPA -*Luis Ordonez 
(CBS); Siro San Roman 
(Music Hall) -Korn 

4 4 DARLING -Paul Evans 
(Kapp- Tondisc)- Fermata 

5 5 EL BARQUITO -Joao 
Gilberto (Odeon) 

6 - PORQUE LA QUISE TANTO 
*Miguel Montero-Mariano 
Mores (Odeon)- Newman 

7 6 CORAZON DE LUTO- 
.Chacho Santa Cruz 
(Microton); Luis Ordonez 
(CBS); Siro Mendoza 
(Victor); Julio Cesar (Odeon) 
-Korn 

8 8 PORQUE ME DEJAS - 
Gilbert Becaud (Odeon); 
Lucho Gatita (Odeon); Los 
Cinco Latinos (CBS); Los 
Abriles (Philips)- -Smart 

9 - LIMBO ROCK -(.tubby 
Checker (Fermata)-Mann- 
Fermata 

10 10 CIEN LIBRAS DE BARRO 
-Gene Mae Daniels 
(Ld eroy); Enrique Guzman 
(CBS) 

AUSTRALIA 
(Courtesy Musk Maker, Sydney) 

*Denotes local origin 
ibis last 
Week Weds 

1 8 SURFSIDE -Digger Revell's 
Denveruren (HMV)- Johnny 
Devlin Music 

2 4 TELSTAR -The Tomadoes 
(Decoct) -Reg Connelly 

3 3 THE BOYS -The Shadows 
(Columbia) -Belinda 

4 I RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 
Presley (RCA) -Belinda 

5 5 ALLEY CAT -Bent Fabric 
(Columbia)- Chappells 

6 6 BOBBY'S GIRL -Marcie 
Blare (London) -Alberts 

7 7 WORKING FOR THE MAN 
-Roy Orbison (London) - 
Acuff -Rose 

8 11 THE NIGHT HAS A 
THOUSAND EYES -Bobby 
Vee (Liberty)-Belinda 

9 12 HE'S A REBEL -Vicki Carr 
(Liberty) -Belinda 

10 10 THE LONELY BULL - 
Tijuana Brass (Festival) - 
Alberk 

II - BABY ELEPHANT WALK - 
The Miniature Men (Liberty) 
-Chappells 

12 - COME A LITTLE BIT 
CLOSER -The De(bones 
(Leedon) -No Publisher 

13 2 BIG GIRLS DON'T CRY - 
The Four Seasons (Festival) 
-Carne 

14 9 GUITAR MAN -Duane Eddy 
(RCA)- Chappells 

15 14 LOVESICK BLUES -Frank 
(field (Columbia) -Davis 

AUSTRIA 
This Last 
Week Week 

I 3 JUNGE KOMM BALD 
WIEDER- Freddy Quinn 
(Polydor) -P Schaeffcrs 

2 
1 WENN DU GEHST - 

Connie Francis (MGM) - 
Hermann- Schneider 

3 8 MADISON 62 -Les Chakachos 
(RCA) -Weltmusik 

4 4 ST. TROPEZ TWIST - 
Peppino di Capri (Ariola) 

5 2 DIE LETZTE ROSE DER 
PRAERIE- Martin Lauer 
(Polydor) -Weinberger 

6 9 MONSIEUR MONSIEUR - 
Petula Clark (VOSur) - 
Weinberger 

7 10 MARY ROSE- GeAtard 
Wendland (Philips) - 
Weinberger 

8 6 BABY TWIST -Will Brandes 
(Polydor) -Weltmusik 

9 7 YA YA TWIST -Joey Dee 
(Ariola/Roulette)- 
Wclimusik 

IO - RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 
Presley (RCA); (Zumeck 
and Jonny); Ted Herold 
(Polydor) 

BRITAIN 
(Courtesy New Musical Express. London) 

*Denotes local origin 
Thb Lut 
Week Week 

1 7 DIAMONI).S -Jet Harris - 
Tony Meehan (Decca) - 
Francis. Day & Humor 

2 I DANCE ON- Shadows 
(Columbia)- Sydney Bron 

3 4 BACHELOR BOY-.Cliff 
Richard (Columbia) -Elstree 
Music 

4 5 GLOBETROTTER- 
',Tornadoes (Delta) -Ivy 
Music 

5 2 RETURN TO SENDER - 
Elvis Presley (RCA) -Mono 
Music 

6 8 LIKE I DO- .Maureen Evans 
(Oriole) -Bourne Music 

7 3 THE NEXT TIME-.Cliff 
Richard (Columbia) -Elstree 
Music 

8 9 UP ON THE ROOF-.Kenny 
Lynch (HMV) -Aldon Music 

9 14 DON'T YOU THINK IT'S 
TIME-.Mike Berry (HMV) 
-Southern Music 

10 23 LITTLE TOWN FLIRT -Del 
Shannon (London) -Vicki 
Music 

il 12 COMIN' HOME BABY -Mel 
Torme (London)- Melotone 

12 13 GO AWAY LITTLE GIRL - 
Mark Wynter (Pye) -Aldon 
Music 

13 10 GUITAR MAN -Duane Eddy 
(RCA)-Shapiro-Bernstein 

14 II SUN RISE -.Rolf Harris 
(Columbia)- Ardmore & 
Beechwood 

15 6 LOVESICK BLUES- Frank 
(field (Columbia) - 
Lawrence Wright 

16 - ISLAND OF DREAMS - 
Springficlds (Philips) - 
Chappelts 

17 22 BIG GIRLS DONT CRY - 
Four Seuons (Stateside) - 
Ardmore & Beechwood 

18 - THE WAYWARD WIND - 
Frank (field (Columbia) - 
Lefleur 

19 26 ALL ALONE AM I- Brenda 
Lee (Brunswick) -Leeds 
Musse 

20 17 BOBBY'S GIRL- Susan 
Maughan (Philips) -Rush 
Music 

20 - SOME KINDA FUN -Chris 
Montez (London) -E. H. 
Morris 

22 - LOO -BE- LOO -.Chucks 
(Decca) -Peter Maurier 

23 15 TELSTAR -*Tornadoes 
(Decca)--Ivy Music 

23 16 IT ONLY TOOK A MINUTE 
-Joe Brown (Piccadilly) - 
Shapiro-Bernstein 

25 - A TASTE OF HONEY - 
Acker Bilk (Columbia) - 
Ambusador Music 

26 28 CHARMAINE- .Bachelors 
(Decca) -Keith Prowse 

27 - LOOP DE LOOP- Frankie 
Vaughan (Philips) -Chappell 

28 20 HE'S A REBEL -Crystals 
(London) -A. Schroeder 

29 30 RUBY MAN -Marty Robbins 
(CBS) -Acuff -Rose 

30 18 LET'S DANCE -Chris Montez 
(London)-E. H. Morris 

DENMARK 
(Courtesy Quart's Mwlkbureau. Copen- 

hagen) 

*Denotes local origin 
This Last 
Week Week 

1 1 RETURN TO SENDER- 
Elvis Presley (RCA) - 
Belinda 

2 2 PARADISO -Katy Bodtger 
( Polyphon(; Grote Kiitgard 
(Torso)- Multitone 

3 4 BABY TWIST-.Buster Larsen 
(Polyphon)- Multitone 

4 3 SHEILA -Tommy Roe (Karu- 
selt) 

S r BOBBY'S GIRL -Marcie 
Blaine (London) -Winkler 

6 7 THE NEXT TIME -Cliff 
Richard (Columbia) - 
Decapo 

7 5 DEAR ONE -Larry Finnegan 
(HMV)- Imudico 

g 9 QUANDO. QUANDO. 
QUANDO -Pat Boon 
(Dot); 'Dario Campeotto 
(Sorer); Tony Rents (HMV) 
-Belinda 

9 10 ST. TROPEZ TWIST - 
Les Chauts Sauvages (HMV) 

10 - MURDER SHE SAYS - 
Ron Goodwin (Parlophone) 

EIRE 

(Courtesy Teenage Express, Dublin) 
This Last 
Week Week 

I 2 THE NEXT TIME - 
Cliff Richard (Cotumbia)- 
Etatree Music 

2 1 RETURN TO SENDER - 
Elvis Presley (RCA Victor) 
-Manor 

3 5 DANCE ON -The Shadows 
(Columbia)-Sydney Bron 

4 4 GO AWAY LITTLE GIRL - 
Mark Wynter (Pye) -A)don 

5 3 LIMBO ROCK- Chubby 
Checker (Cameo-Parkway)- 
Sydney Bron 

6 - GLOBETROTTER -The 
Tornadoes (Decca) -Ivy 
Music 

7 6 THE MAIN ATTRACTION 
-Pat Boone (London) - 
Stawnc Music 

8 - IT ONLY TOOK A MINUTE 
-Joe Brown (Piccadilly)- 
Shapiro-Bernstein 

10 7 ME AND MY SHADOW - 
Frank Sinatra /Sammy Davis 
Jr. (Reprise) -Francis. Day 
& Hunter 

FINLAND 
(Courtesy Ika- SanomaL Helsinki) 

Two 
This Weeks 
Welt Ago 

1 I SEALED WITH A KISS - 
Brian Hyland (KeruselD- 
Fazer 

2 3 ESPERANZA- Johnny 
Forsell (Detect) -Faner 

3 2 MUSTA RUUSU -Veikko 
Tuomi (Odeon)- Levysavel 

4 7 SATUMAA -Reijo Taipale 
( Scandio)- Scandla 

5 4 TWISTIN' PATRICIA- 
Jerry Williams (Sorer - 
Scandia 

6 5 SEALED WITH A KISS - 
Eino Gros (Philips) -Frier 

7 6 CALLIN' DOCTOR CASEY - 
John D. Loudermilk (RCA) 
-Fazer 

8 9 TWO DARK EYES -Lill- 
Jorgen Petersen (Columbia) 
-Scandla 

9 20 AHAB THE ARAB -Irmo 
Rallio (Scandla) -Scandla 

10 10 MANHATTAN SPIRITUAL 
-The Eric Delaney Band 
(Parlophone) 

FRANCE 
This Last 
Week Week 

1 2 TOUS LES GARCONS ET 
LES WILLES- 
Francoise Hardy (Vogue) 

2 I TELSTAR -The Tornadoes 
(Decca) 

3 3 J'ENTENDS SIFFLER LE 
TRAIN- Richard Anthony 
(Columbia) 

4 5 CHARIOT -Petula Clark 
(Vogue) 

5 4 L'IDOLE DES JEUNES - 
Johnny Hallyday 
(Philips) 

6 9 TOUS MES COPAINS 
Sylvie Cartan (RCA) 

7 6 JE L'ATTENDS- Dalida 
(Barclay) 

7 LOCO -MOTION -Little Eva 
(London); Sylvie Vartan 
(RCA) 

9 8 SHEILA -Lucky Blondo 
(Fontana) 

10 10 COEUR BLESSE -LES 
BEAUX JOURS -Petula 
Clark (Vogue) 

GERMANY 
(Courtesy Aatomkten- Markt, 

Braunschweig) 
*Denotes Sonst origin 

Thb Last 
Week Week 

1 1 WENN DU GEHST - Connie 
Francis (MGM)- Viktoria 

2 2 JUNGE. KOMM BALD WIE- 
DER-.Freddy (Polydor) - 
Sikorski-Esplanade 

3 5 GAUCHO MEXICANO- 
JALISCO- Renate u. 
Werner Leismann (Arcola); 
John Buck (Warner Bros.)- 
Melodie der Welt 

4 3 DIE LETZTE ROSE DER 
PRAIRIE -*Martin Lauer 
(Polydor)- -Gerla 

5 4 FUR GARY TU' ICH ALLES 
-.Gerd Bottcher (Decca)- 
Budde: DU SCHAUST 
MICH AN (SHE'S NOT 
YOU)-.Gerd Boucher 
(Detect); Elvis Presley (RCA) 
-Abcrbach 

6 7 RETURN TO SENDER - 
Elvis Presley (RCA) - 
Aberbach 

7 8 ESO BESO -Paul Anka (RCA) 
W. Meisel 

6 BABY-TWIST-.Will Brandes 
and Elisabeth (Polydor) - 
Gerig 

9 10 SPIEGEL -TWIST -Trnde 
Herr (Polydor)- Phonoton 

10 9 MADISON IN MESICO- 
Catrin's Madison Club 
( Decca)- Melodies der Welt 

11 14 DAS KLEINE WUNDER 
VOM GROSSEN GLUCK - 
Gus Backus (Polydor) - 
Gerig; EIN BISSCHEN 
DENKEN SCHENKEN - 

Gus Backus (Polydor) -Atlas 
12 II WESTERN ROSE-.Peter 

Kraus (Polydor) -Gerig 
13 12 TELSTAR (IRGENDWANN 

ERWACHT EINNEUER 
TAG )-The Tornadoes 
(London) -Intro 

14 15 GARTENZW ERG- MARSCH- 
Billy Sonders (Ariola) -Intro 

15 16 LETS DANCE (Tanz Mit) 
-Silvio Francesco (Detect); 
Chris Montez (London,- - 
Melodies der Welt 

16 13 SURABAYA -Carmelo Corren 
Intro; BLAUER WIND 
WEHT VON MEXICO - 
Carmelo Carmen (Ariola) - 
Mclodie Der Weit 

17 17 LOVER'S LANE -Pat Boone 
(London) -Gerig 

18 18 SHEILA (ARME KLEINE 
SHEILA) -Tommy Roe 
(Philips)- Sieget 

19 20 BABYSITTER -TWIST -Rolf 
Bendix (Eiectrola) -Gerig 

20 19 RENATA -Vico Torriani 
(Detect)- Aberbach 

HOLLAND 
(Courtesy Platemkws, Amersfoort) 

This 
Week 

1 PARADISO -Anneke Gronloh 
(Philips) 

2 LAND OF HOPE AND GLORY - 
Vera Lynn (HMV) 

3 THE LOCO -MOTION- Little Eva 
(London) 

4 IT'LL BE ME-Cliff Richard 
(Columbia) 

5 SHEILA -Tommy Roe (ABC - 
Paramount) 

6 UN MEXICAIN -Les Compagnons 
De La Chanson (Columbia) 

7 BRANDEND ZAND- Anneke 
Gronloh (Philips) 

8 TELSTAR -The Tornadoes (Decca) 
9 LET'S DANCE -Chris Montez 

(London) 
10 RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 

Presley (RCA) 

HONG KONG 
This Last 
Week Week 

I 2 I'M GONNA BE WARM 
THIS WINTER -Connie 
Francis (MGM) 

2 4 Irs UP TO YOU - 
Rick Nelson (Imperial) 

3 I RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 
Presley (RCA Victor) 

4 - MEXICAN JOE -Pat Boone 
(Dot) 

5 5 RIDE -Dee Dee Sharp 
(Cameo) 

6 -- ESO BESO -Paul Anka 
(RCA Victor) 

7 7 YOUR CHEATING HEART - 
Ray Charles (ABC - 
Paramount) 

8 3 THE NEXT TIME - 
Cliff Richard (Columbia) 

9 - THAT'S. HOW I MISS YOU 
-Paul Dino (UA) 

10 - A TRUE TRUE LOVE - 
Bobby Danis (Capitol) 

HUNGARY 
(All records on Qullitone label) 

*Denotes local origin 
Two 

This Weeks 
Week Ago 

1 I TWIST - Thomu Balassa 
and his Band 

2 2 UGYE TE IS AKAROD- 
Kalalin Sarosi- Editio 

Musica 
3 3 KIT ERDEKEL- Janos 

Koos- Editio Musica 
4 4 HOLD RAGYOG A DUNAN -Eroi Szanto- Editio 

Musica 
5 5 GEZENGUZ- Zsuzsa Kond 

and Agnes Gergely- Editio 
Musica 

6 6 PERSONALITA -Kato 
Barlay -Lloyd and Logan 

7 7 PETITE FLEUR- Kormendy 
and his Band- Caroussei 

8 8 AVE MARIA NO MORRO- 
Lehel Nemeth -Southern 

9 9 0 AZ- Ilona Hollos- Editio 
Musica 

10 10 ROZSABIMBO -Josef Fonay 
-Editio Musica 

ISRAEL 

(Courtesy Ed Israel Broadcasting) 
*Denotes local origin 

This Last 
Week Week 

1 1 ALL ALONE AM I- Brenda 
Lee (Decca)- Duchess Music 

2 2 BIG GIRLS DONT CRY - 
The Four Seasons (VeeJay) 
-Bobbb Music 

3 8 SHEILA -Tommy Roe 
(ABC-Paramount)-Eager 
Music /Nitetime Music 

4 - RETURN TO SENDER - 
Elvis Presley (RCA Victor) 
-Presley /BMI 

6 IT'S UP TO YOU - 
Rick Nelson (Imperial) - 
4 Star Sales Co. 

6 5 ESO BESO -Paul Anka 
(RCA Victor)- P)anka 
Music /ASCAP 

7 9 GUITAR MAN -Duane Eddy 
& The Rcbelelles (RCA) - 
Shapiro- Bernstein 

8 3 THEORY OF RELATIONS - 
Shimon Israeli (lied Arzi)- 
ACUM 

9 4 LOVESICK BLUES - 
Frank l /ield (Columbia) - 
Lawrence Wright 

IO - FLOWERS AND GIRLS - 
Nehat Group (Kol Israel) 

-ACUM 

ITALY 
(Courtesy Masks e Muhl, Milan) 

*Denotes tonal orina 
Thb Lari 
Week Week 

1 3 ADDIO MONDO CRUDELE 
-.Peppin Di Capri 
(Carisch) 

2 1 PREGHERO- Adriano 
Celentan (Clan) 

3 2 SPEEDY GONZALES- 
Pat Boone (London); 
Peppin DI Capri (Carisch) 

4 6 LA TERZA LUNA - 
Neil Sedaka (RCA) 

S S LA PARTITA DI PALLONE 
-*Rita Pavone (RCA); 
Cocks Mazzetti (Primary) 

6 7 CHARIOT -Franck Pommel 
(VdP); *Betty Curtis (COD) 

7 4 SI 'E SPENTO IL SOLE - 
Adriano Celentano (Jolly) 

8 8 CONCERTO DISPERATO - 
Nlni Rosso (Sprint) 

9 9 ABAT- JOUR -Henry Wright 
(GC) 

10 12 IL GIORNO PHI' LUNGO - 
Robert Pray (puritan); 
Mitch Miller (CBS) 

11 II VESTITO DI SACCO - 
Pino Donaggio (Columbia) 

12 10 UN VIOLINO NEL MIO 
CUORE -Connie Francis 
(MGM) 

13 15 QUATTRO VESTITI- Milva 
(Cetra) 

14 - DESAFINADO -Joao 
Gilberto (Bluebell) 

IS - 00-KART TWIST - 
Gianni Morandi (RCA) 

JAPAN 
(Courtesy UTAMATIC, Tokyo) 

'Denotes local origin 
Thb Last 
Week Weer 

t 2 KIRIKO NO TANGO - 
Frank Nagai (Victor) - 
JASRAC 

2 I L'ECLIPSE- Colletto Tempia 
(Victor); Sono Mari 
(Polydor)- Yamaha 

3 I CANT STOP LOVING 
YOU -Ray Charles (ABC - 
Paramount); Frank Akagi 
(Polydor) -Tone 

4 4 ITSUDEMO YUME O- 
Hashi Yukio á 
Yoshinaga Sayuri (Victor) - 
JASRAC 

5 5 SPEEDY GONZALES -Pat 
Boone (Dot)- Aberbach 

6 8 VACATION -Conk Francis 
(MGM); Aoyama Mehl 
( Polydom)- Shinko 

7 9 SHINUMADE ISSHONI- 
Nishida Sachiko (Polydor) 
-JASRAC 

8 7 OHSHO- .Murata Hideo 
(Columbia} - JASRAC 

9 10 THE LONGEST DAY -Mitch 
Miller (Columbia) -EMP 

MEXICO 
(Courtesy Audbmualea) 

+Denotes local night 
This Last 
Week Week 

1 1 EL LADRON -Sonora 
Santanera (CBS) -Mundo 
Musical 

2 7 EL NIDO- *Sonora Santanera 
(CBS )-Priam 

3 S AY CARINO- Javier Solis 
(CBS) -Pham 

4 3 UN SUENO DE TANTOS - 
Amalia Mendoza and J. A. 

Jimenez (RCA); *Los 2 Oros 
(CBS) -Brambila 

5 - PA TODO EL ANO - 
J. A. Jimenez (RCA) - 

Pham 
6 2 BEYOND THE SEA - 

Ray Conniff (CBS) -Milis 
Music 

7 6 ESO BESO -Paul Anka 
(RCA) -Brambila 

8 8 SPEEDY GONZALES- 
Manlo Munoz (Musart)- 

Emmc 
9 - COSAS (Things) -Orear 

Madrigal (Gamma)- 
Pending 

10 9 EL PECADOR -Los 3 

Reyes (RCA) -Mills Music 

NEW ZEALAND 
This Last 
Week Week 

I 4 BIG GIRLS DONT CRY - 
The Four Seasons (Allied 
Ins.) -Cop Con 

2 3 LOVESICK BLUES - 
Frank (field (Columbia) - 
Davis 

3 1 BOBBY'S GIRL -Marcie 
Blanc (London) -Cop Con 

4 5 LIMBO ROCK -Chubby 
Checker (Cameo-La Gloria) 
-Alien 

5 9 THE NEXT TIME- 
Cliff Richard (Columbia) - 
Col Control 

6 7 DON'T HANG UP- 
The Orlons (Cameo -La 
Gloria)-NA 

(Continued on page 36) 
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NEWS REPORTS 

Plan Far East 
Pressing Plants 

SAN FRANCISCO -A pro- 
gram will be commenced this 
spring to set up as many as five 
record pressing plants in as many 
countries of the Far East. 

Joseph Arrigo, president of 
the J. Arrigo Organization here, 
is flying to Japan at the end of 
January for a month's visit with 
industrial leaders in Taiwan, 
Japan, the Philippines, Okinawa 
and Hong Kong. His main func- 
tion will be to discuss plans to 
set up a $100,000 manufactur- 
ing company in at least one of 
those areas now -and probably 
additional branches in the other 
countries at future dates. 

Mammoth Records in San 
Francisco would work co -oper- 
atively with the Arrigo firm and 
Oriental representatives in oper- 
ating the company. The plant 

AUSTRALIA 

'Camelot' Imports 
Flooding Market 

By GEORGE RILDER 
19 Todman Ave., Kensington, 

Sydney 
With "Camelot" now sched- 

uled for late 1963 production 
here, there has been a rush of 
imported copies of the record 
around retailer stores. Remi- 
niscent of the "My Fair Lady" 
days, Chappells, who own the 
music to "Camelot," have been 
moving strongly against infringe- 
ments. Latest word is that J. C. 
Williamson's will have the show 
into Melbourne by this Septem- 
ber. The original Broadway cast 
album will be on CBS here and 
plans are already under way for 
major promotion. 

Warner Bros. film "Lovers 
Must Learn," released in the 
States as "Rome Adventure," 
will open in Sydney late Febru- 
ary. The sound -track album has 
been rush released by Warner 
Bros. records.... Joanie Som- 
mers has been booked into the 
Chevron Hilton in Sydney for 
three weeks starting February 18. 

. Australian Record Company 
is currently promoting their 
folk singer and poetry- reader, 
Leonard Tea le. 

W & G Records of Mel- 
boume are very thrilled by the 
release on Melbourne Records 
(USA) of three Aussie masters. 
"Java" by the Johnny Hawker 
Band, "I've Got the World by the 
Tail" by Kevin Shegog, and the 
Thunderbirds "Wild Weekend." 

. Ned Miller's "From a Jack 
to a King," from Fabor Records 
(U. S.), has taken the market by 
storm. 

Among the first musical pro- 
ductions will be "How to Suc- 
ceed in Business Without Really 
Trying," due to have its premiere 
at the end of April in Sydney. 
Negotiations are now in progress 
with overseas stars to play the 
leading roles. . The Aus- 
tralian Record Company has 

itself and equipment would be 
designed and supplied by Jim 
Wright, who heads Mammoth, 
and shipped to the selected loca- 
tion. The problem with some 
Far Eastern concerns at present 
is a lack of technological know- 
how. 

The companies would receive 
master recordings from this 
country, and press them for lo- 
cal distribution. American labels 
could be pressed in the Far East 
under a contractual arrangement 
in order to expand distribution 
of popular singles and albums. 
Additionally the Far Eastern 
outlet would be equipped to 
make its own recordings of local 
talent, probably featuring Far 
Eastern music -or who knows, 
a Formosan rhythm and blues 
idol! 

Shipping costs would be saved, 
less breakage, records at lower 
cost are among the industrial 
advantages, in addition to the 
extension of good will to the 
foreign countries through estab- 
lishing employment and offering 
economic investment. Decision 
on where the first operating 
company would be established is 
expected to be made in March 
when Arrigo returns from his 
projected four -week trip. 

acquired the Palette label for 
distribution. . A.R.C. will 
release 20 rated singles which 
include "Blame it on the Bossa 
Nova" by Eydie Gorme (CBS), 
"Half Heaven, Half Heartache" 
by Gene Pitney (Musicor) and 
"Fly Me to the Moon -Bossa 
Nova," Joe Harnell (Kapp). Fol- 
lowing the patting of an agree- 
ment with Germany's Edition 
Montana, W & G will release 
Charley Tabor's single "Mexican 
Moon." Colin Cook has clicked 
with his initial outing on the 
W & G "It's Up to You," this 
is a cover version of the Rick 
Nelson original. 

Roy Farr of Essex Music has 
acquired the Australasian right 
to Samuel Bronston Music Com- 
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YEAH, BUT WHO 
GETS CUSTODY 
OF THE LABEL? 

PARIS -It is believed here 
that the divorce of Eddie and 
Nicole Barclay will alter the 
operation of the record publish- 
ing and distribution operations 
jointly owned by the couple. In- 
volved are three publishing firms 
and two recording firms in addi- 
tion to other musical and disk 
interests. Initial talk around the 
French capital is that Eddie will 
operate the Barclay label, while 
Nicole will continue to run Bel 
Air Records. At press time the 
distribution fate of such U. S. 
labels as Verve, United Artists, 
Atlantic, Kapp, Time, Cameo - 
Parkway, Supraphon, and His - 
pavox had not yet been resolved, 
but there has been talk that the 
Barclays wil divide their proper- 
ties evenly. 
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pany, Inc., and will issue the 
music from "55 Days at Peking." 
Farr has also secured Tommy 
Steele's new version of "Where 
Have All the Flowers Gone," 
recorded. by English Decca. 

EMI has acquired the U. S. 
Diamond Records for release on 
His Masters Voice.. . "Loop 
De Loop" by Johnny Thunder 
hit the market on January 24. 
Single deals made by EMI in 
elude "Cinnonon Cinder" from 
Zen on London, and "He's Sure 
the Boy I Love" by the Crystals 
from Philles on London. 

Chappel Music has lifted the 
restriction of the music from 
"The Gypsy." The first album 
will be released February 28. 
Ernest Lashmar, Chappel gen- 
eral manager, back after a long 
illness.... French artist Henri 

version of the Rolf Harris hit 
"Sun, Arise," according to Castle 
Music. 

Mike Same's ( "Come Out- 
side ") has had his first album 
scheduled for February release 
on Parlophone. 

BRITAIN 

EMI- Roulette 
Renew Contract 

By DON WEDGE 
News Editor, 

New Musical Express 

EMI Records, despite com- 
petition from other British disk 
firms, has as expected gained a 

A CHILE RECEPTION! Lorenzo Valderrama, voted top singing 
personality in Chile by readers of Discomania, receives his 
award from Odeon Record exec, Edmund* Ortuzar (right), 
while Billboard rep, Ricardo Garcia (left) applauds. 

NANA MOUSKOURI recently flew to London to record a special 
cover version of "My Coloring Book" for the Philips subsid label, 
Fontana. Pictured with the lass are Jack Baverstock, British 
a. d, r. manager, and Johnny Keating, musical director for date. 

renewal of its distribution right 
to material from Roulette Rec- 
ords of New York and its affili- 
ates. Though not stated, it is 
expected that another three -year 
deal is involved. 

Oriole breaks new ground 
with an important jazz acquisi- 
tion-an exclusive licensing 
agreement completed with the 
American Savoy label. It will 
sell in the low price range of 
$3.15. Savoy was previously 
issued here through the now in- 
operative Associated- Recordings 
firm, whose former head, D. M. 
Bennett, is now with Oriole as 
are several other key executives. 

The extension of broadcasting 
hours of BBC radio, which will 
involve extensive use of addi- 
tional music, is now expected to 
begin in April and be completed 
in July. 

Judy Garland's British -made 
musical, "The Longest Stage," 
will have it world premiere in 
London March 7. 

Visitors 
Accompanying American -born 

David Thorne here to promote 
his "Alley Cat Song," released by 
EMI, was Borje Ekberg, of Met- 
ronome Records, Stockholm. 
. . . French actor- singer -com- 
poser Serge Galnsbourg was in 
London to record an EP with 
musical director Harry Robin- 
son at the Philips studio. Rob- 
inson is due in Paris next month 
to record with Johnny Hallyday. 

Record Business 

EMI is issuing the British cast 
LP of "Carnival" on its HMV 
label although the album was 
made for MGM Records. HMV 
issues most British cast LP's ob- 
tained by EMI and this move 
avoids a clash with the Broad- 
way cast album which is issued 
on the MGM label. . . Alma 
Cogan (HMV) is recording "Tell 
Him," her current British re- 
lease, in five other languages - 
French, G e r m a n, Spanish, 
Italian and Japanese. 

Paramount Pictures brought 
forward the British premiere of 
its Elvis Presley film, "Girls, 
Girls, Girls," to January 24, so 
Decca rushed- released the RCA 
Victor sound -track LP.... Brit- 
ish music industry will lose one 
of its most valuable plug half - 
hours when BBC -TV drops 
"Juke Box Jury" February 23 
because it is staging a program 
that evening to choose the Brit- 
ish entrant for the Eurovision 
Song Contest.... Elvis Presley's 
current entry, "Return to Send- 
er," is his 50th single to figure 
in the British chart.... Decca's 
classical albums this month were 
highlighted by one of Aram 
Khatchaturian conducting the 
Vienna Philharmonic Orchestra 
in ballet music. 

DENMARK 

Jury Selecting 
Eurovision Tune 

By ARNE HANSEN 
11 Malerbakken, Holte 

A four -man jury is busy se- 
lecting the finalists for the Dan- 
ish entrant in the Eurovision 
contest to be held in London 
March 23. Some 450 tunes have 
to be gone through in order to 
pick the 10 finalists. Finals will 
take place February 23. Prior 
to the London event, Inter - 
Scandanavian TV will feature 
the top three tunes from Nor- 
way, Sweden, Finland and Den- 
mark in a special show. 

Vera Lynn had quite a hit 
around the world two decades 
ago with a tune called "Wish 
Me Luck," which was recorded 
on Decca. She sings the song 
again in a forthcoming flick, 
"Venus fra Vestoe," and has re- 
recorded the tune on HMV. 
There is also a Polydor version 
by Katy Boedtger. 

Execs from Denmark at the 
CBS convention in Paris Feb- 
ruary 4 (Nordisk Polyphon): 
W. Hamburger, managing direc- 
tor, and O. Wilsholm, label man- 
ager. 

The storm around the State 
Radio's new "Music Program" 
continues. Lately it has brought 
itself into discredit in the press 
by misusing its radio news serv- 
ice. All daily papers have now 
forbidden their journalists to 
take free -lance jobs on the pro- 
gram. 

EIRE 

Concert Hall 
Promise Bright 

By KEN STEWART 
Teenage Express, Dublin 

Members of the Concert and 
Assembly Hall Company (who 
brought Victoria de Los Angeles 
to Dublin in December) have 
been told that the Irish Govern- 
ment has guaranteed approxi- 
mately $280,000 for the build- 
ing of a concert hall in Dublin. 

"Pal Joey," the Frank Sinatra 
movie which was banned by the 
Irish film censor a few years 
ago, opened to good business at 
the Capitol, Dublin. . The 
Tornadoes, the hot British group 
whose "Telstar" is an interna- 
tional smash, will make a short 
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Irish tour soon. . . Ireland's 
Top 10, as published by Bill- 
board, is now appearing regular- 
ly in Sunday Review, one of the 
nation's leading Sunday papers. 

German Artists 
Still Cover Hits 
By JIMMY JUNGERMANN 
102 Ismaninger St., Munich 27 

German artists continue to 
cover American hits. Some of 
the latest are: Ted Harold sings 
"Zurueck An Johnny," German 
version of Presley hit "Return to 
Sender" on Polydor. . . Ariola 
has the Willy Schmid German 
version of "Limbo Rock." 
"Limelight" by Charlie Chaplin, 

played by Acker Bilk on Metro- 
nome, is one of the top instru- 
mental hits here now. 

Josephine Baker guest starred 
in Munich's Deutsches Theater 
with a program of one hour full 
of musical memories. 

HOLLAND 

Lion's Roaring 
Success Noted 

By SKIP VOOGD 
Platteniews, The Hague 

The success scored by Johnny 
Lion and his group in the popu- 
larity pools has the trade agog 
here. Lion and ensemble, called 
the Jumping Jewels, was un- 
known last year, but this year 
scored in all three teen -age pub- 

lications, and even hit high on 
Wereldkroniek, this country's 
Saturday Evening Post. 

Frank Sinatra's "The Greatest 
Years" three -LP set causing a 
stir on Capitol. . Same for 
Nelson Riddle's "Route 66" al- 
bum.... Les Compagnonos De 
La Chanson has moved out a 

reported 31,000 "Le Mexicain" 
disks since their personal appear- 
ance at the Grand Gala dyu 
Disque. 

ITALY 

Cariaggi Visits 
TV Festival 

By SAM'L STEINMAN 
Piazza S. Anselmo 1, Rome 
Pietro Quinto M. Cariaggi of 

California Records went to the 

Buyers & Sellers 

I NTERNATIONA EXCHANGE 

A convenient international directory of companies now offering their experience, facilities and services 
for the sole, distribution, exploitation or manufacture of products in the music and phonograph record field. 

MICROFON 
RECORDS 

The most aggressive record com- 
pony in Argentina 

Representing 
Audio Fidelity (U. S. A.) 

Durium (Italy) 

Supraphon (Czechoslovakia) 

AND NOW! 
Cadence - Coral - Brunswick - 
Everest - Chancellor - Canadian. 
American - Prestige. 

MICROFON ARGENTINA SRL 
Lavelle 1759, 5 Piso 

Buenos Aires, Argentina 

CANADA 

MANUFACTURERS ONE -STOPS 

DISTRIBUTORS 

WE REQUIRE 

CLOSE -OUTS & 

PROMOTIONAL 

LP RECORDS 

Extended Plays & Singles 
Send Listing & Prices to- 

MR. ALEX SHERMAN 

SHERMAN ENTERPRISES, LTD. 

29 Bayswater Ave., 
Ottawa, Canada 

ENGLAND 

IN ENGLAND 

Advertise in the 

NEW MUSICAL 
EXPRESS 

to reach your best 
record buyers 

For information write 

NEW MUSICAL EXPRESS 
23 Denmark Street 

London, W.C. 2, England 

WANTED FOR FRANCE- RECORDED 
copyrights and /or independently Fpre- 
duced ma lcrs. Also patented Invcntfer. 
And merchandise Ile- e. Highest refer. 
emcee enable. 

Suchet. 
Protlua- 

33 BoulevaM Suchet. Parts 18, 
France. 

GERMANY 
PAUL. STEGE[. (AERLIN -:NEW YORK) 
Precords. oducer of Teefunken -Deeca tTeltleci 
R Disc Jockey: Radio Aerlln 
(SF7n. Muxle Publisher: HI -FI hfusikvcr- 

Etiea G61AH. Cabtc: Sympphnmx. Bonn. 
onc: Ber1N 2L7029. Address: 

Taucntzlen atr 16, Heran \V30. Germany 

WE SEEK ONE ADDITIONAL 

RECORD LINE FOR 

GREECE, EGYPT & LEBANON 

With over 30 years' experience in 
handling records in this part of the 
world, we know you get a fair 
treatment only from the. firm that 
concentrates on your label, not ten 
or twenty or thirty others. 
If you want experience and honest 
consideration, why not write now to 

MIDDLE EAST RECORDINGS 
Evans Plomaritis, President 
4 Spurtis, Athens, Greece 

REACH THE SPANISH MARKET 

"DISCOMANIA" 

goes to the 
world of music 

and records. 

Contact: RAUL MATAS 

Au Jose Antonio, No. 32 

Madrid 13, Spain 

RECORDS 
FOR EXPORT 

All American brands com- 
bined in one shipment. 

ELTRON EXPORT COMPANY 
122 Broad St., New York 4, N. Y. 

Say You Saw It 
In Billboard 

FOR INFORMATION 
you can reach the U. 5. and World -Wide Music -Record markets 

regularly, effectively and at vary low cost in these columns. 
For information contact: 

THE AMERICAS ASIA & PACIFIC 

MEXICO: Dr. Otto Mayer -Serra, 
Apartado 8688, Mexico City 

PUERTO RICO: Anthony Contreras, 
26 Gertrudis St., Santurce 

VENEZUELA: Clemente Vargas, Jr. 
Radio Caracas 

Av. Paez, El Paraiso, Caracas 

BRAZIL: Mauricio Quadrio 
Billboard 

Rua Visconda da Gaves, 125 
Rio de Janeiro 

ARGENTINA: Ruben Machado 
Billboard B 

Lavelle 1783, Buenos Aires 
CHILE: Ricardo Garcia 

Radio Mineria, Moneda 973, Santiago 

AUSTRALIA: Brian Nebenzahl 
P. 0. Box 418, North Sydney 

HONG KONG: Carl Myatt 
27 Estoril Court, Gode, Road 

JAPAN: Robert Wynn 
521 -2 Chome, Sihimo Meguro 

Meguro.ku, Tokyo 

NEW ZEALAND: Fred Gebbie 
P. O. Box 5051, Auckland 

PHILIPPINES: Luis Me Trinidad 
264 Escape, Manila 

EUROPE 

Arthur Rosett, European Director ITALY: Samuel Steinman 
44 Curzon St., London W. 1 Piazza S. Anselme 1, Rome 

GROsvenar 7496 

Frank Luppino Jr., International Advertising Director, 
Billboard, 1564 Broadway, New Tork City 3ó 

ADVERTISING RATES INTERNATIONAL EXCHANGE 
CLASSIFIED: Per line $1. Minimum 4 lines per insertion. 
DISPLAY: Per inch $14. Minimum one inch. 

Above prices are for one insertion in one issue. Cash With Order, Please. 
Lower rates for 12, 26 or 52 insertions in a one -year period. 

Monte Carlo International Tele- 
vision Festival to examine musi- 
cal films from various lands. His 
diskery, which specializes in 
RAI artists, also produces tele- 
vision films for the international 
market. 

Composer Armando Trovajoli 
whose "Rugantino" is one of 
Rome's all -time musical stage 
hits is the father of a boy born 
in I -ondon to his wife Pier An- 
geli. "Extra I -ight" is the 
name of a new musical shown 
which Gorni Kramer will do for 
RAI's second channel with Fred 
Bongusto and Johnny Dorelli as 
key soloists. This program will 
use only Italian artists in con- 
trast to "Studio One" which fea- 
tures foreigners for the most 
part. 

MEXICO 

RCA Records 
Flick Track 

By OTTO MAYER -SERRA 
Apartado 8688, Mexico City 

RCA Victor Mexicana re- 
corded the sound track for the 
picture "De color moreno," 
starred by famed Spanish chan - 
sonniere Lola Flores and Mexi- 
can balladeer Marco Antonio 
Munit. Most of their vocal 
numbers will appear later on an 
LP. Miss Flores also recorded 
an LP of Flamenco songs, ac- 
companied on the guitar by her 
husband, Antonio Gonzalez and 
the orchestra of Chucho Ferrer. 

Early in February Chico 
O'Farrill finishes the recording 
of a "Tropical Suite," commis- 
sioned by CBS International.... 
Manolo Munoz recorded in 
Spanish for Musait the latest 
hit of Elvis Presley, "Return to 
Sender." 

Alejandro Siegrist, general 
manager of Discos Mexicanos, 
bought new recording equip- 
ment. In February he will re- 
organize his distribution in 
Puerto Rico and Venezuela... . 

In the company of New York 
lawyer Walter Hofer, Bernard 
C. Solomon, president of Everest 
Enterprises, discussed with his 
representative Mario Freidberg, 
manager of Disco Importadora, 
the launching of his catalog in 
Mexico. Disco Importadora will 
also distribute Apollo Records, 
Challenge and Colpix.... Dur- 
ing a short trip to Caracas, 
Manuel Villarreal, vice -president 
of Mexico's CBS, signed with 
La Discoteca for distribution 
in Venezuela of Columbia -CBS. ... Teodoro A. Dehesa, man- 
ager of Grever International, 
was el e c t e d president of 
AMPEM, the association of the 
independent music publishers of 
Mexico. 

Musart Records will press and 
distribute "Violinos de Ouro" 
series and the latest LP of 
Luiz Bonfa from Odeon, Brazil. 

Gamma Records issued the 
first 20 LP's from Vanguard. 

Peerless Records is press- 
ing two LP's from the Com- 
mand catalog. 

NORWAY 

Local Artists 
Make the Move 

By ESPEN ERIKSEN 
Verndens Gang, Oslo 

During the last three weeks, 
three Norwegian pop singers 
have hit the VG Top 10 charts 
for the first time. Latest entry 
is the Key Brothers on Triola, 
and prior to that, Ase Wentzel, 

in duet with Jan Holland, on 
Odeon and Arne Bendiksen also 
on Triola. 

Egil Mon Iverson A. /S. has 
done a particularly strong job 
on domestic record product. Ac- 
cording to spokesman for the 
label, Jorg Ellersen, release of 
sides by Norwegian artists is 
part of a plan. The firm be- 
lieves in issuing a group of 
domestic sides at one time, be- 
cause, as Ellersen explains, they 
tend to create interest and ex- 
citement as a group. The com- 
pany will issue another batch of 
Norwegian recordings within the 
next few weeks. The firm has 
also acquired the Bjorklund Sis- 
ters from Philips, this, another 
Norwegian singing group. Eller - 
sen also explained that the com- 
pany makes records by foreign 
artists. Forthcoming disks by 
Dario Campeotto and Gustav 
Winckler from Denmark are 
representative of this trend. 

Publishers Notes 

Swedish publisher Stig Ander- 
son, founder of Bens Music and 
Sweden Music, started a new 
publishing firm, Broadway Mu- 
sic, with the tune "Bobby's Girl." 

The Norwegian publisher 
Musikk -Huset A. /S. recently 
acquired "My Coloring Book" 
and the present hit "Midnatt- 
stange," as well as "Some Kind 
of Fun" and "Elisabeth Sere- 
nade," a German hit a year ago. 

Disk Notes 

This week's new Norwegian 
recording on the Hit Parade is 
no new record at all. The Key 
Brothers recorded their "Flenne 
land" one and a half years ago. 
They have recorded seven disks 
in Norway and four in Sweden, 
plus one in Great Britain. . 

The Cadence success, "The First 
Family," starring Vaughn Mead- 
er, was issued in Norway this 
week. 

PHILIPPINES 

Miss Wong Cuts 
Two Pop Sides 

By LUIS MA. TRINIDAD 
264 Escolta, Manila 

Elizabeth Wong, Hong Kong 
actress and singer, debuted re- 
cently on a new record label - 
EW Records. Backed by the 
Lovers Trio, who appeared by 
special arrangements with Villar 
Records. Miss Wong, who just 
finished several singing con- 
tracts here, is emplaning for the 
British colony early next month 
to handle the sales and promo- 
tion of her single on EW Rec- 
ords. She also announced that in 
mid- February, she is scheduling 
radio- television appearances for 
the Lovers Trio and herself to 
introduce their newest EW rec- 
ord in the British colony and 
probably in Taipeh and Malaya. 

Music Calendar 
The Bayanihan Dance Com- 

pany will be one of the first 
foreign companies to perform at 
the Lincoln Center for the Per- 
forming Arts in 1964. 

Chubby Checker, dance craze 
of the day, made his debut at 
the Araneta coliseum on Feb- 
ruary I. He was accompanied 
in his performance at the coli- 
seum by the 1963 international 
beauty contest winners, who will 
compose the Third Annual Pag- 
eant of World Beauty Queens, 
and the Raoul Appel Dancers. 

ADVERTISING IN 

BUBINESBPAPERB 
MEANS BUSINESS 
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SPAIN 

Industry Ideas Fonopolis Studio 
Traded at Fair In Disk Market 

By ROMAN WASCHKO 
Glogera 4, Warsaw 

Warsaw staged Poland's first 
National Disc Fair recently. It 
was organized jointly by the 
distributing firms and Polskie 
Nagrania, the leading recording 
company here. 

About 1,000 trade representa- 
tives attended and discussed 
ways of improving manufacture 
and distribution. Up to now 
people on the distributing end 
of the business have often had 
to wait three months before re- 
ceiving deliveries of the newest 
hits. 

Quite a few top variety artists 
will be appearing in Poland dur- 
ing the coming year. French 
vocalist Charles Aznavour ar- 
rives in April; in February the 
Peters Sisters make their second 
visit; in May Italy's Marino 
Marini Quartet will start its 
fourth tour of Poland. Czecho- 
slovakia's Karel Krautgarten 
Jazz Orchestra will also appear. 

Work has already begun on 
the annual jazz jamboree held 
in the fall. Biggest attraction of 
Jamboree 1962 was American 
trumpeter, Don Ellis. This year 
the Polish organizers hope to 
work together with the Czechs, 
who run a similar festival. Jazz- 
men could attend both the War- 
saw Jazz Jamboree and the one 
in Prague which is held about 
the same time. The Polish or- 
ganizer of the Festivals is the 
Polish Jazz Federation, Box 282, 
Warsaw 1. 

The Italian Radio and TV 
Network has announced that it 
will take part in this year's In- 
ternational Song Festival held 
between August 15 -18 at Sopot- 
Poland's Baltic Holiday Spot. 
Secretary General of RAI, Mr. 
Zafrani, will be on the jury. 
Other radio networks have also 
stated that they will be covering 
the event. They are radio sta- 
tions in Belgium, France, Can- 
ada, Monte Carlo, East and 
West Germany, Switzerland and 
Hungary. Twenty -three countries 
will be represented at this year's 
International Song Festival. Vo- 
calists already believed set to ap- 
pear are Liana Antonova (Bul- 
garia), Edwin Rutten (Holland), 
Shosbana Damsel (Israel), Pierre 
Feriand (Canada), Le Menestrels 
(Monte Carlo), Peter Wieland 
(East Germany), Lorna Lesley 
(Norway), Vico Toriani (Switzer- 
land), Per Lindquist (Sweden), 
Ewa Mikes (Hungary), and Lili 
Gegeliya (Soviet Union). 

SOUTH AFRICA 

Cliff Richards 

In Cape Town 
By HARRY KLEIN 

P. O. Box 1604, Johannesburg 
Cliff Richard's South African 

tour was timed to coincide with 
the nationwide showing of the 
movie, "Summer Holiday," in 
which Cliff plays the lead . . . 

he saw the film for the first time 
in Cape Town. Port Elizabeth, 
East London, Durban and Jo- 
hannesburg are also on the South 
African itinerary, after which 
Cliff and his talented Shadows 
head north to Bulawayo and 
Salisbury in Rhodesia, followed 
by a visit to Kenya where a 
special charity concert is on the 
program. 

By RAUL MATAS 
32 Av Jose Antonio, Madrid 13 

A brand -new label has been 
launched in Madrid. Fonopolis, 
formerly a recording studio only, 
has formed a record company. 
Luis Sanchez Caballero is gen- 
eral manager. Guillermo Rances 
is director and Leocadio Ma- 
chado heads the promotion de- 
partment. Allan Jones has been 
signed exclusively for Europe 
for the new label. The Blue 
Boys, Hector Falcon (Mexican) 
and Trio Ademira will also be 
released. Eddy Christy of Swit- 
zerland will be recorded next 
week. 

Disk Notes 
Sacha Distel has signed with 

Belter of Spain to make several 
Spanish versions of popular 
tunes.. . Ennio Sangiusto has 
recorded Spanish versions for 
the same label and will sing at 
San Remo's festival. 

Spanish disk jockeys have 
brought new headaches to Span- 
ish record firms. The jocks vie 
with one another to be the first 
to play new American releases 
and stimulate a demand by the 
public that cannot be filled. 

According to the big stores 
in Madrid, Barcelona and other 
large cities of Spain, year 
end sales set new records. 
The record business started the 
new year with optimism. Visits 
here by Alma Cogan, Jean 
Claude Pascal, Lidia Scotty, 
Dorothy Peterson and Josephine 
Baker, followed by Los Her - 
manos Rigual ( "Cuando calienta 
el sol ") and the Brothers Four 
(who will arrive in April and 
will record in Spanish for Hispa- 
vox), all make the coming disk 
year bright indeed. 

Columbia President Goddard 
Liberson and Peter De Rouge- 
mont, the firm's international 
director, visited Spain at the end 
of January. They probably will 
receive the gold disks awarded 
by Discomania to Ray Coniff 
(1961 and 1962) and the Cinco 
Latinos (most popular foreign 
vocal group of 1962 in Spain). 

SWEDEN 

Wahn Takes 

Gold Record 
By HENRY FOX 

Kungsgatan 56, Stockholm 

The Golden Record for 1962 
was awarded to Bengt -Arne 
Wallin for his "Old Folklore in 
Swedish Modem." Bengt -Arne 
is working on a 'IV ballet with 
music from his last recording. 

The Golden Record contest 
was arranged by Orkester jour - 
nalen. In second place was Jan 
Johansson with "Innertrio" and 
third was Harry Arnold with 
"Guest Book." 

Disk and Pub Notes 
LW- Jorgen's recording of 

"Angelique" has been released 
in the States. 

Felix Stahl, Stockholms Mu- 
sikproduktion, will go to San 
Remo Festival. He also expects 
to make deals on "Concerto 
d'amour" by Charles Wildmann, 
which he has the rights for... . 

Reuter & Reuter published the 
music of "Stop the World ..." 
and also a new song by Git 
Skiold "Min forsta karlek" (You 
Were My First Love). 

Lasse Lonndahl and Charlie 

Norman are now in Oslo with 
their new show. It opened on 
Chat Noir and appearing in it 
is also Ann -Louis Hansson. 

Duke Ellington is coming to 
Sweden and will perform in 
Malmo on February 3 and will 
be in Stockholm February 6. 
The day after he does a TV 
show, where also Alice Balm 
and the Birgit Cullberg dancers 
will appear. 

During 1962, STIM, the per- 
forming rights society, had an 
income which exceeded 1961 by 
more than one million Swedish 
kroner. This due to Melodira- 
dion and the now closed com- 
mercial radio station Radio 
Nord. 

The Spotncks had to cancel 
a tour to England in February 
as one of the members is doing 
his military service. Their last 
record, "Hava Nagila," will be 
released in England also. 

More than 800 tunes were re- 
ceived for the Swedish Song 
Contest. The winer will repre- 
sent Sweden at the European 
Song Festival in London on 
March 23. . . . Simon Brehm 
will be leaving for the States in 
February for biz talks.... Siv 
Malmkvist, who opened in her 
new show in Malmo last week, 
was a big success.... "Regniga 
natt" (Rainy Night) has sold 

more than 60,000 records. This 
record has made the young 
Anna -Lena Lofgren a new star. 

On March 9, "Electronic" 
will be shown on TV. This is 
a new show with only dance 
and music and will be produced 
by Hans Lagerkvist. The music, 
mostly Swedish Folklore, is by 
Bengt -Arne Wallin and Jan Jo- 
hansson. . . Karusell has re- 
leased "Pepino the Italian 
Mouse." Publisher for both Ger- 
many and Scandinavia is Felix 
Stahl, Stockholm's Musikproduk- 
tion. . Ehrling Musik has 
published "Everybody's Twist - 
in' " and "Se mig i ogonen 
alskling" (Schau mir nochmal in 
die Augen). 

URUGUAY 

CBS Issues New 

Musical Cast LP 
By ALBERTO MARAVI 

Montevideo 

CBS -Columbia has released, 
through Sondor, the recording 
of the musical comedy "Buenas 
Noches, Carina." This show 
stars Ana M. Campoy and Jose 

Cibrian. Issue coincided with 
the opening of the play at the 
Theatre Solis here. 

New labels to appear here 
are Time, Grand Award (Com- 
mand), Jubilee, Trans Atlas. 
These are available in mono and 
stereo all represented by Tono- 
disc, Uruguay. By the end of 
January Kapp will bring out for 
the first time in Uruguay its clas- 
sical recordings. This includes 
also two pop LP's by Brian 
Hyland and Roger Williams. 

Highest Philips sales in our 
country come from Bert Kaemp- 
fert, Hugo Blanco, Los Fronted - 
zos and Horacio Guarany. Two 
new LP's, "Polydor Hits" and 
"That Happy Feeling" (Bert 
Kaempfert), are due.... "The 
Loco-Motion" (Little Eva), "El 
Pecador" (Los Panchos) and 
"Limbo Rock" (Chubby Check- 
er) are hits. 

MGM and Verve will be re- 
leased by Clave which has had 
Strong sales with "Connie 
Francis at the Copa" and "Bing 
and Satchmo." 

ADVERTISING IN 
BUSINESSPAPERB 
MEANS BUSINESS 

TO "BOTE THN KYPIAKH" 
BEN ANHKEI Ell THN 

AMEPIKANIKHN 

MOYIIKHN 
"Never on Sunday" doesn't 

apply to American music! 

t THE GREEKS enjoy American music 
every day. 

Their tastes include rock and roll and jazz 
and all other forms of music, 

popular and classical. 
We know -we have been selling records 

in Greece for many years. 

The E.M.1. company in Athens, 
Columbia Graphophone Company of Greece Ltd., 

has a factory (pictured below) 
which is kept busy turning out records 

which are bought not only in Greece 
but all over the Middle East. 

An impressive number of these 
are American recordings. 

So goes the pattern of E.M.I.'s record business all over the world. 

That is why E.M.I. records are being pressed today for forty different countries, 

and one record in every four sold throughout the world (outside the Communist bloc) 

is made by E.M.I. 

EMI THE GREATEST RECORDING ORGANISATION IN THE WORLD 
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the nation's best selling records 

BIG HIT SINGLES 

`16428 Afraid /I'II Never Stand In Your Way Jimmie Rodgers 
=16439 Meditation / Days Of Wine And Roses Pat Boone 

16436 Release Me /Meditation Billy Vaughn 
=16421 Boss The Rumblers 
#16420 Zero -Zero / Night Theme Lawrence Welk 
#16425 Go Home Girl /You're The Reason Arthur Alexander 

*16435 Vision At The Peace Table/1 Saw Me Wink Martindale 
#16440 Pipeline The Chantays 
=16393 Matilda The String -A -Longs 

THREE SMASH HIT ALBUMS 

DAYS OF WINE & ROSES 1962'S GREATEST HITS 

Boone Pat Pat Boone 
DLP3504 DLP 3504 

Billy Vaughn Billy Vaughn 
3497 DLP 3497 DLP 

HOT ALBUMS ON DOT 
STEREO MONO 
DLP NO. DLP NO. 

25492 3492 TAMMY & ELEVEN GREAT FOLK HITS Debbie Reynolds 

25481 3481 THE LENNON SISTERS' FAVORITES 

25480 3480 STEVE ALLEN PLAYS BOSSA NOVA JAll 

25475 3475 I LOVE YOU TRULY Pat and Shirley Boone 

3472 STEVE ALLEN'S FUNNY FONE CALLS 

25465 3465 THE MILLS BROTHERS SING BEER BARREL POLKA 

AND OTHER GOLDEN HITS 

25463 3463 MATILDA The String -A -Longs 

25460 3460 CHEROKEELY SWINGS! Keely Smith 

25458 3458 A SWINGIN' SAFARI Billy Vaughn 

25457 3457 BABY ELEPHANT WALK Lawrence Welk 

25455 3455 PAT BOONE GOLDEN HITS FEATURING SPEEDY GONZALES 

25453 3453 NO ONE WILL EVER KNOW Jimmie Rodgers 

25450 3450 GREATEST ORGAN HITS Jerry Burke 

25447 3447 THE WRIGHT TOUCH George Wright 

25442 3442 THE SHIFTING WHISPERING SANDS Billy Vaughn 

i 
WALTZ TIME 

Lawrence Welk 
DIP 3499 

STEREO MONO 
DLP NO. DLP NO. 

3437 SO RARE Jimmy Dorsey 

25433 3433 12 GREAT HITS IN RAGTIME Jo Ann Castle 

25412 3412 MOON RIVER Lawrence Welk 

25406 3406 THE ANDREWS SISTERS' GREATEST HITS 

25359 3359 CALCUTTA Lawrence Welk 

25318 3318 DOUBLE SHUFFLE Lawrence Welk 

25292 3292 THE LENNON SISTERS SING 12 GREAT HITS 

25249 3249 RAGTIME PIANO GAL Jo Ann Castle 

25165 3165 BLUE HAWAII Billy Vaughn 

25157 3157 THE MILLS BROTHERS' GREAT HITS 

25119 3119 BILLY VAUGHN PLAYS THE MILLION SELLERS 

25100 3100 SAIL ALONG, SILV'RY MOON Billy Vaughn 

25071 3071 PAT'S GREAT HITS Pat Boone 

25068 3068 HYMNS WE LOVE Pat Boone 

25054 3054 THE TEN COMMANDMENTS Sound Track -Elmer Bernstein 

25016 3016 THE GOLDEN INSTRUMENTALS Billy Vaughn 
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zzvamErs 
BILLBOA i I1IiIII T PICKS 

Pap single spotlights are those singles with sufficient sales 
potential, in the opinion of Billboard's Review Panel, to achieve 
a listing in the top 50 of Billboard's Hot 100 chart. Spotlight 

7rirse7ecTedffg 'an:2e 71'i'sitcingnodn tehaulintdry t:ic'ttr"R°.8W. 
charts. Spotlight winners in other categories are selected on 
the basis of their potential to become top sellers in their 
respective aaaaa . 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

ELVIS PRESLEY 

ONE BROKEN HEART FOR SALE 
(Presley, BMI) 0,34) 

THEY REMIND ME TOO 
MUCH OF YOU 

(Gladys, ASCAP) (2:30) RCA Victor 8134 

Two rnore smash hits from Elvis. The first is a bright rocker 
with that "Return to Sender" bounce. It's also from the new 
flick "It Happened at the World's Fair." The second side 
is a pretty ballad sung with warmth over simple stmt.., 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

CHUBBY CHECKER 

LET'S LIMBO SOME MORE 
(Kalmann, ASCAP) (2:12) Parkway 862 

The Mann.Appell team writes another hit. Chuhby's on the 
limbo kick again with the sequel to his last hit. It's a smash 
that's got solid singing and danceable support. The second 
side is "Twenty Miles" (Wyncote.Lowe, ASCAP) (215). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

PATTI PAGE 

JUST A SIMPLE MELODY 
(3angnickel, ASCAP) Columbia 42671 

Patti's first for her new label affiliation is a most touching 
side. It's an easy, nostalgic ballad with the country sound. 
Her multi.tracked voice is skillfully produced. The flip is 

"Pretty Boy Lonely" (January, 8M1) (2:18) 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

BARBARA LYNN 

DON'T BE CRUEL 
(Shalimar.Presley, BMI) (2:36) Jamie 1244 

Barbara Lynn turns in an affecting vocal version of this 
Presley hit of the past. Her singing and piano work along with 
combo and chorus make the side a solid item. The flip is 

"You Can't 81 Satisfied" (Crazy Cajun, BMI) 12:05). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

DEE CLARK 

I'M A SOLDIER BOY 
(Conrad.Curtorn, BMI) (2:36) Vee Jay 487 

Strong marchingcadence feel to this side, with strong guitar 
and rhythm effects in the background. help Clark to put this 
one across in a fashion which could get it a lot of play. 
Flip is "Shook Up Over You" (Paint., HMI) (2:45). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

RAY PETERSON 

I'M NOT JIMMY 
(Pogo, ASCAP) (2:56) Dunes 2022 

This melodic side, with Ray backed nicely by chorus and 
strings, could put Peterson right back in the hit category. 
Attractive side for middlorroad dee¡ays. Flip is "A Love to 
Remember" (Pogo, ASCAP) (2:37). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

STAN GETZ 

MAHA DE CARNAVAL 
(J ungnickel-Ross, ASCAP) (2:00) Verve 10279 

A tune from "Black Orpheus," this side has a haunting 
bcssa nova theme and is well handled by Getx. Side is also a 
track in Getz' "Big Band Bosse Nova" album. Flip is "Balanco 
No Samba" (MID, BMI) (2:54). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

THE KING-PINS 

DANCE, ROMEO, DANCE 
(Premier, BMI) (2:251 Yee Jay 494 

Here's a story of heartbreak and of how m Roeo dances his 
hurt away which shapes up as a strong side with good 
vocal, bright arrangement and smart sound. Flip is "41 booby 
Our (Premier, BMI) (2:25). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

TERRY DAY 

BE A SOLDIER 
(Hilliard, ASCAP) (2:15) 

I LOVE YOU BETTY 
(Pocono, BMI) (2:051 Columbia 42678 

Doris Day's son has a mighty 'ingressive disking with these 
two sides. The first is a romping rocker done with a sound 
similar to that used with Bobby Vee. While the first has the 
edge, the second side also could get a good many calls. It's 
a ballad in a haunting groove. 

A 

KRUM 
PCT 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

KATHY KEEGAN 

THE GOOD LIFE 
(Paris, ASCAP) (2:22) Malibu 1219 

A pretty tune from the flick "The Seven Capital Sins" is 

sung with lots of feeling here by petite Kathy Keegan. Could 
move out, and adds up to solid dee¡ay programming. Flip 
is "Are Your Lips Lovely Darling," (Rusber, BM» (2:26). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

THE CHIFFONS 

HE'S SO FINE 
(Bright-Tunes, BMI) (1:531 Laurie 3152 

This all.girl group has a good sound and they show off their 
bright style with a flourish on this rhythmic waxing. It has a 

beat and it moves. Flip is "Oh My Love" (Bright-Tunes, toll 
(I:44). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

NANCY SINATRA 

I SEE THE MOON 
(Plymouth, ASCAP) (2:34) RP.* 20144 

Nancy Sinatra may have her first big hit here with this 
lovely version of a pretty new tune, affectingly sung by the 
thrush over smart band backing. It's fetching. Flip is "Put 
your Head on My Shoulder" (Spanks, BMI) (2:55). 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

THE EXCITERS 

HE'S GOT THE POWER 
(Trio, BMI) (2:32) United Artists 572 

The Exciters, who scored to heavily with "Tell Him," Id 
make it two in a row with this mighty exciting disking. They 
sell it with verve over sock support. Flip is "Drama of Love" 
(Sylvia, BMI) (2:20). 

COUNTRY SPOTLIGHT 

GEORGE JONES 

I LOVE YOU BECAUSE 
(Acuff.Rose, BMI) (2:48) Mercury 72087 

Jones should have another big one with this listenable reading 
of the Leon Payne tune. He sells it with much warmth over 
traditional country backing. Flip is "Revenooer Man" (Tr., 

COUNTRY SPOTLIGHT 

THE WILBURN BROTHERS 

:.OT THAT I CARE 
(Sure.Fire, BM!) (2:43) Decca 31464 

The boys have a strong entry here in a lovely weeper. They 
sing it with plenty of feeling with a neat vocal group 
and tinkling piano assist. Watch it. Flip is "Roll Muddy Air." (Sure-Fire, BPAI) (2:17). 

9 POP SPOTLIGHT 

DICK AND DEEDEE 

YOUNG AND IN LOVE 
(Odin, ASCAP) (2:161 Warner Bros. 5342 

The sound of the duo on Ihis teen-slanted disking, plus the big 
production work behind them could make this one take off. 
It's a big planer with a strong chance. Flip is "Say to Me" 
(Odin, ASCAP) (1:47). 

LATIN AMERICAN SPOTLIGHT 

CHARLIE PALMIERI 

AMOR FOR TWO 
Allegre 3116 

The Palmieri group is a hot one in its market and they 
should score well wilh this bright bossa nova effort. Neatly 
waxed, it could also grab some pop action. Flip is "El 
Piraguero." 

SINGLES REVIEW POLICY 
Every single sent Billboard for review is heard by Billboard's review panel, and its 
sales potential is rated within its category of music. Ratings of only the outstanding 
singles of the week are published, including all receiving a ...star review or better 

on at least one side, thus focusing attention on singles with the greatest sales pa 
tential. 0,11 reviews are presented for Spotlight Picks or Special Merit Picks. All four- 
star singles are listed within their respective categories. Flip sides are rated separately. 

(Continued on page 30) 
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KEN GRIFFIN 

kmo 

THE ENDURI NG HYMNS I KEN BRI FFIN 

AMERICAS GREATEST SELLING ORGANIST 

KEN GR N 
And His Complete Catalog of Consistent Money -makers: 
Anniversary lp 

SOngs 

CL 586 

KEN GRIFFIN 

_ J P 

CL 610 

r:74. 
1," .-.1 

Ct. 907 

LOST; IN A CLOUD 

1 
0 ) 

- _J. 
CL 662 

SEN GNIWFDrS - L 
LATIN AMERICANA 

CL 1042 

I MELODY LANE:KEN GRIFFIN 

CL 1062 

- 

CL 1289 CL 1365 

CL 1127 

KEN GRIFFINAITHEORfM 

ON THE HAPPY SIDE 

CL 1518 

Mr KEN 

GRIFFIN 

CL 1599 CL 1645 

THE SPAHKLINO 

TOUCH! 
B 

01'98H Favorites 

rigtil aul Merry 

CL 1709 CL 1811 usn 

If you're missing any of these albums, you're losing $ale$! 

COLUMBIA RECORDS 
Copyrighted 
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Billboard 
FOR WEEK L ENDING 

FEB. 9 

* STAR PERFORMERS -- selections on Chart 9 weeks or less registering greatest upward progress this week. 

150 BEST SELLERS -MONAURAL 
at Lasf 
Wook Week TIIb,Ama. Gabel 

Of 

Vaughn Meador, Cadence Cadence CCP 7060 

LY6, en 
Clint 

9 

O 2 Ar.nfihírmXnEW nelWltlS IS 

0 3 11,1 iéerlun, wLLBRITé os. w L. 4 

O S 
OL 5670 

68 

© 6 PETE!, LIULwNsEMARY 42 

® 4 it? 411N8 Chari. Byrd, Var. V $432 
22 

8 61lUI GIEUI 61ßU1 
LPM 1671 

10 9 Fhis haler. RCA VI[rer 

O II PEPINO. THE ITALIAN MOUSE d 
OTHER ITALIAN FUN SONS 8 
Leu Monte, Reprise R 6068 

10 
9 

I 157í H KEALT 
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ALBUM REVIEWS 

Pop LP Spotlights are those 

albums with sufficient sales 

potential, h the opinion of 

Billboard's Review Panel, to 

achieve a listing on Bill- 
board's Top LP's charts. Spot- 

light winners in other cate- 
gories are selected on the 

basis of their potential to 

become top sellers in their 
respective areas. 

CARAVAN 
ART BLAKEY 
JAll MESSENGERS 

JAZZ SPOTLIGHT 

JAZZ CARAVAN 
Art Blakey 8. the Jazz Mee 
engers. Riverside 9438 

Blakey and the Messengers work out of 
Meir usual strong selling bag on this LP. 
The eel it replete with tI,ee rhythm and 
punching modern soloe. Freddie Hubbard, 

Wayne Shorter and Curtis Fuller fill the 
front line solo specs. " Caravan;' "Sweet 
'n' Sour" and "Thermo" are some of the 
fine tracks. 

slJAll SPOTLIGHT 

DUKE ELLINGTON 8 
JOHN COLTRANE 
Impulse A 30 (M); AS 30 (5) 

Duke and Trane have a neat LP here. The 
album, which contains Seven tracks, features 
Duke on piano and Coltrane playing his ex- 
pansive and free -form tenor sax on all but 
one track on which he plays soprano. Stu- 
dents of modern jets will want to make 
unique comparisons between Ellington here 
and Thelonious Monk. The star -led quartet 
is mighty interesting to hear. 

DUKE ELLINGTON 
,A JOHN COLTRANE 

JLLJ17dJJZ ;lJ.194/9J71 

\ 4 

ye 

JAZZ SPOTLIGHT 

ILLINOIS JACQUET 
Epic LA 16033 (M); 
BA 17033 (S) 

The best work heard from Illinois Jacquet 
in some time graces this collection pro- 
duced by John Hammond and featuring sev- 
eral lop sidemen. These include Sir Charles 
Thompson on piano, Roy Eldridge on trum- 
pet, Kenny Burrell on guitar and Jo Jones 
on drums. Jacquet'e own work on tenor 
and alto stresses musicianship rather than 
exhibitionism. 

JAll SPOTLIGHT 

SCREAMIN' 
Brother Jack McDuff. Prestige 
7259 (M) 

McDuff's got another bag filled with blues - 
loaded tricks in this set. The organist hits 
hard one variety of blues -based tunes that 
make soulful listening. This artist gets 
good play on r.Ab. and jazz stations, and 
this set has much ammunition for future 
programming. "Soulful Stems," the current 

single "He's a Real Gone Guy," 'After 
!lours" and "Screamirí " area few. 

!porge r 

BROTHER JACK MCOUFF 

ItPOP SPOTLIGHT 

LOOP DE LOOP 
Johnny Thunder. Diamond 
D 5001 (M); SD 5001 (S) 

Thunder's first hit leads off this LP and also 
provides teen audiences with solid dancing 
and listening fare. The arrangements follow 
the style set by the hit. Chorus and thump- 
ing combo fill the background with a big 
sound throughout. Other sides that might get 
attention are "The Chain," "Ail 'Round in 
a Circle;' "Bad Man" and the obvious 
follow up to the hit 'Zoo- LeeOh." 

FUIT ®OBI 

JOHNNY THUNDER 

C, 

1 POP SPOTLIGHT 

ALL THE HITS BY 
BOBBY RYDELL, VOL. 2 

Cameo C 1040 (M); 
SC 1040 (5) 

Rydell scored well with an earlier package 
of bigg hits by other artists, and this 'lit ume 2 edit; on can register equally well. The 
set is mighty timely, too, with Rydell 
renditions of such current and recent items 
es "Bobby's Girl," "Loop De Loop;' "Up 
on the Roof," "Remember 
Gonna 8e Warm This Winter," among others. 

war, 4L net MM tbue tee tmn 
WIN., n cum a xtai tMn exitr 
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-i 
Willis Jack on 

BOSSA NOVA PLUS 
I LEFT MY HEART IN SAN FRANCISCO 

11'hat rvinll ()f Fool Am I'front 
11, rritl 11 ,Inl '1-,r Gt.( ()ff 

JAll SPOTLIGHT 

MONEY JUNGLE 
Duke Ellington with Charlie 
Mingus 8, Max Roach. United 
Artists Jazz 15017 (S) 

This trio recording featuring Duke Elling- 
ton, Charlie Mingus and Max Roach is a 

memorable one, not only for the historical 
importance of the three playing together, 
but because the music they make is mem- 
orable itself. Here is a wonderful Duke 
on piano, superb work Hom Mingus and 
sold rhythm support from Roach. 

xr rnnii;s 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

LAWRENCE OF ARABIA 
Sound Track. Colpix CP 514 
(M); SCP 514 (S) 

"Lawrence of Arabia" is one of the most 
acclaimed of recent motion pictures. The 
background music sound track could easily 
tallow suit. addition to the 13 varied 
themes, the package also contains an elabo- 
rate booklet describing the legend of 
rence, the players in the picture, and in- 
cluding colorful, foldout photo inserts. 
Should be must merchandise for dealers. 

JAZZ SPOTLIGHT 

BOSSA NOVA PLUS 

Willis Jackson. Prestige PR 

7260 (M) 
Title is e bit misleading here, for the al- 
bum contains Jackson's current instrumental 
"I Left My Heart in San Francisco" which 
is e big juke box and r.8b. seller. There's 
bossa, too, of course, and other Latin. 
tinted rhythms. Some of the better tracks 
by the tenor sexist are "Amor," "Mama 
Inez' and "Shuckin'." 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

MY DAD 
Pool Petersen. Colpix CP 442 
(M); SCP 442 (S) 

Paul Petersen, after several earlier solid 
singles successes, is currently represented 
with "My Dad," which has been a good 
Top 10 entry. Here's the personable young 
TV performer with the hit title tune plus 
what are called "My Dad's Favorite Tunes,' 
oldie items like "Try a Little Tenderness," 
"Goody Goody," "I Only Nave Eyes for 
Yoe," etc. Fans should grab it up fast. 

It 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

PAUL 8 PAULA SING FOR 
YOUNG LOVERS 
Philips MOM 200078 (M); 
PHS 6000078 (S) 

The young duo has slicked but big with the 
first single outing, "Hey Paula" (No. 2 in 
the Hot 100 this week), and Philips figures 
to cash in nicely with this fast album re- 
lease. Tunes are a mixture of oldie hits 
like "Hey Baby" and "Come Softly to Me" 
and newer 'rems e "Don't Let It End" 
and "Blue Roller Rinlikk." Good wax. 

POP SPOTLIGHT 

MARCH ON, BROTHERS 
The Highwaymen. 
United Artists UAL 3245 (M); 
UAS 6245 (S) 

The Highwaymen come through with a strong 
offering that should sit well with the 
group's fans. Folk songs of the United States 
and Argentina, South Africa, Canada and 
Scotland are included. The singing is well 
balanced. "Marianne," "Pretoria," "I Know 
Where I'm Going" and John" are some 
of the better tracks. 

LATIN AMERICAN SPOTLIGHT 

LET'S DO THE BOSSA NOVA `r Tito Rodriguez 6 His Ork. 
United Artists UAL 3262 (M); 
UAS 6262 (S) 

Tito Rodriguez is e hot seller in the Latin 
American and pep fields, and this new al- 
bum should turn into a sock seller in both 
markets. The orkster features the new bossa 
nova rhythm, played ie sparkling fashion by 
his Latin aggregation. Tunes include 'Otra 
Vez," "Un Pats, 0 Pato" and "Re Domingo 
Sin Ti." 

SPECIALTY SPOTLIGHT 

FEEL GOOD! LOOK GREAT! 
Debbie Drake 
Epic LN 24034 (M) 

A package designed for sales. Where TV 
exercise queen Debbie Drake is seen regu- 
larly, it should do especially well, but it 
can rack up consistent sales elsewhere too. 
There are 38 different exercises. Each is ex- 
plained first by Debbie, then accompanied 
by the Noel Regney Ork. A folder also finds 
Miss Drake illustrating each dance through 
e series of 192 photos. 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

') ) STRAUSS: DIE FLEDERMAUS 
(2 -12") 
Various Artists. London 
A 4249 (M); OSA 1249 (S) 

The witty and lovely Strauss operetta re- 
ceives a wonderfully warm performance 
here. Hilde Gueden, Erika Koth, Regina 
R e s n k, Giuseppe Zampieri, Waldemar 
Kmentt, Walter Berry and the rest of the 
fine cast, plus the Vienna Philharmonic 
under Herbert Von Karajan, help make 
this an exceptional recording. 

- 

LOW PRICE POP SPOTLIGHT 

GILBERT 8 SULLIVAN: 
H.M.S. PINAFORE (2 -12 ") 
The D'Oyly Carte Opera Com 
pony (Isidore Godfrey, Cond.). 
Richmond RS 62003 

New stereo versions of the Gilbert 8 Sell, 
van operettas has brought about the re- 
releases at bargain prices of the old stand- 
ard mono recordings. This great etching of 
"Pinafore" is outstanding, featuring Marlyn 
Green's performance as Sir Joseph Porter, 
still unexcelled, and fine supporting work 
by other Savoyard favorites. 

oaet.a evW..t 

tOieetw 

VON KARAJAN 
BR AI NS THIRD SYMPHONY 

'MACK; triT8811121i 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

BRAHMS THIRD SYMPHONY 
Vienna Philharmonic Orch. 
(Von Karojan). London CM 
9318 (M); CS 6249 (S) 

A flowing, mellow, understanding reading 
of the third of Brahms' four symphonies, 
coupled with a distinguished performance 
of one of Brahms' lesser known concert 
works. The third movement of the son, 
Phony I"Poco allegretto') is graceful and 
lyrical. Stereo work is first- class. 

THE BEST OFTEEr n" 

..j? 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

THE BEST OF TEBALDI 
Renato Tebaldi. London 5729 
(M); OS 25729 (S) 

For fens of the Italian diva, this should 
be a natural, packaging as it does some 
of her most illustrious performances. It is, 
in effect delightful sampler, with 
generous sprinkling of Puccini (arias from 
"Madame Butterfly," "TUrandot," "Le 
Boheme" and "Tessa ") and items from 
Mefistofele," "Andrea Cheníer" and others. 

Bound to be a seller. 

JOHN 

SUTHERLAND 
7NE.1RT OF 77/E PRifti /X1.1.1:1 POL. d 

THE THE PRIMA 
DONNA, VOLS. I 2 
Joan Sutherland. London 5601, 
5602 (M); OS 25232, 25233 (5). 

Joan Sutherland is showcased here in two 
albums (the first of which was issued 
earlier and has been repackaged) which 
are bound t0 strop9 merchandise. Each 
album e a selection of great irly donna 
arias and her superb voice fairly "listens. 

Nome," 
include "The Bell "Caro 

Nome;' 'the Jewel Sony;' among others. 
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LOW PRICE 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

VERDI: AIDA 13.12 ") 

Renata TebaIdi 

Richmond RS 63002 

This is a real bargain for the money. Renata 
TebaIdi, as Aida, Mario Del Monaco as 

Oedemas, plus e first rate cast and the 

chorus and orchestra of the Accadeeeie Di 

Santa Cecilia of Rome, make this a potent 
item even at regular price, and e solid one 

with three LP's for less than 58. There 

should be steady sales on this. 

LOW PRICE 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

PUCCINI: TOSCA (2 -12 ") 

Renale Teboldi 

Richmond RS 62002 

Puccini is still one of the popular favorites 
whose scores are among the most melodic 
'n all oVVera, and therefore most elfropriate 

for the Butte collector and impulse buyer. 
"Madame Butterfly" is e part el this con 
tinning reiseue program on the London low 
price line and this Tosco" set is an equally 
important addition to the line. The TebaIdi 
name, el course, will meen sales, but the 
budget aspects are mighty attendee too. 

en 
LOW PRICE 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

GILBERT 8 SULLIVAN: 
THE MIKADO (2 -12") 
The D'Oyly Carte Opera 
Company (Isidore Godfrey, 
Cond.) 
Richmond RS 62004 

The great G 8 S interpreter, Martyn Green, 
is here and that's about all that's required 
to make this colorful D'Oyly Carle package 
a budget. priced winner. It's part of London's 
continuing program of presenting classic op. 
era and G 8 S items, formerly fullpriced 
London entries in this new reissue series, 
ideal for rack locations and dealers wishing 
to offer customers a great deal fora small 
price. 

LOW PRICE 

CLASSICAL SPOTLIGHT 

PUCCINI: LA BOHEME (2 -12 ") 

Renato Teboldi 

Richmond RS 62001 

Here's a reissue that should draw a good 
deal of attention. The oast is led by Renate 
Teboldi with the Orchestra Accademia di 
Santa Cecilia, Rome, under the direction of 
Alberto Erede. Combination of line perform- 
ances, low price, the Teboldi name and the 
popularity of " Boheme" should make this 
seta consistent seller. 

SPECIAL MERIT PICKS 

POP SPECIAL MERIT 

SUNNY'S GALLERY OF FOLK BALLADS 
Sunny Schwartz. Cameo C 1030 (M); 
SC 1030 (S) 

Sunny Schwartz H e coed at the University 
of Pennsylvania, and she is also a talented 

young singer in the current popfolk tradi 
Rion. With a clear and limpid voice some 
what in the manner of Joan Baez, and a 

feeling for folk music, she turns in reward. 
Ing performances of "Maid of Constant Sor- 

row,' "Dirty Old Town,' "Little Brown 

Dog" end "The Water Is Wide." Sunny is 

a freshman to keep an eye on. 

(r J JAZZ SPECIAL MERIT 

DUKE ELLINGTON MEETS COLEMAN 

HAWKINS 

Impulse A 26 (M); AS 26 (S) 

Here's one for the collectors. It's a brand 
new recording of Duke, surrounded by e 

group of the king -Pin sidemen from the big 
band, playing with the indefatigable Hawk. 
It's a solid album of swing and beautiful 
ballad interpretation keynoted by the Duke's 

powerful pianistics, Hawk's tenor, alto by 

Johnny Hodges and trombone Lawrence 

Brown. 

Best Track: "Limbo Jazz" (Tempo Music, 
ASCAP) (5:20). 

CLASSICAL SPECIAL MERIT 

RENAISSANCE FESTIVAL MUSIC 
New York Pro Musico. Decca DL 9419 
(M); DL 79419 (S) 

A thoroughly delightful concert done with 
impeccable taste by Noah Greenberg's es- 

teemed ensemble. The early musk repre- 

sented here is from both Flemish and 
Venetian sources of the 16th and 17th 
centuries and includes a series of dances 

by the Flemish Tiemman Susato. The re- 

mainder of the program contains dance 

pieces by Viadana, Gabrieli, Grillo and 
Maschera. Recorders, viols and the ancient 
treble cornett are among the fascinating 
archaic instruments employed. 

4-STAR REVIEWS 

l ®J JAZZ SPECIAL MERIT 

IMPRESSIONS OF PHAEDRA 

Special Merit Picks are new releases of outstanding 
merit which deserve exposure and which could bete 
cof 

muommerci sic. 
al success within their respective categories 

(t) J JAll SPECIAL MERIT 

YEAR OF THE IRON SHEEP 

Ken McIntyre. United Artists Jazz UAJ 

14015 (M); UAJS 15015 (S) 

The title for this album is derived from the 

Tibetan calendar (now there's a far -out bit) 

since McIntyre was born in "The Year Of 

The Iron Sheep." Third album outing for 

McIntyre (first for UA), it's a showcase for 

medium. length compositions all by McIntyre, 
except for the MercerRaksin "Laura." Mc- 

Inlyre's work on alto and flute is exciting 

and lyrical, and worth hearing as a new 

direction in scored jazz. 

The Oliver Nelson Ork. United Artists 

Jazz 15019 (S) 

A lot of effort obviously was lavished on 

these big band jazz arrangements of themes 

from the Jules Dessin film, "Phaedra." The 

Oliver Nelson orchestra offers some original 
end striking variations in the main moods 

required, in producing a disk of significant 
merit. Phil Woods provides some sax solos 

charged with intense emotion. Disk can win 

a following. 

LOW PRICE CLASSICAL 
SPECIAL MERIT 

GILBERT 8 SULLIVAN: IOLANTHE 
(2 -12 ") 

The D'Oyly Carte Opera Company 
(Isidore Godfrey, Cond.). Richmond RS 

62005 

This album was a first -rate monophonic 

Performance when it first appeared on London 

label; on Richmond, it's still first -rate, with 
Martyrs Green again creating the "Lord 

Chancellor" role as though It had been 

penned for him. Alan Styles as "Strephon" 
and Margaret Mitchell as "Phyllis" sing 

with grace and ease. A package well worth 

commending to Savoyards. 

CLASSICAL SPECIAL MERIT 

LET'S MAKE MEMORIES 

Floyd Tillman. Cimarron CLP 2003 (M) 

Tillman is one of the veterans of the 

country music business as both artist and 

as cleffer of some of the great tunes like 
"Slippin' Around," "I Love You So Much 

It Hurts" and "It Makes No Difference 
Now." His most famous perhaps is the 

second -named of the tunes and this is In- 

cluded along with "Each Night at Nine," 
"I Don't Care Anymore" and "Drivin' 
Nails in My Coffin." Leon McAuliff and 

members of his band do the stylish back- 

ings. Solid collector wax. 

CLASSICAL SPECIAL MERIT 

REQUIEM FOR SOLOISTS, CHOIRS, OR- 
CHESTRA AND ORGAN, OP. 9 

Maurice Di nefle. Epic LC 3856 (M); 
BC 1256 (5) 

A distinguished new addition to the re- 

corded repertoire of religious works, this 

album has already been awarded a "Grand 
Prix de Disque" in France, where it was 

recorded. Ourufle's "Requiem" is flowing 
and inventive, based as it is on Gregorian 

themes, and is lyrically inspirational rather 

than sorrowful or fear inspiring. Recording 

is excellent from a sound standpoint, and 

the performance (under the baton of the 

composer) is really first -rate. 

INTERNATIONAL SPECIAL 

MERIT 

RAINS IN THE TROPICS 
Gene Rains Group. Deese DL 4348 (M); 
DL 74348 (S) 

The exotic sounds conjured up by Rains' 

quartet are basically a jazz form, with 
long, flowing lines but with unexpected ac- 

cents of percussion, Burmese bells, and 

other oddball tropical instruments. Ad- 

mittedly for sophisticated tastes, the album 

should draw sales from Rains fans and 

from deejays on the hunt for unusual instru- 
mentals. Most songs have a Hawaiian in. 
Iluents, but there are a few Hollywood 

tunes such as Mancinïs "Lonely Winter" 
and Victor Young's "Song of Delilah." 

The 4Star rating is awarded new albums 
with sufficient commercial potential in their 
respective categories to merit being stocked 
by most st dealers, one -stops and rack jobbers 
handling that category. 

POPULAR 

* * ** HELLO ITALY 
The Ames Brothers. Epic LN 24036 
(31); BN 26036 IS) 

* * ** GRAND STYLE 
Bud Herrmann. World Pacific WP 
1809 (M) 

* * ** JAN PEERCE ON 
BROADWAY 

United Artists UAL 3248 (M); VAS 
6248 (S) 

* * ** MUSIC TO REMEMBER 
FROM MUTINY ON THE BOUNTY 

AND OTHER MOTION PICTURE 
SELECTIONS 

United Artists VAL 3249 (M); UAS 
6149 (S) 

JAIL 
* * ** THE BROTHERS 

Stan Getz with Zoos Sims A AI Cohn. 
Prestige 7252 (M) 

* * ** MATADOR 
Kenny Dorham. United Ards. Jarx 
(5007 (S) 

* * ** VI REDD: BIRD CALL 
Celled Arttsls Jazz 15016 (S) 

* * ** CHARLIE BARNET? I . I 

Ave A -10 (M) 
* * ** SUBCONSCIOUS -LEE 

Lee Konitz with Lennie Trlslano. 
Prestige PR 7250 (M) 

* * ** THE PEACEFUL SIDE 
Billy Strayboro. United Attests Jazz 
UAJS 15010 (SI 

CLASSICAL 

* * ** GOEB: SYMPHONY NO. 4 

DRUCKMAN: DARK UPON THE 
HARP 

Japan Phllharmonle Symphony Or- 
chestra (Akeo Watanabe, Cond.) Jan 
De Caetan, N. Y. Brass Quintet 
Composers Recordings CRI 167 (M) 

COUNTRY 
* * ** HARRY GLENN PRESENTS 
MUSIC COUNTRY STYLE 

Various SCSI.. Glenn CL 1 (M1 
* * ** ANOTHER NIGHT TO CRY 

Lonnie Johnson. Blueeville BV 1062 

(M) 

RHYTHM A BLUES 

* * ** SONNY IS KING 
Sonny Terry. Bluesvllle BY 1059 (MI 

POLKA 
* * ** HAPPY POLKA DANCE 
PARTY 

Don Peechey. Cadet CDTLP LOI (MI 

* * ** GOLDEN WALTZES LI'L 
WALLY STYLE 

Jay Jay 1053 011 

Atlantic Releases 

English Hit Here 
NEW YORK -Atlantic Rec- 

ords is releasing in the U. S. 
the current English hit "Dance 
On," by the Shadows. The disk, 
one of the fastest -breaking hits 
in British history, features the 
instrumental group which acts 
as support to Cliff Richard. 

The Shadow disk, like Rich- 
ard product, is produced for 
Columbia, EMI's English label, 
by Norrie Paramour. Paramour 
also made the Frank Ifield hits 
released here on Vee Jay. 

Atlantic's sister label, Atco, 
has been particularly effective 
with foreign imports. Mr. Acker 
Bilk and Bent Fabric disks were 
the label's top sellers in 1962. 

Verve Promotes 
Bosie's Tour 

NEW YORK -A saturation 
promotion is being conducted by 
MGM offshoot Verve Records 
to utilize Count Basie's current 
string of 26 major one- nighters 
as a promotional impetus for 
the Count's recent album re- 
lease, "On My Way and 
Shoutin' Again." 

Posters in each of the tour 
cities are crediting the Count 
as an MGM -Verve personality, 
and are displaying the album. 
Radio stations in each city are 
also the target for promotions 
by local distributors, and spe- 
cial point - of - sale materials 
(streamers, newspaper mats) are 
being distributed. The current 
tour started in Newark, N. J., 
January 25 and will conclude 
at the Civic Arena in Pittsburgh 
on February 28. 

RIIIIIIIIIIBIIIIIIIIIIInIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII11m11118111111111111111110111111111001 

TELDEC LANDS 
'3 PENNY OPERA' 

BERLIN -Teldec has landed 
the original cast rights to the 
forthcoming million dollar West 
German movie production of 
"Three Penny Opera." The film, 
which is the largest since the 
end of World War II produced 
in West Germany, stars Curt 
Jurgens, Hildegarde Neff and 
Sammy Davis Jr. 

iBUUmnnmmmnilnmlllllunmumnunumnmmnnumnmmunnl 

* NATIONAL BREAKOUTS 

MONO 

GLORIA LYNNE AT THE LAS VEGAS 

THUNDERBIRD . , , 

Everest BR 5208 

SONGS I SING ON THE 

JACKIE GLEASON SHOW . , , 

Frank Fontaine, ABC -Paramount ABC 442 

BIG BAND BOSSA NOVA . . . 

Enoch Light 8 His Ork, Command RS 844 

STEVE LAWRENCE WINNERS! ... 
Columbia CL 1953 

LENA LOVELY AND ALIVE .. , 

Lena Horne, RCA Victor LPM 2581 

STEREO 

SINATRA -BASIE . . 

Frank Sinatra d Count Basle, 
Reprise R9.(008 

JOHNNY'S GREATEST HITS , . . 

Johnny Mathis, Columbia CS 8634 

THE COLORFUL PETER NERO . 

RCA Victor LSP 2618 

* NEW ACTION LP's 
These new albums, not yet on Billboard's 
Top LP's Chart, have been reported getting 
strong sales action by dealers in major mar. 
kets. 

MONO 

BRAZIL, BOSSA NOYA A BLUES . . . 

Herb(e Mann, United Artists VAI 14009 

WALK RIGHT IN ... 
Rooftop Singers, Vanguard YES 9123 

SURFBEAT . 

Challengers, Vault LP 100 

1962's GREATEST HITS BY 

BILLY VAUGHN ... 
Dot DLP 3497 

OUR MAN IN NASHVILLE . 

Chet Atkins, RCA Victor LPM 2616 

DION SINGS LOVE CAME TO ME . . . 

Laurie LLP 2015 

MY COLORING BOOK .. . 

Sandy Stewart, Colpix CP 441 

LET'S GO! WITH THE ROUTERS . , , 

Warner Bros. W 1490 

MY COLORING BOOK . , . 

Kitty Kallen, RCA Victor LPM 2640 

THE NEW CHRISTY MINSTRELS 

IN PERSON 
i9.4( Columbia CL 

OUR MAN IN HOLLYWOOD . 

Henry Mancini, RCA Victor LPM 2604 

DO THE BOSSA NOVA WITH 

HERBIE MANN ... 
Atlantic 1397 

THE 
miIGO PericoHI 

HITS 
ITALY 

. 

.1489 

MORE FOLK SONGS . . . 

Allan Sherman 8 His Friends, 
Jubilee LP 5019 

ROGER WIWAMS COUNTRY STYLE ... 
Kapp KL 1305 

STEREO 

LORD'S PRAYER, VOL II . 

Mormon Tabernacle Choir, 
Columbia MS 6367 

A LAWRENCE WELK SING- ALONG 

PARDT , , 

Dot LP 
Y 

25432 

CONNIE FRANCIS SINGS MODERN 

MGA LSE 4102ORITES 

1962'S GREATEST HITS BY 

BILLY 
DLP 

VAUGHN 
Dot 2. 9 

R ARE BIAMBERLAIN SINGS , . . 
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snip( SPECIAL MERIT -POP 
Hal DISK JOCKEY PROGRAMMING 

KENNY BALL & HIS JAZZMEN 

NUAGES (CLOUDS) 
(BIEM) (2:35) Kapp 509 

The great Django Reinhardt tune is given a mighty smart read- 
ing by the British trad hitmakers. Side has something of the 
quality of "Petite Fleur," and it can grab good on- the -air a 

otention. Flip is "Hazelmere" (2:35). 

Sfiai SPECIAL MERIT -POP 
q ¡ °Kl DISK JOCKEY PROGRAMMING 

THE PETE JOLLY TRIO 

LITTLE BIRD 
(WalfMills, ASCAP) (2:18) A. 116 

A light, smart and highly listenable bossa n 

v 

effort by the 
stylish combo. Lots of sparks and charm and solid spin fare. 
Flip is "Falling in Love With Love" (Chappell, ASCAP) (2:20). 

Stain SPECIAL MERIT -POP 
HE 

DISK JOCKEY PROGRAMMING 

SERGIO FRANCHI 

THE GOOD LIFE 
(Paris, ASCAP) (2:18) RCA nnat. 8149 

Here's a delightful tune from the film, "The Seven Capital Sins," 
sung with verve and romantic style by Franchi. Arrangement 
is a winner too. This ballad performance should grab much 
play. Flip is "Bella Nina" (Earl, ASCAP) (2:39). 

SflC1A1 SPECIAL MERIT -POP 
% TOI DISK JOCKEY PROGRAMMING 

HENRY WRIGHT 

ABAT -JOUR 
(Marks, BMI) (2:15) 

ROMEO 
(Marks, BMI) (2:15) COD 10902 

"Abat- Jour" is a big hit on the Continent, especially in Italy. 
The hit and the flip presents both original and English 
language versions. It could provide jocks with a change of 
pace programming feature. 

It*** 
FOUR STAR SINGLES 

The four star rating is awarded new singles 
with sufficient commercial potential in their 
respective categories to merit being stocked 
by dealers, one -slops end rack jobbers han- 
dling that category. 

POPULAR 

GLORIA LYNNE 
* * ** I'll Buy You a Star (Chap- 
pell) (1:451 - * * ** Record Com 
pang Blues (Glo -Mor, BMI) (2:55). 
EVEREST 2023 

TIMBERLAND FOUR 
* * ** Hummingbird (Ross Jung - 
nickel, ASCAP) (2:25) -* * ** Bring 
the Water, Sylvia (Beau -Tex -Dandelion, 
BMI) (2:10). JANINE 1236 

RONNIE CALAIR 
* * ** Sticks and Stones (Sergeant, 
ASCAP) (2:451 -* * ** How's That 
Crab You (Joy, ASCAP) (2:16). RE- 
PRISE 20143 

DON BRANDON JOHNNY RIVERS 
* * ** Here Comes Trouble (4 -Star, * * ** If You Want It. I've Got It 
BMI) (2 :36) -* * ** Pay the Game (Golden West Melodies, BMII (1:471- 
(4 -Star. BMII (1:541. CHAI.I.ENGE * * ** My Heart Is in Your Hands 
9183 (Travis, BMI) (2 :04). CAPITOL 4913 

EMILY EVANS 
* * ** A Cake and a Candle 
(Champion-Moss-Rose, )35111 (0011- **** Just Another Fool (Dande- 
lion- Cape -Ann, BMI) (2:11). JAMIE 
1242 

LETTERMEN 
* * ** No Other Love (DLney, 
ASCAP( (2:321 - * * ** Heartache 
Oh Heartache (Robin Hood, BMI) 
12:431. CAPITOI. 4914 

BILL DOGGETT AND HIS COMBO 
* * ** Soda Pop (Islip, BMII (2061 -* * ** Hom Fat (Islip, BMI) 
(2:31). COLUMBIA 42689 

BOB DYLAN 
* * ** Mixed Up Confusion (M. 
W'Itmark, ASCAP) (2 :26) - * * ** 
Corriva Cortina (M. WBmark, 
ASCAP) (2 :40). COLUMBIA 42656 

JOHNNY WATSON 
* * ** That's the Chance You've 
Got to Take (O- Cal- Jowat, 8511) 
(3:10) - * * ** Cold, Cold Heart 
(Acuff -Rose, RMN) (2:30). KING 5716 

CHARLY TABOR 
* * ** Mexican Moon (Hellos, 
BM11 (2:01) - * * ** Caucasian 
Melody (Hellos, BMII 12:301. RUST 
5055 

THE CRICKETS 
* * ** My Little Chi (Cricket, 
BMII (1:55) -* * ** Teardrops Loti 
Like Raba (Cricket -Salina, BN11) 
(1:451. LIBERTY 55540 

ROSEMARY CLOONEY 
* * ** The Rose and the Butterfly 
(Young, ASCAP) (2:35) - * * ** I 

Will Follow You (Leeds, ASCAP) 
12:37) REPRISE 20145 

GENE McDANIEI.S 
* * ** The Puzzle (Regent, 0511) 
(2:09) -* * ** Cry Baby Coy (Cen- 
tury, 135111 (1156). LIBERTY 55541 

THE COASTERS 
* * ** Bull Tick Waltz (Cotillion, 
BMI) (2:25) - * * ** The P.T.A. 
(Ailkd, ASCAP) (2 :34). ATCO 6251 

MEGATONS 
* * ** Little Atom (Whitecap, EMI) -* * ** Walklo (Whitecap, BMI) 
FOREST 046 

ERNIE K -DOE 
* * ** Re Sweet (Shlrlit, HMO (2:27) -* * ** Easier Sald Than Done 
(Minit, BMI) (2:18). MINIT 661 

RON MARSHALL 
* * ** Roseanne (Frank, ASCAP) 
(2:46) -* * ** Hold Me Ciase (Mo. 
ASCAP) (2:35). MOHAWK 134 

RICHIE ALLEN 
* * ** Sunday Pknk (Travis. BMI) 
(2:09) -* * ** Butterscotch (Travis. 
ASCAP) (1154). IMPERIAL 5917 

CARY PAXTON 
* * ** We're Going Back Together 
(Pamper, BMI) (2:25) - * * ** It 
Had to Be You (Remick, ASCAP) 
(1:59). CARPAX 44172 

TERESA BREWER 
* * ** The Thr111 Is Gone (MRC, 
BMI) (2:16) - * * ** She'll Never 
Love You (Like I Do) (Dickinson, 
ASCAP) (2:03). PHILIPS 40095 

(Continued on page 37) 

DANNY 

WHITE 

KISS TOMORROW 
GOOD -BYE Frisco =104 

AMOS 

MILBURN, JR. 

RON -DELS 

GLORIA Shalimar #105 

TINA b/w MATILDA Shalimar ;104 

Distributed by 

ARLEN RECORDS 
1320 South Howard St. Philadelphia, Pa. 

ITALL STARTED RIGHT HEAH! 
One afternoon, three months ago, WINS' Stan Z. 

Burns (with that fellow who sounds like JKF, below) played 
an excerpt from a brand new album called "The First 
Family." It was one of those first -time -anywhere things. 

The overwhelming success of Vaughn Meader's al- 
bum is one in which we are happy to have made a sub- 
stantial contribution. And it illustrates an important point 

about WINS. We play "hits" before they're hits because 
our audience has come to expect us to do so. We also 
play the established best -sellers, but always keep a sharp 
ear tuned for the new talent, new music and new enter- 
tainment we know appeals to WINS listeners. 

It's a pleasure to have our judgment verified in 
Ars such a smashing 

WESTINGHOUSE BROADCASTING COMPANY INC. 
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News -Fills Cut Disk Air Time 
By CHARLES SINCLAIR 

NEW YORK - The news- 
paper strike in New York, now 
apparently headed for its third 
month without let -up, continued 
to bring mixed feelings to the 
city's leading music -and -news 
stations last week. 

Revenue still poured into the 
top radio outlets from ad budg- 
ets which would otherwise have 
gone to print media. WINS, for 
example, figured that it had 
grossed at least 40 per cent 
above our usual spot billings" 
since the strike began. And, in 
general, radio stations were do- 
ing better than the city's six 
commercial TV channels in 
landing extra revenue. 

Deejays and music program- 
mers, however, were getting 
more than a little weary of the 
strike. Newscasts and news fea- 
tures were being stepped up 
anywhere from 10 per cent to 
50 per cent more than normal. 

Cuts Into Music 
Sometimes, as in the case of 

WNEW's substitution of ex- 

Mario Braggiotti 
Replaces Fray 

NEW YORK - Mario Brag - 
fiotti, who was the other pianist 
in the duo -piano team of Fray 
and Braggiotti, will follow his 
late partner's lead once more. 
Jacques Fray, who was a long- 
hair music host on WQXR, New 
York, died January 20. Effec- 
tive February 5, Braggiotti will 
take over Fray's WQXR slot. 

Recently, Braggiotti has been 
active as a composer, and has 
worked on sound -track scores 
for TV commercials. 

tended news reports in a 45- 
minute segment of William B. 
Williams' early- evening platter 
show, the news was being con- 
centrated at peak traffic hours 
and was knocking out large 
slices of music programming. 

The over -all pattern in re- 
corded music programming, of 
all basic types, in New York 
City seemed to be this: (1) most 
stations were trying to maintain 
their "normal," pre -strike bal- 
ance (new -vs.- established rec- 
ords, new artists, etc.) of music 
elements; (2) most stations, in- 
cluding even serious -music FM 
outlets, have cut back the total 
amount of record programming 
in any average broadcast day 
by 10 to 30 per cent. 

A number of "new" local 
broadcast personalities have 
been emerging on the New York 
radio-TV scene. 

By the Book 

Though there has been opin- 
ion difference concerning 
AFTRA payment for their serv- 
ices, a number of journalists, 
critics, columnists and reporters 
on struck newspapers have been 
literally booked by their news- 

Distrib Moves Office 
TORONTO -Continental Rec- 

ord Company of Toronto has 
moved to "new and more spa- 
cious quarters" at 1244 Cale- 
donia Road in this city. The 
firm is Ontario distributor for 
Masterseal, Palace, Continental, 
and other record labels includ- 
ing the U. S. Hickory line. All 
sales and promotion activities 
for the company will be head- 
quartered at the new address. 

papers for promotional appear- 
ances on radio and TV, or 
signed by individual stations. 

Such stations as WOR, 
WNBC, WINS, WNEW, WCBS, 
WQXR, etc., have had such 
"name" byliners as Walter Kerr, 
Louis Sobol, Ben Gross, Joe 
Kaselow, John Chapman, Jimmy 
Cannon, Harrison Salisbury and 
Arthur Krock on the air with 
special feature reports or re- 
views. 

The effect of all this non- 
music feature programming may 
well be felt, if audiences indi- 
cate strong likings for it, even 
when the strike is over. In fact, 
things may never be quite the 
same in New York radio. 

More Applause 
For Gospel Show 

MONACO -"Black Nativity," 
the much- lauded gospel -music 
presentation which played in 
major TV markets as a Christ- 
mas season special and from 
which there is an original- caster 
on Vee Jay, won another honor 
last week. 

The hour -long music show, 
co-produced by Westinghouse 
Broadcasting Company, won the 
Silver Dove Award at the Third 
International Monte Carlo Fes- 
tival. Two other U. S. TV pro- 
ductions, Saudek Associates' 
"The Drama of Carmen" and 
Four Star's 'The Price of To- 
matoes," also won awards at the 
international event. 

Michael R. Santangelo pro- 
duced the taped TV version, 
which is syndicated by West- 
inghouse in its series of monthly 
specials for children. 

RIADY TO-0O PROGRAMMING VOX JOR 
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DJ Stumbles On Old Record 
And It Takes Off Like Bird 

BALTIMORE -Another almost forgotten record has been re- 
vived by a deejay, and is well on its way toward new success. The 
recording is Boots Randolph's "Yackety Sax" on RCA Victor, a 
track on an album now a couple of years old, and it has been given 
new life by a pair of WJZ -TV, Baltimore, personalities-deejay 
Buddy Deane and local TV star Gerry Wheeler. 

Wheeler actually got the ac- 
tion started. Featured personal- 
ity on a show called "Lorenzo & 
His Friends," Wheeler needed a 

cute piece of music to serve as 
background while he did a sign - 
off heel- and -toe routine. He 
found "Yackety Sax" in the sta- 
tion library and started using it. 

Then, Buddy Deane, noticing 
that the moppet guests on the 
"Lorenzo" segment were trying 
to invent a kiddie dance to go 
with the tune, started featuring 

Elektra Shifts Distrib 
NEW YORK -Elektra Rec- 

ords has switched distributors 
in the Southern California area, 
transferring from Allied Music 
Sales to Merit Distributing Cor- 
poration. Merit has begun activi- 
ties for Elektra by handling the 
company's January re- stocking 
plan. This month, Merit will 
handle a new affiliate label, 
Crestview Records, for Elektra 

programming newsletter 
By ant GAVIN Billboard Contributing Editor Publisher, Bill Gavin's Record Report 

"BEST SIDE STORY" .. . 

There's much regional action this week, with several sides 
showing considerable strength in only one or two areas. For instance: 

Baltimore: "Sixteen Years Ago Tonight" (Kenny 
Karen -Columbia) is gaining in sales, notes Larry 
Monroe (WCAO). Roy Orbison's "In Dreams" on 
Monument "looks like another giant for him," says 
Larry. 

Hartford: Bertha Porter (WRDC) flashes a big 
sales jump for "Tina" ( Rondells- Shalimar), which 
she predicts will be Top 10 next week. Another 
local jumper is "Valerie" (Ronnie and the Hilites- 
Raven). A top 10 item is "Work Out" (Michael 
Clark -Imperial). 

Los Angeles: Don And (KFWB) confirms smash potential for 
"Sun Arise" (Rolf Harts- Epic). Both sides of the new Bobby Bland 
release on Duke are on Don's "Hot Comers" list. 

Boston: According to Arnie Ginsburg (WMEX) "Tore Up" Har- 
monica Fats- Darcy) is taking off fast. Arnie notes requests for "I 
Want to Cry" (Van Trevor -Atlantic) and "Shireley" (Tony Orlando- 
Epic). 

Milwaukee: "Pickup" (Conway Twitty -MGM) shows fast sales 
gains, says George Michael (WRIT). "South Street" (Orlons- Cameo) 
is taking off nicely. Request items include "My Foolish Heart" 
(Dimensions -Coral), "Initials" (Castells -Era) and "Duke of Nothing" 
(Dipsy and the Doodles- May). 

Top Tips From Around the Nation: "He's So Fine" (Chiffons - 
Laurie), "Tell Him I'm Not Home" (Chuck Jackson -Wand), "I'm So 
Afraid of Losing You" (Linda Scott- Congress). 

"GOOD MUSIC" PROGRAMMING: A year or so ago we 
heard a great deal about top 40 stations switching to so called "good" 
or "better" music policies. Recently there hasn't been much action 
in this direction. In a majority of our important cities, pop music 
stations command the lion's share of audience. On the other hand, 
the success enjoyed by a comparatively few "non rock" or "middle 
of the road" music and news operations commands respect. Even 
in cities where these non -rockers can't claim undisputed leadership 
in rating, they are often excellent revenue producers. 

It is noteworthy that in practically every city of any size the 
total audience for top 40 music hardly ever exceeds 50 per cent 
of the available listeners. The difficulty is to capture a major share 
of this half that rejects the top 40 sound. While there is a pretty 
specific formula for top 40, there is no similar objective guidance 
for those who present other music policies. The individual judg- 

ment of deejays and music directors thus become more important, 
and all too often are inadequate for the job. 

There are two basic styles of better music programming: the 
light- concert type followed by WPAT and KABL, and the LP -plus- 
pop employed by WIP and KSFO. The former two place emphasis on 
instrumentals, introducing a vocal only two to four times an hour. 
Commercials occur in clusters every quarter hour, separated by 
musical bridges. The music is seldom identified by title or artist; 
rather, the mood of the program is emphasized. Single records are 
almost never used. Every musical selection is programmed by one 
person. The deejay has no control. 

LP- PLUS -POP makes use of selected singles, avoiding any 
suggestion of hard rock sounds. Depending on the station and 
the individual disk jockey, there will be from three to six singles 
an hour out of a total of 12 or 13 selections played. Instrumentals 
make up a large share of the programming, often as much as 50 
per cent. In some cases a choral group is used to substitute for an 
instrumental. 

The authority of the music director varies from one such sta- 
tion to another. Most have a singles playlist as a guide, and it is 

expected that all deejays will give regular exposure to certain speci- 
fied singles. As a result the LP pop station may often be responsible 
for breaking a hit single in its market by laying on a record that 
is too sweet or square for the top 40 outlets to consider. 

While some top 40 deejays scorn the thought of planning a show 
in advance, and ad lib choices as the show goes along, this is hardly 
possible for the LP pop station. The deejay must write out his show 
before air time. In doing so, he often follows his own formula, 
just as rigid in its way as top 40. Here is a typical hour: 

Bright instrumental ... male vocal ... instrumental 
(Latin) ... girl vocal ... instrumental (piano) ... comedy 
or novelty ... instrumental (big band) ... news headlines 
... small group vocal ... instrumental (jazz) ... male vocal 
... instrumental (show tune or theme) ... girl vocal .. . 

instrumental fill to news. 

THE REQUIRED SINGLES are first placed in their appro- 
priate positions, and then the LP's are filled in to balance the pacing. 
Obviously, the special types of instrumentals shown above are highly 
flexible and may be altered to suit the available material. One old 
hit an hour is often effective. The LP of the day -or the week -is 
in frequent use. Regular featuring of newest LP's is effective in at- 
tracting listeners who like to audition what is available as a guide to 
their next shopping trip in the record store. 

Regardless of the stystem or formula, it is the skill and experi- 
enced showmanship of the people involved which make it work 
successfully. 

the Victor oldie. Monument 
Records, which now has Boots 
Randolph under contract, got 
wind of the whole thing, and 
waxed a new session of "Yacke- 
ty Sax" as a single. It was re- 
leased, and started moving. 

Finally, other Baltimore sta- 
tions -WCAO, WSID, WITH, 
WWIN, others -got on the rec- 
ord in their radio deejay shows, 
and it was off to a big start 
in the big Chesapeake market. 
At last report, the record was 
developing in several other cities. 

Deejays Bringing 
Back Old Chubby - 
In Limbo, That Is 

SAN FRANCISCO - When 
two local deejays last year spon- 
sored the first twist entertain- 
ment attraction in this city's 
sprawling Cow Palace, the event 
was such a hit it reportedly 

show. Attendance topped 15,- 
000, according to Tom Donahue 
and Bob Mitchell, both of KYA, 
who sponsored the show inde- 
pendent of the radio station. 

Now, in 1963, the same pair 
will sponsor a second show, also 
featuring the fluid backbone of 
Chubby Checker. The name has 
been changed slightly: from 
Chubby Checker's Twist Party 
to his Limbo Party, but the idea 
is the same. 

Several other rock and roll 
and r. &b. artists will partici- 
pate in the 1963 show, set for 
Saturday night, March 2. The 
names of the other artists are 
expected to be released shortly. 

Perhaps because of the suc- 
cess of the San Francisco show, 
Oakland -based radio Station 
KDIA has decided to sponsor a 
similar event on Friday night, 
February 8, in the Oakland 
Auditorium. This event is known 
as "The Big Sounds of 1963" 
and may likewise become an- 
nual. 

Featured are the following 
recording artists: Bobby (Blue) 
Bland and His Revue, Ike and 
Tina Turner, Marvin Gaye, the 
Four Rivers -a local Bay Area 
group -and Bobby Freeman of 
San Francisco. KDIA disk 
jockeys will emsee the event. 

Jim Costello Upped 
Jim Costello has been pro- 

moted to sales manager for the 
A. H. Meyer Company, San 
Francisco, distributor of RCA 
Victor records and phonographs. 
He has been manager of the rec- 
ord department for almost four 
years. 

Succeeding h i m is Mike 
Young, a salesman in that de- 
partment for several years. Jim 
is the brother of Del Costello, 
of the rival Columbia, who was 
also promoted on January 1 to 
promotion manager for the en- 
tire Northern Pacific Coast area. 
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I k1J\ RECORDS 

1449 S. Michigan AY.. 
Chicago 5, III, 

FROM 

20th FOX 

MARILYN SINGS 

HER GREATEST 

HITS 

'MARILYN' 
FXG 5000 

F. \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \\.0 
IMOVING OUT FOR A HITS I 

LOUISIANA RED 

"RED'S 

DREAM' 
R -4469 I 

1 
ROULETTE RECORDS 

AI1631 B'way, N. Y., N. Y. 

"WHO STOLE 

THE KEESHKA1" 

THE MATYS BROS. 

Select S -719 

4 JOY RECORDS 
1619 B'way., N.Y. 19, N.Y. 

kYI 

The Big 
Mexican Hit 

THE 

SINNER 
(EL PECADOR) 
Watch for new hit 
recordings! 

MILLS MUSIC, INC. 

"MY REASON 
FOR LIVING" 

Capitol 4908 

CENT1RAL JONCSJNC 
1483 NORTH VINE STREET 

HOLLYWOOD 28, CALIF. 
HO 92239 

RELIABILITY -QUALITY 
RECORD PRESSING 
Originators of the Patented 

rim drive; thick -thin 
type record 

RESEARCH CRAFT CO. 
1011 NORTH FULLER 

HOLLYWOOD 46, CALIF. 

PROGRAMMING READY -TO -GO 
PANEL PROGRAMMING 

THE QUESTION 

Do you feel that "Oldies -but 

Goodies' singles are a worthwhile 

change of pace in pop record shows? 

THE ANSWERS 

BOB CLAYTON 
WHDH, Boston 

I certainly feel old records 
should be an in- 
tegral part of pop 
record program- 
ming. I have 
found that many 
listeners particu- 
larly enjoy recall- 
ing record hits by ' 
established stars A 
of the early 1950's, and that in- 
clusion of such is an essential to 
balanced programming. I believe 
that a program should feature at 
least one, but no more than two, 
in an hour. 

TY BOYD 
WBT, Charlotte, N. C. 

If the "oldies" have been re- 
corded within the 
past four or five 
years, they may 
be a welcome 
change of pace 
and help make 
the listener feel 
at home." Re- 
cordings from 10 

and 20 year, ago, even though 
reissued, lack the quality of pres- 
ent -day reproduction, and should 
be played only if there is a good 
reason. But the many thousands 
of Miller- Goodman -Shaw f a n s 

playing an occasional vintage 
record. 

. or.* 

MEL PHILLIPS 
WMID, Atlantic City 

I play one "oldie" every hour 
on my show (now 
in the 9:00 a.m. -I 
p.m. daily slot), 
and such "Oldies - 
b u t- Goodies" 
should be pro- 
grammed at least 
once an hour. 
They should be 
records that were formerly in 
the Top Ten and shouldn't be 
any older than five years. Our 
listeners not only enjoy the top 
tunes of the day, but like to re- 
call memories of "that day" on 
the beach, or "that night" on the 
boardwalk. 

BARRY KEAN 
WCHV, Charlottesville, Va. 
I find that on my Saturday - 

night request 
show about half 
of the telephone 
response is for 
sides I'd class as 
"Oldies -but- 
Goodies." And 
the audience for 
this sort of mate- 

rial is going to keep on growing, 
because the kids who were just 
into their teens when rock was 
new are into their twenties. 
They're getting married and hav- 
ing families, and the oldies are 
"their" songs. 

If you have a provocative question to ask 
deeiays or programmers. send it to this 
Billboard department, 1564 Broadway, New 
York 36, N. Y. Your name will be credited 
if question appears in Billboard. 

New UA Distrib 
NEW YORK -Record Sales, 

Inc., of Memphis is the new 
United Artist Records distrib for 
the Western half of Tennessee, 
Arkansas and Northern Missis- 
sippi. 

Program directors and disk jockeys will llnd this material a reedy source 
from which to build weekly programming periods. All that's needed no 
the disks from the stations record library. 

BEST TRACKS 
FROM THE NEW 

SPOTLIGHT LP'S 
These are the tracks selected for disk jockey 
programming by Billboard's reviewing panel 

a the most outstanding from this week's 
new LP Spotlìhis. 

POPULAR 

LOOP DE LOOP -Johnny Thunder 
(Diamond D 5001, SD 5001) "Zoo - 

Lee-Oh" (Unb,lleveable, BMI) (2:15) 

MARCH ON, BROTHERS -The High- 
waymen (United Artists UAL 3245, 
UAS 6245) "Maricnne" (J. Shink, 
BMI) (2:23) 

JAZZ 

ROSSA NOVA PLUS-Willis Jackson 
(Prestige PR 7260) "Amor" 

DUKE ELLINGTON & JOHN COI: 
TRANE-(Impluse A 30. AS 30) "In 
a Sentimental Mood" (American 
Academy of Music. ASCAP) (4:12) 

ILLINOIS JACKET -(Epic LA 16033, 
BA 17033) "Imagination' (ABC 
ASCAP) (4:21) 

JAZZ CARAVAN -Art Blakey & Oe 
Jazz Messengers (Riverside 9438) 
"Sweet 'n' Sour" (BMt) (5:28) 

MONEY JUNGLE -Duke Ellington with 
Charlie Mingus & Max Roach (United 
Artists Jazz 15017) "Money Jungle" 
(5:25) 

SCREAMIN'- Brother lack McDuff 
(Prestige 7259) "Scrcamie " (Prestige, 
HMI) 

LATIN AMERICAN 

LET'S DO THE BOSSA NOVA - 
Tito Rodriguez & His Ork (United 
Arists UAL 3262, UAS 6262) "Otro 
vez" (3:27) 

MIDDLE -ROAD SINGLES 
Not too far out in either direction, the following singles. selected from the current Hot 100. 
are the most popular middleroad records of the week. Rank order here is based on relative 
standing in the Hot 100. 

This Lest From this week's Het 100 
Week Week TITLE, ARTIST, LABEL 

Weeks en 
Hot 100 

2 

3 
4 

5 

6 
7 

8 

9 
10 
11 

12 

13 

14 
15. 

16 
17 
18 

19 
20 

1 WALK RIGHT IN, Rooftop Singers, Vanguard 35017 6 

2 THE NIGHT HAS A THOUSAND EYES, Bobby Vee, Liberty 55521 10 

RHYTHM OF THE RAIN, Cascades, Valiant 6026 5 

3 GO AWAY LITTLE GIRL Steve Lawrence, Columbia 42601 14 - FROM A JACK TO A KING, Ned Miller, Fabor 114 7 

4 IT'S UP TO YOU, Rick Nelson, Imperial 5901 9 

5 MY DAD, Paul Petersen, Colpix 663 13 

9 FLY ME TO THE MOON -BOSSA NOVA, Joe Hamel! and Ork, Kapp 497 7 

7 MY COLORING BOOK, Kitty Kallen, RCA Victor 8124 8 
8 MY COLORING BOOK, Sandy Stewart, Colpix 669 7 

18 WHAT WIE MARY SAY, Johnny Mathis, Columbia 42666 3 
I I CAST YOUR FATE TO THE WIND, Vince Guaraldi Trio, Fantasy 563 10 
13 YOUR USED TO BE, Brenda Lee, Decca 31454 3 

BALLAD OF JED CLAMPETT, Lester Halt 8 Earl Scruggs, Columbia 42606 10 
17 THE END OF THE WORLD, Skeeter Davis, RCA Victor 8098 3 
16 WANNA BE AROUND, Tony Bennett, Columbia 42634 5 
10 SHAKE ME, I RATTLE (Squeeze Me, I Cry), Marion Worth, Columbia 42640 
15 SHE'LL NEVER KNOW, Brenda lee. Decca 31454 3 
14 SETTLE DOWN, Peter, Paul and Mary. Warner Bros. 5334 4 

DAYS OF WINE AND ROSES, Henry Mancini, RCA Victor 8120 3 

YESTERYEAR'S HITS 
Change- of.pace programming from your librarion's shelves, feoluring the dickes 
';that were the hottest in the land five years ago and ten years ago this week. 
!Here s how they ranked in the Billboard's chart at that time: 

POP -5 Years Ago POP -10 Years Ago 
February 10, 1958 February 7, 1953 

1. Don't, E. Presley, RCA Victor 1. Don't Let the Stars Get In Your Eyes, 
2. At the Hop, Danny A the Juniors, P. Como, RCA Victor 

ABC.Peramounl 2. Till I Waltz Again With You, 
3. Get a Job, Silhouettes, Ember T. Brewer, Coral 
4. Stood Up, R. Nelson, Imperial 3. Why Don't You Bellere Me, 
5, Sall Along Silvery Moon, J. lamo, MGM 

B. Vaughn, Dot 4. Tell Me You're Mine, Gaylords, Mercury 
6. Short Shorts, Royal Teens, 5. Hare You Heard, J. lames, MGM 

ABCParamount 6. Oh, Happy Day, D. Howard, Error 
7, The Stroll, Diamonds, Mercury 7. Hold Me, Thrill Me, Kiss Me, 
B. Sugartime, McGuire Sisters, (oral K. Chandler, (oral 
9. Catch a Falling Star. P. Como, 8. Keep It a Sorel, J. Stafford, Columbia 

RCA Victor 9. Anywhere I Wander, J. LaRosa, Cadence. 
10. Great Balls of Fire, J. L. Lewls, Sun 10. Glow Worm, Mills Brothers, Decca 

RHYTHM 8, BLUES -5 Years Ago- February 10, 1958 
Get a Job, Silhouettes, Ember Short Shorts, Royal Teens, ABC Paramount 
At the Hop, Danny d the Juniors, Oh, Julie, Crescendos, fiasco 

ABC Paramount 
Stood Up, R. Nelson, Imperial Don't Let Go, R. Hamilton, Epic 

Don't, E. Presley, RCA Victor The Stroll, Diamonds, Mercury 
Maybe, (hantels, End Peggy Sue, B. Holly, (oral 

Coliseum Ups York 
HOLLYWOOD -Dave York 

has been appointed national 
promotions manager of Coli- 
seum Records, and will co- 
ordinate with distribution activ- 
ities of Vista Records. York is 
currently promoting "Limbo 
Rock" album by Billy Strange. 

Release Bossa LP 
NEW YORK -Clave Beat 

Records Ltd., organized by 
Claire Goodman and Fran 
Weitzner, has begun operations 
in New York with offices at 
1650 Broadway. First release 
from the new firm will be a 
do- it- yourself album of instruc- 
tions in bossa nova, and future 
plans call for a series of pack- 
aged dance lessons for every 

major Latin American step. 
The girls have also opened a 
music publishing company, Clan 
Music Inc., with offices at the 
same Broadway address. 

Olympia Names Cohen 
NEW YORK - Saul Cohen, 

former vice -president of Golden 
Crest and sales manager of 
Laurie Records, has been named 
general sales manager by Olym- 
pia Distributing Corporation, 
with Edward S. Ficher continu- 
ing as promotion man for singles 
and albums. In related moves, 
Juan Tirado has been appointed 
promotion man for Latin Ameri- 
can product, Joseph Nelson has 
been named to head the firm's 
special merchandising depart- 
ment, and John A. A. Haydn 
has been appointed comptroller. 

/4T15- 
16 Annelle kits 

plus 1s pige 

full-celer book 

RICHARD 

CHAMBERLAIN 

ALL I HAVE TO DO 

IS DREAM 
K 13121 

aua 
Taking Hold All Over 

America! 

THE PERSIANS 

"GET A 

HOLD OF 

YOURSELF" 
Pageant P-601 

A SMASH 

The Majors 
"WHAT IN THE WORLD" 

b -w 

"ANYTHING YOU CAN DO" 

#5914 

IMPERIAL RECORDS 
6425 Hollywood Blvd. 
Hollywood 28, Calif. 

SENSATIONAL!!! 

"YOU MADE A 

FOOL OF ME" 
THE SENSATIONS 

Junior 1988 

Jamie /641/en 
Distributing Corp. 

PHILADELPHIA 23, PA. 

HEADED FOR THE CHARTS 

"LOVE WALKED IN" 
vistone .7071 

Ronnie Mitchell 
distributed by 

DEBONAIR RECORD CO. 
97] W. Florence 

Los M9eles N, tali,. 
717-0478 
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VOX JOX 
By CHARLES SINCLAIR 
HELPING HAND: A well - 

rated deejay's suggestions are 
not taken lightly by his listeners, 
as witness what happened at 
WNEW, New York, late last 
month when Dee Finch, of the 
Klavan & Finch team, came to 
the aid of a small -town editor 
in Mississippi. A WNEW news- 
cast reported that the editor, Ira 
B. Harkey Jr., of The Pasca- 
goula, Miss., Chronicle. was be- 
ing faced with an economic boy- 
cott triggered by his opposition 
to Gov. Ross Barnett's handling 
of the Meredith case. After the 
news break, Finch said he would 
buy a subscription to the paper, 
and suggested the K &F listen- 
ers do so too. The WNEW 
switchboard lit up. Later, on the 
same station, deejay William B. 
Williams repeated the story. By 
day's end nearly a thousand 
calls had been logged from lis- 
teners promising to subscribe to 
The Chronicle, and several 
agencies called to promise ad- 
vertising schedules. 

INTO ORBIT: One of the 
latest stations to sign for the 
Mars -syndicated "Dick Clark 
Radio Show" is WKKO, Cape 
Canaveral. . . . Bruce Hayes, 
spinner at KHJ, Hollywood, 
will be seen as well as heard. 
He has just finished an MPO- 
produced film commercial as- 
signment for Viceroy cigarets, 
shot on location at Santa Anita 
Race Track.... Another dcejay 
going to the track recently for a 

reason other than the usual 
sportive one was KRIZ, Phoe- 
nix's Jonathan B. (Jack) Frost. 
A greyhound owner, he was re- 
cently honored at Phoenix's 
Greyhound Park at the first an- 
nual running of "The Jack Frost 
Special," 

THIS 'N' THAT: Ben Arrigo, 
of Glenn Productions, New 
York, has set a promotional pro- 
gram for Bill Harrington and his 
ork on the syndicated "Top 10 
Dance Party" shows. Harring- 
ton's current LP releases, "Just 
for Kicks" and "Two for the 
Show," will be showcased on 
dance sessions and given away 
as prizes.... Gene Creasy, p.d. 
of Baltimore's WITH, writes that 
Bobby Wayne, formerly of 
WCPO, Cincinnati, has been 
added to the station's "Swinging 
Seven" deejays. Wayne is billed 
as "radio's fastest and most ex- 
citing personality." . WIL, 
St. Louis, is conducting a pro- 
motional search for "six family 
pets that most resemble the sta- 
tion's on -the -air personalities." 
Winners will he feted at a spe- 
cial WIL dinner- for -two. . . 

Leon Hill, of WENK, Union 
City, Tenn., now hosts a twice - 
weekly jazz platter show aimed 
largely at the nearby University 
of Tennessee campus. 

FORMAT VS. SHOW: Steve 
May, p,d. of WFSO, Webster, 
Mass., writes to suggest that 
small -town stations "must be 
aware not only of local trends 
but regional as well." Describ- 
ing several of the station's 
shows, which vary from big - 
band wake -up shows to album 
programming for housewives to 
current hits and golden gassers 
for the afternoon teen crowd, 
May suggested: "We find that 
by dealing in programs rather 
than strict formats we please 
most of the people most of the 
time. It may be a throwback to 
early independent radio, but it 
works very well!" 

FRONTIER PLEA: A lot of 
deejays write to ask that they be 
placed on record- company mail- 
ing lists, but one of the most 
poignant letters we've seen came 
from M /Sgt. A. J. Hudek, of 
the 639th Radar Squadron, a 
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Focus on the Dee jay 

i i 

Scenen .. . 

ACTION MODEL of "Pepino, the 
Italian Mouse" is examined 

by WMCA, New York, deejay, 
Joe O'Brien (center), and Lou 
Monte (left). Philip Florio, at 
right, created the model. O'Brien, 
who is the station's morning 
man, was one of few spinners 
who first spotted the Monte tune 
on "B" side of Reprise single, 
and flipped it for airplay. Side 
became an instant hit -the first 
for Reprise -within a few days, 
with label following up with a 
Monte "Pepino" album. 

h 

mwmakkm, \\\\r\\\ hh\\\\\\ 
U.S.A.F. unit located 'way up 
there at Lowther Air Station, 
Ontario. This is what he wrote: 

"We (220 U.S.A.F. airmen) 
here at Lowther, located on the 
'Pinetrec Line," are an isolated 
radar site in Northern Canada 
with no radio or TV facilities 
except for a home -made land - 
line station whose library of rec- 
ords is small, worn and badly 
out of date. 

"I am 'appealing for your as- 
sistance to help solve this prob- 
lem by placing our unit on your 
record mailing list for popular, 
swing or western music. 

"Your disks would be exposed 
to this 'captive' audience 12 -15 
hours daily with the majority of 
these people returning to the 
States as potential customers 
within three to six months. Any 
assistance you can render would 
be appreciated." 

Got any extra records? We'd 
he hard -put to think of a better 
place to send them. 

Frederick Bernard is the new 

host of WI -W, Cincinnati's 
"Clockwatcher" wake -up show. 
Bernard most recently was a 

staffer and record -show host at 
WTIC, Hartford, Conn. At 29, 

Bernard has had -get this -11 
years' experience in radio.. . 

David Byrn, Don Day and Joe 
Robbins are new deejays at 
KXOL, Fort Worth. 

RESERVATIONS LIMITED ! 

MAKE YOURS TODAY 
BROADCAST PIONEERS 

1963 ANNUAL tIIIKE AWARD" BANQUET 
Monday, February 25, 1963 

at the 
Americana Hotel, New York City 

Imperial Ballroom 
Presentation of the "MIKE AWARD" to WSB, Atlanta, Ga. 

Cocktails: 6:30 P.M. Banquet: 7:30 P.M. 
Contribution 825.0(1 (tax deductible) 

PROCEEDS FOR THE BENEFIT OF THE 
BROADCASTERS' FOUNDATION, INC. 

507 Fifth Avenue, New York 17 OX 7 -5895 
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Muntz Inks More Labels as 
His Autostereo Catches On 

By LEE ZHITO 

HOLLYWOOD -Capitol Records and Pacific Jazz last week became the latest labels to conclude 
agreements with Earl Muntz granting him tape rights of their catalogs for his Muntz Autostereo system. 
Muntz went into business with his car stereo tape playback unit with only the Tops Records line to lure 
customers, but since has added the Dot, Reprise and Omegatape catalogs to his cartridge tape line -up. 
Deals with other labels are being negotiated. 

The Muntz car unit operates 
with a 12 -volt motor and is in- 
stalled beneath the dash of an 
automobile. Speakers are 
mounted on opposite sides, 
either in the dash cowl or the 
door panels of a car. Two other 
speakers are installed in the 
rear. A four -track perpetual 
play (i.e. mobulous loop) car- 
tridge is used. The music is con- 

tinuous until the unit is turned 
off. 

Cartridges come in three 
sizes: large, contains four LP's, 
sells for $18; medium -sized, 
contains two LP's, lists for $10; 
small is equivalent to a single 
LP, lists for $6. A lever on the 
tape deck activates the tape 
head, to permit the listener to 

CLOSE -UP VIEW of Muntz Autostereo unit, with perpetual -play 
tape cartridge being slipped into playing position. Black knob 
in right foreground on top of deck activates tape head to 
permit listener to change music program on four -track tape 
from one double channel to the other. Multiple album car- 
tridges are programmed to carry different and usually con- 
trasting music on each of the double -channel bands. 

Cigar -Box Size 

Portable Thing 

Londoners Tote 
LONDON -The revolution in 

music listening which has fol- 
followed the boom in small 
transistorized radio sets has tak- 
en a different form in Britain 
from that of America and many 
other parts of the world. It is 
the large, though portable, cigar - 
box size type of set which has 
achieved most popularity here. 

Jack Dickman, managing di- 
rector of Fidelity Radio -a large 
manufacturer of radios, record 
players, etc. -has predicted that 
1963 would virtually see the 
death of the pocket transistor 
radio. 

"This is something of a sur- 
prise," he said. "The public has 
not followed the U. S. pattern 
in this direction, as there seems 
to be a demand in this country 
for the larger set of good qual- 
ity and better reproduction." 

Cameo Dividend 
PHILADELPHIA - Cameo - 

Parkway Records, Inc. has de- 
clared a quarterly cash dividend 
of 10 cents per share on Class A 
Common Stock, payable March 
11, 1963 to stockholders of 
record as of close of business 
February 15. Announcement of 
the dividend came January 21 
from president Bernard Lowe. 

switch from the program con- 
tained on one double -band to 
the other if his mood calls for 
a change in listening fare. 

Sub- Contracts Parts 
Car unit sells for $129.95. 

An additional $25 installation 
charge includes also the price 
of the four speakers plus up- 
holstery- matched grille cloth 
and mountings. The initial unit 
was manufactured for Muntz by 
Viking of Minneapolis. Muntz is 
now making his own units, sub- 
contracting the manufacture of 
parts and assembling them at 
his Wilshire Boulevard head- 
quarters. 

In addition to lending itself 
for car installation, the same 
unit is being sold to boat and 
private plane owners to provide 
them stereo music in their re- 
spective forms of travel. A simi- 
lar unit, designed to operate off 
of 115 volts, is being sold for 
home use, to provide back- 
ground music for home or of- 
fice. 

The first report on Muntz' en- 
try into this field was carried by 
Billboard in its last March 10 
issue. As reported at that time, 
Muntz plans to enter the home 
with his tape units through the 
consumer's automobile. The 
marketing innovator who used 
the self- inflicted "madman" tag 
to make a fortune in the used 
car field during the mid -forties, 
later pioneered the one -knob 
control Muntz -TV instrument. 

Auto Convenience 
It is his marketing philosophy 

that the consumer is eager to 
acquire convenience and com- 
fort accessories for his automo- 
bile, even more so than for his 

(Continued on page 35) 

MERCHANDISING 
BEST SELLING PHONOS DISK DEALS 

EQUIPMENT NEWSLETTER 

SEA FARE 

Dealers' Weather Eye 
On Boat -Happy U. S. 

NEW YORK -Equipment dealers who find themselves close to 
water -be it the sea, the Gulf or any one of the thousands of sizable 
lakes within the continental United States -may be surrounded with 
opportunities without even knowing it. The nation has gone more 
or less boating happy and every pleasure craft of any size plying 
open or inland waters, becomes a market for various types of elec- 
tronic gear. (Continued on page 37) 

COMPONENTS OF MUNTZ Autostereo car unit, showing tape 
playback (operates on car battery), two five -inch speakers, 
with upholstery- matching grille cloth covers for mounting in 
front, and two five -inch speakers for rear installation. Three 
different sizes available in perpetual -play cartridge, contains 
four LP's. Playback lists at $129.95 plus $25 for installation 
and speakers. 

equipment newsletter 
By DAVID LACHENBRUCH Billboard Contributing Editor Managing Editor, Television Digest 

CAUGHT IN THE AUDIOPHILE NET. Just as there are two 
kinds of "hi -fi" -the component kind and the packaged kind -there 
are two completely different kinds of hi -fi customers. This is nothing 

new. But have you ever stopped to examine just 
how much difference there is between the "com- 
ponent personality" and the "package personality?" 

Though there are a few hybrids, hi -fi customers 
break down into two distinctly different basic types: 

The component personality- Considers himself 
erudite, knowledeable, inquiring. He often reads 
The New Yorker, High Fidelity, the Allied Radio 
catalog, and paperback books with rough covers. 
He sometimes brags that he doesn't own a TV set. 
He used to feel the same way about movies, but 

now he avidly patronizes foreign films and revivals of American 
movies made before 1941. He drives a car with a stick shift. 

The package personality- Easygoing, takes things as they come, 
likes convenience. He may read Life and Look and paperbacks with 
shiny covers. He enjoys TV, and sometimes stays up after midnight 
watching the pre -1941 movies the component personality pays to see. 
He owns a transistor portable radio. His car has automatic transmis- 
sion. 

Even though they're faced with two entirely different classes 
of clientele, the component hi -fi manufacturers and the packaged 
hi -fi manufacturers occasionally attempt raids on each others' pros- 
pects. The component makers sometimes go so far as to advertise 
in Look or McCalls to grab the attention of the package personality. 

On the other hand, the package manufacturers periodically 
come out with what they call "the component look." This means 
chrome -plated knobs that look like gears, and machined or brushed - 
aluminum control panels. This is mainly a holding operation to keep 
their people from crossing into the component camp. Now and then 
package makers will advertise in Playboy to pull in a recruit or two, 
or to keep the younger generation from becoming too component - 
oriented. 

We don't know what success these raids have had. We do know 

that after the age of, say 35, these personalities are pretty well set. 
It's true that extreme financial success will sometimes goad a package 
personality into invading the component field -about the same time 
he trades his Chevy for a Jag -but these pseudo -converts don't really 
count, because status is their main aim. And besides, they don't use 
half the knobs. 

IDENTIFYING THE QUARRY. Both of these personalities 
are interested in music when they shop, but their approaches are 
entirely different. The package personality might ask to see "a hi -fi" 
or "a stereo"- phrases the component personality will, of course, 
avoid. The component personality often will ask for a specific brand 
of component, and then let you talk him out of it. 

If the prospect has his wife with him, he's a package personality. 
If he talks about frequency response, of course, he's a component 
personality. If he says, "What's this knob for ?" don't try to sell him 
on components The true component personality will never admit 
there's anything he doesn't know. 

Of course, the selling techniques for the package and component 
personalities are diametrically opposed. The component personality 
wants a real workout with his music. He wants enough knobs and 
switches so he can be as tired as Lennie Bernstein when the final 
note dies down. The package personality wants to do absolutely 
nothing -except maybe hum. The component personality wants 
specs before his eyes, whether he understands them or not. The pack- 
age personality is afraid they'd only confuse him, and he doesn't want 
to know, anyway. 

Industry is making a big effort to meet the requirements of 
these two personalities. The component personality now has many 
new devices to take his mind off the music. The latest thing, of 
course, is an amplifier with built -in cathode -ray oscilloscope, so the 
component personality (who probably doesn't own a TV) can watch 
the music on a three -inch screen. His amplifier is also equipped with 
such indispensables as function control, rumble and scratch filters, 
contour control, equalization switch, ambiance knob, phase reversal, 
channel reverse, tape monitor and so forth -and is studded with 
inputs and outputs for every conceivable and inconceivable purpose. 
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BEST SELLING 

PHONOGRAPHS, RADIOS & TAPE RECORDERS 

These are the notion's best sellers by manufacturers based on results of a month- 
long study using personal interviews with a representative national cross -section 
of record -selling outlets (only) that also sell phonographs, radios and /or tape 
recorders. A different price group is published in the space each week. Each 

category appears approximately every 14 weeks. 

The percentage figure shown for each brand is its share of the total number 
of weighted points derived from all dealer responses. Point tabulations are 
based on the rank order of manufacturers' sales at each dealer, and weighted 
by sirs of outlet. Only manufacturers earnings 3% or more of the total dealer 
points are listed below. 

PHONOS LISTING BETWEEN $81 and $100 

POSITION 

BRAND % OF TOTAL POINTS 
This 
Issue 

11/10/62 
Issue 

8/11/62 
Issue 

1 1 1 Magnavox 30.9 

2 7 - Masterwork 13.6 

3 2 3 Decca 9.5 

4 3 3 Webcor 8.2 

5 8 5 Motorola 6.6 

6 6 7 Voice of Music (V -M) 6.5 

7 4 2 RCA Victor 5.2 

8 9 9 General Electric 3.8 

9 - - Phonola 3.5 

10 5 5 Zenith 3.1 

Others 9.1 

:Since this chart is based on the previous month's sales, it is conceivable that 
certain brands will appear at one time and not at another because of many 

Influencing factors. Thus it does not indicate that the above ranking applies for 
;any period other than the previous month. Those brands that appeared in 

previous issues for this category and do not happen to merit a listing above 
are shown below with their rank order in the issue indicated in parenthesis. 

11/10/62 Issue: All brands represented in current chart. 

16%11 /62 Issue: Capitol (8). 

FM Antenna Sales Loom for 
Dealer in Weak Signal Areas 

NEW YORK -Phono- record 
dealers regard the FM antenna 
as one of their most important 
sales tools this year. And with 
good reason. Stereo -FM receiv- 
ers will represent a large part 
of equipment sales this year and 
stereo -FM demonstrations are 

better when the signal gets an 
assist from an antenna. 

Even in urban strong- signal 
areas, an FM signal deteriorates 
considerably when stereocast. 
The cleanest signal will be 
strengthened by an antenna. In 
fringe (or weak -signal) areas 

His tuner should have inter -station noise suppression, D'Arson- 
val -type signal- strength meter and VU meter, stereo pilot light -the 
works. And he wants a phonograph (oops, turntable) which will 
take only one record at a time. 

The package personality, on the other hand, seems to get along 
without all this jazz. As a matter of fact, he's a little frightened of 
machinery. He may be intrigued by it, but he has a healthy respect 
for it and certainly doesn't want to see it or touch it. He wants to 
push a button and get music. If he could get it, he'd like a record 
changer which would remove the disks from their jackets, play all 
sizes and all speeds without adjustments, and put them back in their 
jackets while it turns itself off and closes its own lid. 

He want his hi -fi mounted in a neat self- contained and attrac- 
tive wood cabinet which will fit in the space between the French 
Provincial breakfront and the Castro Convertible. And his wife will 
be of paramount importance in okaying the furniture. The com- 
ponent personality doesn't have to face his wife till he gets home. 

After the sale is made, the package personality pays what is 
known as the "price." The component personality pays something 
called the "audiophile net." In both cases, this involves an exchange 
of currency, and under ideal circumstances results in profit for the 
dealer and satisfaction for the customer. 

Both of these personalities -and all gradations in between, 
including the portable personality and the packaged -component split 
personality -are sold on the idea of home music. Their approaches 
are different, and they may buy in different stores. But they're 
equipment customers, accessory customers, record and tape custo- 
mers. We'll always have both kinds. 

Note: Nobody really knows what pre- or post -natal influences 
determine whether an individual will become a component or a pack- 
age personality. There's some evidence, however, of an occupational 
connection. The component personality, with all his love for machin- 
ery and knobs and decibels, usually works at a desk -while the 
package personality, who wants music without mechanism, frequent- 
ly works at a machine all day. 

Dentists Now 
Employ Music 
To Drill By 

HOLLYWOOD - Music 
dealers can now add dentists as 
prime prospects. United Stereo 
Tapes, the tape subsidiary of 
Ampex Corporation, has entered 
the audio analgesia field, re- 
leasing quarter - track stereo 
tapes for use by dentists to relax 
patients and alleviate pain. 

A primary requirement in mu- 
sical pain -killing is to have the 
sound reproduction as noise -free 
as possible. Therefore, each of 
the tapes prepared for this use 
are made directly from the first - 
generation master tape. Each 
package provides up to an 
hour's music, and is recorded 
in 334 four track i.p.s. car- 
tridges or in reel -to -reel form, 
listing at $19.50 each. 

The initial Audio Analgesia 
release consists of four pages. 
The play -back system used al- 
lows the patient to control the 
volume to his liking. 

As an example of the type of 
music to pull teeth without dis- 
comfort, the initial release con- 
sists of: "The Most Beautiful 
Music of Hawaii" and "The 
Most Recorded Songs of All 
Time," George Greeley and Bud- 
dy Cole; "Have Organ Will 
Swing" and "Cole Plays Cole," 
Buddy Cole; "Waltzes in Stereo" 
and "I'm in the Mood for 
Strings," David Rose and Ray 
Ellis; "The Sound of Music" 
and "Moon River," the Pete 
King Chorale. 

that have some trouble pulling 
in an ordinary FM signal stereo 
is almost out of the question. 
An antenna is mandatory. 

Which antenna is best? Any 
antenna is better than none at 
all. Less expensive are the omni- 
directional types; the S- shaped 
and the turnstile. The better an- 
tennas are the multiple- element 
types, the Yagi's. These are 
highly directional and highly ef- 
fective; some are provided with 
simple amplifiers, built right in 
for even higher signal strength. 

The profit possibilities in the 
antennas themselves are not lost 
on dealers in weak- signal areas. 
They've been selling them for a 
long time. And they report that 
antenna sales usually follow a 
pattern. The customer will gen- 
erally go for the lower priced 
units (about $30, plus installa- 
tion) for a starter. As a rule, 
they are not completely satis- 
fied with results and often will 
return to get a more expensive, 
more effective antenna. 

Sales can go as high as $ 120 
for a de luxe installation. It's 
easy to see why they bear down 
hard to include an antenna with 
a stereo -FM receiver sales. 

As important as an antenna 
might be for clean reception in 
the customer's home, it's even 
more important as a tool for 
pushing stereo - FM receiver 
sales. In light of the potential 
of these sales, the investment in 
a de luxe antenna for the store 
seems a relatively minor ex- 
pense. 

A Linotype or 2... 
NEW YORK - Oops. Some- 

one dropped a line of type. 
Ordinarily when this happens 

it just garbles the story. In the 
present instance it made High 
Fidelity's publisher. Warren 
Syer, the publisher of two other 
publications, High Fidelity 
Trade News and Better Listen- 
ing. 

Just in case anyone doesn't 

DISK DEALS FOR DEALERS 
A summary of promotional opportunities for dealers by manufacturers and 
distributors currently offering records at special terms. Shown where avail- 
able are starting and expiration dates for each deal as well as the date of 
issue and page number of the original news story and /or advertisement 
providing details of each promotion. Please consult these for full information. 

DOT -Expires January 31, 1963. Started December 26, 1962. 
Three programs: On albums: 10 per cent cash discount for mono and 15 per 
cent for stereo on LP's in category A: 15 and IO per cent on category B 

albums, and 20 and 25 per cent on category C albums. On EP's: 25 per cent 
discount. On single prepacks: 20 per cent discount. 

AUDIOFIDELITY -- Expires February 15, 1963. Started January 1, 1963. 
Label is offering one for three on the complete catalog. 

ELB(TRA- Expires February 15, 1963. Started January 1, 1963. 
Label is offering a 10 per cent restocking plan on firm's complete catalog. 

IMPULSE -Expires February 15, 1963. Started January 3, 1963. 
Twelve and a half per cent discount on new releases and a 20 per cent 
discount on catalog items. 

LENOX- Expires February 15, 1963. Started January 21, 1963. 
Buy 10 get two free on the Little Esther Phillips LP "Release Me." 

LIBEITYDOLTON- Expires February 15, 1963. Started December 31, 1962. 
A 10 per cent cash discount taken off the face of the invoice on dealer 
orders. A 15 per cent cash discount on individual dealer orders of 200 or 
more LP units. Plan covers new releases plus entire catalog. 

MERCURY- Expires February 15, 1963. Started January 1, 1963, 
Label is offering a 15 -free- with -each -100 -purchased deal on its January release 
of 30 LP's plus selected items from firm's entire catalog. See page 5, 
January 5 issue, for details. 

PRESTIGE -PRESTIGE INTERNATIONAL- Expires February 15, 1963. 

Started January 1, 1963. 
Fifteen per cunt discount on all Prestige LP's byp Jack McDuff, Willis Jackson, 
Etta Jones, Herbie Mann and the MJQ. Ten per cent discount on complete 
Prestige International catalog. 

PNIUPS- Expires February 15, 1963. Started January 1, 1963. 
Firm is giving a 10 per cent discount on its entire catalog including new 
releases. 

ROULETTE- Expires February 25, 1963. Started January 21, 1963. 
On the Roulette, Roost. Tino and Gee product distribs and dealers may 
return $1 worth for every $5 purchased. 

ATLANTIC -ATCO- Expires February 28, 1963. Started January 15, 1963. 
One- for -seven on catalog plus new releases. 

DECCA -- Expires February 28, 1963. Started January 15, 1963. 
Label is offering distributors and dealers a "special incentive plan." 

DELMAR- Expires February 28, 1963. Started January 15, 1963. 
Label is offering a 10 per cent discount to the distribs on all merchandise. 

EPIC- Expires February 28, 1963. Started January 7, 1963. 
Label offers 15 per cent discount on all LP and tape product in the catalog 
as well as on all new releases. 

CAPITOL -Expires February 28, 1963. Started January 1, 1963. 
Three programs for dealers: One LP for 61 cents for each one purchased at 
regular once on firm's Guy Lombardo catalog of 17 LP's; one -free- for -two 
purchased on the Capitol -of- the -World album series; a flat 20 per cent off 
the invoice on Capitol Classics series. 

KING -Expires February 28, 1963, Started December 24, 1962. 
Label is offering a 15 per cent cash discount off the face of the Invoice on 
the entire King, Bethlehem and Audio Lab LP catalogs. 

SMASH. FONTANA- Expires March 15, 1963. Started January 15, 1963. 
A 10 per cent discount on both complete catalogs. 

STARDAY -Expires March 1, 1963. Started January 1, 1963. 
Label is offering distribs and dealers 3 for 10 on 120 specified items 
from catalog. 

AE- PARAMOUNT- Expires March 31, 1963. Started January 3, 1963. 
Label is offering 121/2 per cent discount on complete catalog plus new releases. 

KAPP- Expires March 31, 1963. Started January 21, 1963. 
Ten Der cent discount on catalog plus new releases. 

VANGUARD -for limited time only. Started January 21, 1963. 
Fifteen per cent discount (qualified dealers only/ on the Rooftop Singers' 
first LP, "Walk Right In." 

Muntz's Autostereo Catches On 
Continued from page 34 

home. He feels that once the 
consumer has experienced the 
operating ease and simplicity of 
his cartridge playback unit in 
his car, he will want an addi- 
tional instrument for his home. 
To aid in this repeat sales plan 
is the fact that car tape users 
will invest money in cartridge 
collections, will be prompted to 
Pet a greater return out of this 
Investment by being able to use 
the cartridges in their homes 
as well. 

Muntz' theory is working. He 
is enjoying a high rate of repeat 
sales. The lion's share of those 

know it, the mistake is doubly 
compounded since Syer's publi- 
cations is directly related to this 
one. in the parlance of the 
trade, Billboard and High Fidel- 
ity are "sister publications." 

To straighten the record en- 
tirely, High Fidelity Trade News 
and Better Listening are pro- 
duced by the St. Regis Publish- 
ing Company, piloted by Lee 
Solomon. 

The goof occurred in a story 
titled, "Hi -Fi Institute Backs 
Primer for Consumer." 

who have purchased units for 
their cars are returning for du- 
plicate sets for their homes. 

After months of research and 
development, Muntz actively 
went into business here this past 
September. Since that time, 
with sales concentrated almost 
entirely in this area, he has sold 
more than 5,000 units. The 
number of cartridges sold has 
passed the 25,000 mark. 

Franchises Let 

Muntz now is in the process 
of setting up franchise dealers 
throughout tte U. S. Most re- 
cent to join Muntz is Willis 
(Bill) Wardlow, formerly with 
Heritage Records, who took over 
the San Fernando Valley terri- 
tory here two weeks ago. Ward - 
low is employing a 15 -man sales 
force, and is going in heavily 
for TV and radio spots. 

Other dealers handling the 
Autostereo include Advance 
Stereo of Fort Worth, Frank 
Mullen of Phoenix, Ariz., and 
Earnest Chavis of Santa Ana, 
Calif. 

Muntz is about to launch a 
nationwide campaign, now that 
the concept has proved itself 
successfully in this market. 
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HITS OF THE WORLD 
Continued from page 18 

7 8 RIDE -Dee Dee Sharp 
(Cameo-La Gloria) -Cop 
Con 

8 - SUN ARISE -Rolf Harris 
(Columbia) -Castle Music 

9 - GO AWAY LITTLE GIRL- 
Steve Lawrence (CBS 
Coronet) -Town 

10 6 DO YOU LOVE ME- 
Dce Dee Sharp & Chubby 
Checker (Cameo La Gloria; 
-Tucon 

NORWAY 
(Courtesy Verden Gang) 

Denotes local orig. 
This Lao 
Week Week 

1 1 RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 
Presley (RCA) -Belinda 

2 2 THE NEXT TIME -Cliff 
Richard (Columbia) 

3 3 GUITAR MAN -Duane Eddy 
(RCA) -Egil Monn Iversen 

4 4 (EG VIL HA EN BLA 
BALLONG -Arne 
Bendiksen (Triola)- 
Stockholms Musikproduktion 

5 - DANCE ON -The Shadows 
(Columbia)-Bens Music 

6 9 MIDNATTSTANGO - Ase 
Wentel /Jan Heiland 
(Odeon)-Mus ik k -Huse t 

7 5 LOVESICK BLUES -Frank 
Ifield (Columbia) -Bens 
Music 

R - BACHELOR BOY -Cliff 
Richard (Columbia) 

9 7 JAG HAR BOTT VID EN 
I.ANDSVAG -Ray Adams 
(Mona) -Mona 

10 - FJERNE LAND -Key 
Brothers (Triols) -Egil Mon 
Iversen 

PHILIPPINES 
This Last 
Week Week 

I I HAVE A GOOD TIME -Tony 
Bennett (Columbia) -Mareco 

2 3 FROM THE BOTTOM OF 
MY HEART -Jerry Vale 
(Columbia)- Mareco 

3 7 LIMBO MAN -Ivy Pete & his 
Limbomaniacs (Pioneer)-No 
Licence 

4 6 TELL HIM -The Exciters 
(UA)- Mareco 

2 RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 
Presley (RCA) -Filipinas 

6 10 WISHING IT WAS YOU - 
Anita Bryant (Columbia) - 
Mareco 

GY- 

Billboard Buyers & Sellers 

CLASSIFIED 
the best sources of equipment, supplies, services and 

personnel . . serving mere Ilan 20,000 buyers, sellers, and users of music, records, tapes, 
home entertainment equipment, coin machines and many other related products throughout 
the entire world, 

DISTRIBUTING SERVICES 

RECORD DISTRIBUTORS 

leads the field in Florida with 

MISH MASH 
Carr) Grant- Newtown 

AIN'T GONNA KISS YA 
The Ribbons -Marsh 

THE LONE TEEN RANGER 
Jerry Landis-Amy 

WHO STOLE THE KEESHKA 
Malys Bros. -Select 

AM I THAT EASY TO FORGET 

Little Esther -Lenox 

DOIN' IT 

Al Casey -Stacey 

TOPPS DISTRIBUTING CO INC. 
NEW ADDRESS: 

222Y N.W. Fifth Ace.. Mlaml 37, Ali. 
Code 305, F'Rankiln 48186 

HAYDN SOCIETY 
RECORDS 

ARE NOW AVAILABLE 
TO QUALITY DEALERS 

FROM COAST -TO -COAST 

Send for current catalog 

ESOTERIC, INCORPORATED 

P. O. BOX 1799 
HARTFORD, CONN. 

National Distributors for 

HAYDN SOCIETY RECORDS 

RECORD ACCESSORIES & 

DEALER FIXTURES 

MR. RECORD DEALER - SIB.L MORS 
accoles make more money. Cheek 
those hont=g ecdles the new eaq 

ay our new fÌluminslea magnlfler. 
Na focusing, n sc hlne. o fu mbUng 
tmmealste lew-Ineaór neeaie LLehowi 
customer the xorn spots. wNCh eani i for You. S2.:A 1po sfoi: lev bel 
Nal Faktor ProrlucLLOns, 4143 W. tige Ave., CNesgo 39, 711. 

when answering ads . . e 

Say You Saw It 

In Billboard 

RECORD MFG. SERVICES, 

SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT 

PRESSING, PLATING 

NO JOB TOO SMALL -QUALITY PRESS 
ing. i,ow t. House f Wa>ñ 1697 
Broadway, N.xY. C.. CI 7 -2159. p -mh2 

RECORD PROMOTION 
& PUBLICITY 

NEW OFFICES NEW LOCATION 

Same great promotion know -how 

JOE PETRALIA 

Record Artists Representative 

Park Sheraton Hotel 

Suite 264 55th St. at 7th Ave. 

New York 19, N. Y. 

Phone: JU 6 -6935 

RELIGIOUS RECORD INDEX offers 
FREE up to date index 
service on new re- 
leases; where to order 
assistance, to sub- 
scribers of the OF- 
FICIAL RELIGIOUS 
RECORD INDEX. 
Your religious record department is 
mare efficient with 2,055 Protestant, 
Catholic and Jewish recordings cross - 

'ndexed according to title (over 
6,2001 and artist lover 750) on 54 
labels. A complete record depart- 
ment for less than I/5 cent per in- 
dexed album. For information write 

RELIGIOUS RECORD INDEX 
2223 N. Main St., Box B 

Dayton 5, Ohlo 

.T:eTi:ei 

USED COIN MACHINE EQUIP- 

MENT, PARTS AND SUPPLIES 

WANTED TO BUY 

sv'ANTE7)- KNOCKOUT FIGHTER, OLD 
tyre, nomeleclrlc with tat base. Ad- 

Wal condillon. Kottorsi DInL Co., 21 N. 
Broadway, Oklahoma Clty Okla. 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 

NEW PRODUCTS 

NEW PROFITS 

Bulk and sanitary machine opera- 
tors, Send for pictures and prices 
of our new 25c and 50e sanitary 
vendors. (New PM -10 Hand Lotion 
Vendor just put on market, no 
competition, high profit.) All Parts 
and Merchandise. Flat packs, vials, 
matching coins, combs, gum ball, 
capsules, etc. 

PEN -MAR DISTRIBUTING 

P. O. Box 1142, Hagerstown, Md. 

HAVE YOUR OWN BUSINESS 
Show folks: Ask about our successful 
plan to out you in business for your- 
self on Costume Rentals. If you're tired 
of traveling, retired or disabled ... you 
un overate this business from your 
hom< o a rwr<. w<u snow you now 
t0 gel rrurl0meri among 

el", "in". Write e, call Mr. Stomel. 

COSTUMES 
by 

PIERRE 

1113 Walnut Si., Philadelphia 7, Pa. 
WAlnut 3.1395 

THE 
COMPANY THAT REALLY GOES 

nes. 
r 

on sis dertislg ihre Cis 
sided Mart Le a proven economical way 
to t se Into make valuable eon - taets antl Increase sales and protlfa. Handy order form DrNted below for your convcnlcnce. chrtp 

Say You Saw It in 

Billboard 

MISCELLANEOUS 

30,000 PROFESSIONAL COMEDY LINES 
Monthly topical gagg crvlee too! Free 

. Robert 353(. 
Crescent. Baldwin Harbor. N. Y. mh3564 

$202,573 TO WRITERS 

Your unpublished manuscript may 
be valuable! Our famous subsidy 
plan has returned $202,573 to 
writers (mostly beginners) in the 
past seven years. We will publish, 
advertise, promote your book and 
pay you 40% of retail price. 

Send for FREE BROCHURE BB. 

PAGEANT PRESS 

101 Fifth Ave. New York 3 

1564 BROADWAY 
N.Y.C. 

Times Square Office 
Space for Rent. 

8700 Square Feet. 
Central Air Conditioning. 
Very Reasonable Rental. 

Contact 

KENNETH LAUB 
of Collins Tuttle & Co. 

261 Madison Ave. 
New York 16, N. Y. 

Telephone: 
MUrrayhill 2 -4020 
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USE THIS HANDY AD ORDER BLANK 

Please insert the following ad for consecutive issues, 

Classification Size. 
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7 5 LET ME BE WITH YOU - 
Jerry Fuller (Challenge) - 
Federal 

8 9 SEEIN' IS BELIEVIN'- 
Eddie Hodges (Columbia)-- 
Marco 

9 - DESAFINADO -Ella 
Fitzgerald (Verve)- Mareco 

10 8 ONLY FOREVER -Jamie 
Horton (Custom Audio) - 
No Publisher 

PERU 

(Courtesy La Prensa, Llma) 
This Last 
Week Week 

2 LA TOMBALO -Mirla 
(Velvet); Lucho Macedo 
(MAG); Niko Estrada 
(Odeon); Anabella (Sono 
Radio); Enzo Roldan 
(Virrey) 

2 I SPEEDY GONZALES- 
Manolo Munoz (Musart); 
Jorge Conty (Sono Radio); 
Los Gerrioncitos (.MAG); 
Los Campeones (Primary); 
Pat Boone (Dot) 

3 3 EL BARQUITO -Gustavo 
(Hit) Moreno (Sono Radio); 
Joao Gilberto (Odeon); 
Andre (Philips) 

4 8 EL AMOR ES LA FUERZA 
NAS PODEROSA- 
Dean Reed (Philips) 

5 10 EL TWIST DE LOS OJOS 
Negros -Tulio Gallo 
(Philips) 

6 7 ALBRICIAS- Anamelbe 
(Virrey) 

7 4 EL PECADOR- Antonio 
Prieto (RCA); Eddy 
Martinez (Odeon); Los 
Panchos (Columbia) 

5 ESO BESO -Paul Anka 
(RCA); Alberto Cortez 
(Virrey); Jorge Bollen 

9 - PERDONAME- 
Duo Dinamico (Odeon) 

IO 6 DOMINGO DE SOL - 
Sergio Murillo (Columbia) 

SINGAPORE 
(Courtesy Radio Singapore) 

This 
Week 

I RHYTHM OF THE RAIN - 
The Cascades (WB) 

2 DANCE WITH THE GUITAR 
MAN -Duane Eddy (RCA) 

3 RETURN TO SENDER - 
Elvis Presley (RCA) 

4 DEAR LONELY HEARTS -Nat 
King Cole (Capitol) 

5 HOTEL HAPPINESS -Brook 
Benton (Mercury) 

6 LET'S GO -The Routers (WB) 
6 CUPID -Sam Cooke (RCA) 
7 THAT'S HER BOY -Cliff Richard 

Columbia 

SOUTH AFRICA 
(Courtesy Southern African Record Man- 
ufacturers' and Distributors' Association) 

*Denotes local origin 
This Last 
Week Week 

1 3 BACHELOR BOY --Cliff 
Richard (Columbia)- Elstree 
Music 

2 2 THE LOCO- MOTION -Little 
Eva (Landon) -Aldon Musk 

3 I TELSTAR -The Tornadoes 
(Decca) -Ivy Music 

4 6 PATCHES -Dickey Lee 
(Philips)--Aldon Music 

4 MIDNIGHT SNACK -Bert 
Kaempfert (Polydur) -Gema- 
Belinda Music 

6 - RETURN TO SENDER -Elvis 
Presley (RCA) -- Belinda 
Music 

7 7 LIMBO ROCK- Chubby 
Checker (Continental)- - 
Sidney Bron Music 

5 SPANISH HARLEM -Jimmy 
Justice (Parlophonc)- 
Progressive Music 

9 - DANCE ON -The Shadows 
(Columbia) -- Sidney Bron 
Music 

10 10 RAMBLIN' ROSE -Nat King 
Cole (Capitol) -Comet Music 

SPAIN 
(Courtesy Dhemnonia) 

Thls Last 
Week Week 

I t BALADA GUTANA -Duo 
Dinamico (Voz Amo) - 
Del Sur 

2 2 A STEEL GUITAR AND A 
GLASS OF WINE -Paul 
Anka (RCA)- Hispavox 

3 5 ESO BESO -Paul Anka (RCA) 
-Hispavox 

4 3 PERDONAME -Duo 
Dinamico (Voz Amo )-Del 
Sur 

4 CUANDO CALIENTA EL 
SOL -Hnos Rigual (RCA)- 
Del Sur 

6 6 SPEEDY GONZALES -Pat 
Boone (Columbia) 

7 7 EVERY NIGHT -Paul Anka 
(RCA)- Hiseavox 

8 8 ET MAINTENANT- Gilbert 
Bccaud (Voz Amo) 
Armonlee 

9 9 I CAN'T STOP LOVING 
YOU -Ray Charles 
(Hispavox)- Hispavox 

10 - EL PECADOR -Lucho Gotica 
(Voz Amo) 

www.americanradiohistory.com

www.americanradiohistory.com


9194 RECORDS PROUDLY PRESENT 

JIMMIE RODLERS 
with his Biggest hit 

FACE IN 
A CROWD 

b/w 

LONELY TEARS 
Record # 16450 

he nations best selling records 

.v rigritea raa'u:. 

www.americanradiohistory.com

www.americanradiohistory.com
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INTERESTED IN 

NEW 
CUSTOMERS 

4.46?. 

ALLEY CAT 

CAST YOUR FATE 

TO THE WIND 

I LEFT MY HEART IN 

SAN FRANCISCO 

TELSTAR 

THEME FROM 

"LAWRENCE OF ARABIA" 

BLAME IT ON THE BOSSA NOVA 

WHO STOLE THE KEESHKA? 

WRITE TODAY FOR 
DETAILS OF OUR 

SHEET 
BIG MUSIC 

RACK 

p HANSEN 
yol_7(31rc:,,10,714 zr.l. 

1842 W E S T A V E N U E 

MIAMI BEACH 39, FLORIDA 

Unsurpassed in Quality at an Price 

Made in the famous studios and 

laboratories of James J. Kriegsmann 

GENUINE 8 "x10" 

GLOSSY PHOTOS 

7 ¢ 
EACH 

IN 1,000 LOTS 

$9.88 per 100 

6ENUINE HIGH -GLOSS 

POST CARDS, $32 per 1,000 
Copy Negatives 51.95 

MOUNTED ENLARGEMENTS 

Size: One: 2 a more: 
20"x30"..54.85..23.50 ea. 

30",40 "..$7.50..54.85 ea. 

KODAK COLOR PHOTOS 

100 JUMBO SIZE 522.50 
loolr'alo °atl. toe.. 

Plaza 7.0233 

165 W. 461h St., NEW YORK 36, N. Y. 

COMPLETE RECORD 

PRESSING SERVICE 

quantity. Mastering, Label 
Printing, Pressing, Drop - 
Shipping and Warehousing 
are just a few of our many 
services. 
SHELLEY PRODUCTS, LTD. 

220D Broadway 
Huntington Station, 

L. 1., N. Y. 

when answering ads . . . 

Say You Saw It in 
Billboard 

SINGLES REVIEWS 
Continued from page 30 

GEORGIANNA 
* * ** Hello F o o l s (Arrowhead, 
Butt (2:331 -- * ** I've Never Never 
Never (Arrowhead, BMI) (2:00). AL- 
COROII 

THE CHANNELLS 
* * ** In My Arms to Stay (That's 
the Way IL's Gotta Re) (Beryl, HMI) 
(2:00) -* ** You Hurt Me (Over 
Again) (Beryl, BMI) 12:101. HIT 700 

RONNIE THOMPSON 
* * ** What's Wrong With Mel 
(Drury lane, BMI) (1:56) - * ** 
Patty dear (Shame On You) (Drury 
Lane. HMI) (2:00). SELECT 720 

DANNY WINKLE. 
* * ** The Girt et Johnny's (Big 
Howdy -Treetop, BMI) (2:371 -* ** 
Don't Fall In Love (Big Howdy -Tree- 
top, BMI) (2:48). VILLAGE 7779 

DICK LORY 
* * ** I Cot Over You (Metric, 
BMII (2:05) -* ** Welcome Hoar 
Again (Camarillo, BMI) (2:34). LIB- 
ERTY 55529 

RED WEST COMBO 
* * ** My Babe (Arc, BMI) (2:10)- *** Bossa Nova Mom. (Press. 
BMI) (2:15). SANTO 9006 

JIMMY DEE 
* * ** You Say You Beat Me to 
the Punch (Osage, HMI) (2:301- *** I've Got a Secret (Osage, BMI) 
(2:351. CUTIE 1400 

GRACIE FIELDS 
* * ** Now Is the Hour (Leeds, 
ASCAP) (2:55) -* ** Small World 
(Chappell, ASCAP) 12:15). LONDON 
9582 

KEN JONES, HIS PIANO AND ORK 
* * ** Jubilee (Marks, BMI) (1:541 -* ** Lazy (Marks. BMI) (2:36). 
DECCA 31462 

KELLY GORDON 
* * ** 1 Can't Face the Day 
(Sport(n' Life, BMI) (2:521 -* ** 
I'm Gate' Home (Sportln' Life, BMI) 
(2 :15). MERCURY 72081 

BERT KAEMPFERT AND HIS ORK 
* * ** Gentleman Jim (Roosevelt, 
BMI( (2:39) - * ** TIPSY Gvpty 
(Brown, BMI) (2:32). DECCA 31463 

LINDA GRINER 
* * ** Goodby Cruel Lore (Jobete, 
BMI) (2:20) -* ** Envious (Jobete, 
BMII (2:39). MOTOWN 1037 

JR. WALKER ALL STARS 
* * ** Good Raakln' (Fuqua. BMI) 
12:35) - * ** Brainwasher (Part 2) 
(Fuqua, 0511) 12:20). HARVEY 119 

BOBBY CURTOLA 
* * ** Destination Love (Kernel, 
B571) 11:45) -* ** Hltchlkrr (Kemo, 
BMI) 12:00). DEL -F1 4195 

BILL DOGGE.TT 
* * ** Honky Took Bossa Nora 
(Part 21 (Bella., BMI) (2:321 -* ** 
Ocean Liner Bossa Nova (MC. BMI) 
12:45). KING 5718 

LITTLE WILLIE JOHN 
* * ** Don't Play With love (Be- 
lo, BMI) (2:25( -* ** Heaven All 
Around Me (Lois, BMI) (2:10). KING 
5717 

BILLY STRANGE 
* * ** Johnny Shiloh (Wonderland, 
BM!) (2:00) - * ** Day By Doy 
(Hanover -Barton, BMI) (2:00). VISTA 
417 

BETTY JOHNSON * * ** Glana', Got a Phone (In- 
tegrity- Nancy. ASCAP) (2:211 -* ** 
Betty's Bossa Nova (Integrity- Nancy. 
ASCAP) (2:21). RCA VICTOR 8143 

LAWTON WILLIAMS 
* * ** Rock of Gllbraltar (Western 
HWs, BMII (1:45 )-* ** Don't De- 
stroy He (Western Hills, BMII (2:14). 
RCA VICTOR 8142 

THE CHANTELS 
* * ** Eternally (Bis- Beteibin, HMI) 
(2:43) -* ** Swamp River (Spect)rl- 
mil, HMI) (2:28). LUDIX 101 

THE DUKAYS 
* * * * Combination (Roosevelt, 
BMI) (2:35) -* ** Etaay Step (Con - 
rad-Karlan, BMI) (2:351. VEFJAY 491 

SI ZENTNER 
* * ** Waltz In lau Time (Show- 
case, BMI) (2:591 -* ** A La Mode 
(Showcase. B51I( 12:32). LIBERTY 
55538 

COUNTRY 
JEAN SHEPARD 
* * ** I've Learned to Live With 
You (Acuff -Rose. BMI) 12:28) - 
* * ** It's Torture (Central Songs. 
BMI) 12:42). CAPITOL. 4915 

TEX WILLIAMS 
* * ** Five Fool Deep in Tear- 
drops (Aidon. RMII 12:171 -* * ** 
Where the Sad People Are (Cedar - 
wood. B511) 12:241. LIBERTY 55537 

LEFTY FRIZZELL 
* * ** Forbidden Losers (Cedar - 
wood, BMI) (2:34) -* * ** A Few 
McDS Away (Heart Line, ßM1) 12:501. 
COLUMBIA 42676 

FREDDIE HART 
* * ** Stranger Drive Away (Heart - 
line, BM!) (2:21)- * * ** l'li Hlt It 
With a Stick (Pamper, BMI) 13:00). 
COLUMBIA 42679 

THE JAMES BOYS 
* * ** There's Nothing New (Tel - 
lormade, BM1) (2:09) - * ** Hey 
Little Girt (Talbrmede, BMI) 12:07). 
PARK AVE. 106 

JAll 
MONCO SANTAMARIA BAND 

* * ** Watermelon Man (Arks, 
ßM1) (2:261 -* ** Don't Bother Me 
No More (Monto, BMI) (2:24). BAT- 
TLE 45909 

EDDIE HARRIS 
* * ** LolBa Marie (Conrad, 13511) 
(3:10) - * ** Mlma (Starks, BMI) 
(3:05). VEEJAY 496 

LATIN AMERICAN 
MON RIVERA Y SU ORQUESTA * * ** Monina (Morro.) - * * ** 

Como Etta Pita (Morro.). ALLEGRE 
3118 

PACHECO Y SU CHARANGA 
* * ** Desafinado ( H011is, BM) - **** Chakl.Lukl Wobble (Com- 
parsa). ALLEGRE 3115 

ORLANDO MARIN Y SU ORQUESTA 
* * ** EI Loco - * ** Un Do. 
mingo Sia Ti (Morron). ALLEGRE 
3117 

RENE (MR. LATIN) BLOCH 
AND HIS ORK 

* * ** Pa Coco Solo (For Heads 
Only) (Peer, BMI) (2:24) -* ** De 
TI Enamorado (In Love With You) 
(Peer, BMD (2:09). ATOO 6252 

MUSIC- AS 
WRITTEN 

NEW YORK 
"My Pony Macaroni" is a new 

tune penned by Bill Snyder and 
published by Mills. Tune draws 
its name from that gift horse in 
the White House Gene 
Gothelf, of Globe one -stop, 
Windsor, Conn., well on the way 
to recovery.... Father Bernar- 
dine of St. Michaels RC Church, 
Brooklyn, seeks talent for record 
hops. The bigger the stars the 
better, according to the good 
Father, for the receipts from the 
hops go to recently devastated 
missions on Guam.... Marvin 
Dean, Warner Brothers promo- 
tion man, married Judi Stone 
January 24.... Dick Blase, for- 
mer Ampex and UST sales man- 
ager, is now marketing manager 
at Wetdotron of Newark. 

Portem Distributors is the 
new distrib for Scope label... . 

Larry King has a new agency 
in Atlanta. He handles Rodger 
Martin, Gay Meadows, Charle 
Adams and others.... The big 
hit Rooftop Singers are set to 
appear at the Village Gate. . . 

Monte Kay has signed Ken 
Colman to a personal manage- 
ment contract. Colman, a singer 
from Canada, is set for the Mery 
Griffin show February 7 and 
two weeks at the Miami Playboy 
Club, starting February I I. The 
lad has offers from a number of 
labels. 

Summit Records of Somerset, 
Pa., has signed Sylvia Jean Ship- 
pey. . . . Chuck Austin is re- 
activating the Peek -a -Boo label. 

Sims Records has signed 
Autry Inman.... Sylvia Green 
is hack in the record business 
at Big Town Distributors after 
a nine -year absence. . The 
Downtown Glee Club, under the 
direction of Dr. George Mead, 
resumed rehearsals Wednesday 
(30).. . National Music Week 
Essays Contest sets up a prize of 
$250 worth of LP's for young 
teen essays. Deadline day is 
March 15. . Boyd Records 
recorded Red Zenner in Nash- 
ville. . Art Beason doing 
West Coast publicity for Bob 
Weymouth.. . . Eddy Manson 
scored video commercial. 

JACK MAHER 

Dealers' Eye on Boat -Happy U. S. 
Continued from page 34 

At least a portion of the kind 
of equipment designed for yachts 
and power boats of all sizes is 

suitable for merchandising by 
the record -phono -tape dealer, a 

fact brought out by counting up 
the exhibitors at the recent New 
York Motor Boat Show held at 
the Coliseum. 

A prime piece of gear is the 
so- called citizens' band com- 
munications unit, already an in- 
creasingly popular item with 
sportsmen, hobbyists and for 
auto -to -home use. A number of 
manufacturers displayed such 
equipment at the show, using the 
rather obvious sales point with 
boat enthusiasts, that even low - 
powered units carry consider- 
ably farther over water, particu- 
larly salt water, than across land. 
In some cases, in fact, the dis- 
tance of carry is up to 10 times 
as far over water. 

Cheapness and the relatively 
few official controls over its use 
are good selling points for such 
equipment for distances of 10 
miles or less. 

Higher priced and higher 
powered equipment is necessary 
for greater distance transmis- 
sions and for monitoring of 
Marine telephone and Coast 
Guard and distress frequencies, 
but there are also many radio 
telephone units -of up to 50 
watts of output which are porta- 
ble and reasonably enough 
priced to fall within the sales 
range of the home entertain- 
ment dealer in the proper loca- 
tions. 

The Heath Company, long an 
established name in the do -it- 
yourself, high fidelity compo- 
nents field, is also marketing 
a complete line of kits in the 
citizens' band "walkie talkie" 

as more elaborate, 
but also portable, radio com- 
munications gear priced tip to 
$109.95. 

Like h o m e entertainment 
units, the transistor vogue has 
also become established in the 
radio -afloat field, with some 
receiver elements including 
broadcast hand reception. In 
at least one case, the power- 
ful but highly portable receiver 
unit (fully transistorized) is de- 
tachable for carrying anywhere, 
just as in a standard miniature 
transistor set, now widely in 
use by landlubbers. 

Virtually all equipment is 
powered by 6 or 12 -volt bat- 
tery sources. Not yet in view 

JazzScope 
Continucrl fron: page 17 

Hamp has donc this for the 
department store. 

SESAC Recordings has issued 
"The Jazz Set," a series of 10 
I.P's containing 115 selections 
of all sorts of jazz from Dixie 
to bossa. It has been produced 
primarily for broadcasters... . 

Hank Crawford has cut a new 
album for Atlantic Records on 
the West Coast. Neshul Ertegun 
was in charge. Erroll Garner is 
writing the score for the forth- 
coming Paramount picture, "A 
New Kind of Love." 

JACK MAHER 

is a unit which would convert 
the 6 or 12 -volt d.c. output to 
110 a.c., which would make 
possible the use of domestic 
phonographs or tape playback 

equipment. One battery -powered, 
continuous loop cartridge tape 
playback unit which was dis- 
played at the boat show sev- 
eral seasons ago was among 
the missing this year. 

This will not, however, stop 
the alert dealer interested in 
catering to the boating trade, 
merchandising the sea- worthi- 
ness of a number of different 
battery- operated (dry cell and 
penlight types) phonos, radios 
and even tape machines now on 
the market. They can he sold 
on the merits of their play - 
ability anywhere at home on 
wheels and afloat. And the time 
to prepare for the forthcoming 
summer season would appear 
to be now. There was plenty 
of boat -buying activity at the 
New York show, and when a 
boat is sold there's a ready - 
made new customer for a whole 
raft of electronic items. 

Neal Forms Own Firm 
NASHVILLE - Bob Neal, 

manager of the Wil -Helm Tal- 
ent Agency here for the past 
year, has formed his own firm, 
Bob Neal Agency, Inc., and has 
signed contracts to book George 
Jones and the Jones Boys and 
the Louvin Brothers. 

Teddy Wilburn, who with his 
brother, Doyle, owns the Wil- 
Helm Agency, said a replace- 
ment for Neal is not certain yet, 
but may be announced in the 
next few days. Neal's office 
will be located in this city. 
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America's Larges L Oldest F 
ONE.STOP RECORD SERVICE! 

45 RPM 
60 C 

ALL LP's- REGULAR DISTRIBUTOR 

WHOLESALE -NOTHING OVER 

SAME DAY SERVICE N 

The MUSICAL SALES COMPANY N 
The Musical Sales Bldg. 
Baltimore 1, Maryland -i 

UP.10.10.1-NIfdfEf 

FAN MAIL GLOSSY 

PHOTOS 
All sires - quantities - color or black 
and white. Post nrds, mounted blow- 
ups. It will pay you to see our r free 
samples and complete price Ilst before 
ordering anywhere. Write today for new 
low prices, samples, etc. 

MULSON STUDIO 
Ito 1,11 l(,id9.-p01, 

ONE -STOP SPECIALISTS 
We ship same day 

IAZZ BLUES R b B 

SPIRITUALS POP 
Request your namine 

g 
blie added to our flst. 

MINETT'S ONE -STOP 
4305 5. Parkway Ave., Chicago 53, III. 

Phone: OA 4 -5655 o....H 
1564 BROADWAY, N. Y. C. 

TIMES SQUARE OFFICE SPACE FOR RENT 

8100 SQUARE FEET 

Central Air Conditioning 
Very Reasonable Rental 

Contact: Kenneth Laub of Collins Tuttle & Co. 
261 Madison Avenue, New York 16, N. Y. 
Telephone: MUrrayhill 2-4020 
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Common Market Nix Jolts British Show 
NAMA Kit Tips Ops On 

Anti -Vend Tax Laws 
CHICAGO - An operator's 

kit on how to help prevent un- 
fair anti -vending legislation and 
taxes is being distributed by the 
National Automatic Merchandis- 
ing Association (NAMA) to its 
members. 

The kit has been prepared by 
the association's legislative de- 
partment and is titled "How 
to Deal With Legislation and 
Taxes Against Vending." It is 
the first publication of its kind 
ever prepared by the association. 

"Preventing unfair restrictions 
and discriminatory taxation 
against vending always has been 
one of NAMA's most important 
services," said Thomas B. Hun - 
gerford, executive director. He 
noted that "this new kit will be 
a vital tool for vending opera- 
tors because it explains the back- 
ground of legislative Threats to 
vending as well as how to deal 
with the threats when they oc- 
cur." 

Contained in the kit is a book- 
let, "Your Role in Legislative 
Action," which explains why 
vending machines are taxed and 
regulated and how operators 
should work with government 
officials. 

Additional material details 
what NAMA can do to help op- 
erators. Other leaflets in the 
kit are suitable for distribution 
to legislators. Subjects include: 
"How a Vending Business Op- 
erates," "Why Per- Machine 
Taxes Don't Make Sense," "How 
Sales Taxes Affect Vending," 

Wolf Solomon 
Rejoins Central 

COLUMBUS, Ohio - Wolf 
Solomon has rejoined the Cen- 
tral Ohio Coin Machine Ex- 
change here after an absence of 
eight years from the coin ma- 
chine industry. 

He will work with his brother, 
Sam Solomon, calling on oper- 
ators throughout the area. The 
firm is a distributor of the 
United Manufacturing Com- 
pany. 

"Sound Public Health Regula- 
tion for Vending," "The Truth 
About Excise Taxes and Vend- 
ing," and "How to Deal With 
Deceptive Vending Machine 
Promotions." 

OPERATING 
MUSIC MACHINE PROGRAMMING DOUBLE PLAY DISKS 

RECENT STEREO RELEASES BULK VENDING 

MOA Officers Meet to Face 
Key Question of Convention 

By NICK BIRO 

CHICAGO -The big question of whether Music Operators of America will go ahead with 
its convention -and if so, in what form -was to be settled here this past week. 

Top officials of the association 
were slated to meet, with the 
convention plans first on the 
agenda. An indirect result of the 
meetings - perhaps an even 
more important one - will be 
decisions affecting the entire 
future of the association. 

MOA has been on rocky 
ground for the past several 
years. Many of the symptoms 
have been spotlighted in the as- 
sociation's annual convention 
which has been troubled by de- 
clining attendance - both from 
operators and exhibitors. 

A major reorganization last 
year was designed to correct the 
difficulties. MOA's chief found- 
er- president of some IO years, 
George Miller, retired from the 
association. 

trade associa- 
tion officer- Robert H. Blun- 
dred -was brought in as manag- 
ing director, and Harry Snod- 
grass was elected president. Also 
instituted were numerous inter- 
nal changes, designed to make 
the association more appealing 
for operators as well as exhibi- 
tors. 

In the past several months, 
MOA officials have been con- 
centrating on building member- 
ship by working through State 
groups. 

Efforts have also been made 
to enlist support of juke box 
and amusement game manufac- 
turers as well as record com- 
panies. The success of these ef- 

WURLITZER'S SERVICE SCHOOL, Friday (18) at the United, Inc., 
headquarters in Milwaukee, drew a healthy turnout of coin - 
men. Field service engineer, C. B. Ross, handled the session. 
Shown grouped around instructor Ross during one of the breaks 
are, from left: Andrew Hood, Mitchell Novelty Company; Bob 
Harding, United, Inc.; Jack W. Krueger, Advance Novelty Com- 
pany; Paul L. Weyandt, Mitchell Novelty Company; Pat Gaffney, 
Hastings Distributing Company, and William Zajc, Studio Phono. 

forts, however, has been ques- 
tionable. 

Neither MOA nor the manu- 
facturers - especially the three 
juke box manufacturers who for 
the past three years have not 
exhibited at the convention - 
have given other than a "no 
comment" or "it's too early to 
tell." 

Most observers agree that if 
MOA is to receive manufacturer 
support, it must come now. At 
the very least, observers feel the 
association must receive some 
form of firm commitment of 
just who will exhibit at the next 
convention, tentatively slated 
for the Morrison Hotel here, 
next spring. 

Executives slated to meet 
here last week included: J. 
Harry Snodgrass. president, Al- 
buquerque, N. M.; Clinton 
Pierce, chairman of the board, 
Brodhead, Wis.; Lou Casola, 
vice - president and convention 
chairman, and Robert Blundred, 
managing director. 

Among suggestions that have 
been advanced by members of 
the trade are: (I) Holding the 

convention jointly or at least 
concurrently with the giant Na- 
tional Automatic Merchandising 
Association major equipment 
vending conclave. Thinking is 

that most juke box operators are 
now in some way involved in 
vending and holding the two 
shows together will spur the in- 
centive for attendance. (2) Mod- 
ifying the form of the MOA con- 
vention - possibly eliminating 
the exhibits altogether and con- 
centrating on business sessions 
and forums. Advantage would 
be in eliminating the need for 
manufacturing support. On the 
debit side, however, is the elimi- 
nation of an intangible "excite- 
ment factor" inherent in the 
equipment exhibits. 

Biggest support seems to be 
for the first of the two pro- 
posals -that of holding the con- 
vention concurrently with the 
NAMA show. The big question, 
however, still remains: Can 
MOA get necessary manufac- 
turer support? This will essen- 
tially be the question around 
which the meetings this week 
will revolve. 

Games Exhibit 

Open on Day 

Of Turndown 
By AARON STERNFIELD 
LONDON -Britain's Amuse- 

ments Trades . Exhibition, the 
world's largest amusement ma- 
chine show, opened on a bitter 
note here January 29 when 
the United Kingdom's bid for 
membership in the European 
Common Market was firmly and 
perhaps irrevocably denied. 
Some 2,500 coinmen from the 
United Kingdom, Europe and 
the United States, milled 
through the barnlike Royal Hor- 
ticultural Hall here visiting 
the 68 exhibition booths that 
were jammed into an area 
which should have contained no 
more than two- thirds that num- 
ber. 

Most of the coinmen showed 
up shortly after the exhibits 
opened and stayed until late in 

(Continued on pave 48) 

AI II II I I II11IlI IIIIIIIIllll IIIIIIIIIIIII III IIi1111111111 IIIIptlI1IAAgpIlY1 

MD. GROUP TO 
NAME OFFICERS 

BALTIMORE - The Mary- 
land Automatic Merchandising 
Council will elect new directors 
and hear reports from its presi- 
dent and legislative, public rela- 
tions and public health commit- 

to be held at Gannon's Restau- 
rant here Tuesday (19) evening. 
A preview of "Operation Alert," 
the new National Automatic 
Merchandising Association self - 
regulation program for cigaret 
operators, will be presented by 
Walter Reed, NAMA public re- 
lations director. 
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BAD DAY AT BLACK ROCK 

Sub -Zero Weather Has Midwest 
Ops Talking to Themselves: Ouch! 

By NICK BIRO 
CHICAGO - For one whole day last week, 

most of the city was watching the mercury to 
see if an all -time new "coldest day" record was 
to be broken. 

It never was. The temperature hovered at 17 
below zero but never quite dipped to the all -time 
mark of minus 18. 

Coin machine operators, however, were having 
a very had day at Black Rock, and the situation 
here generally reflected conditions throughout the 
Midwest. 

For if the weather bureau record wasn't broken, 
neither was any other record. Collections were 
slow, record sales were down, juke box operators 
were buying less than usual and about the only 
people to be kept busy were the repair and 
delivery crews. 

Crippled Area 
Transportation and communication throughout 

the Midwest were virtually halted. Routine 15- 
minute calls were taking half a day or more. Calls 
and deliveries to nearby suburbs and county 
locations were out of the question altogether. 

Two weeks ago. when the city was first hit 
by the crippling cold, the story was different. 
The taverns roared and the coin machine collec- 
tions kept pace. This week, however, everything 
started catching up. 

Only the neighborhood taverns in heavily popu- 
lated areas were doing business. And here, only 
if the machines were still in good repair, and 
had some new records put on. 

Many of the neighborhood locations were closed 
for such reasons as frozen pipes, faulty furnaces, 
broken power lines and other troubles. 

In the county and suburban regions, only a 

handful of spots were still doing business. 
Take Way Off 

Of some dozen or more operators polled in 
the Chicago area, only a couple said that business 
was near normal. The overwhelming consensus 
was that they were operating at anywhere from 
75 per cent to as low as 30 per cent of efficiency. 

"It's not that we don't have the records," one 
large South Side operator said, "It's just too 
much of a job getting them out on the route. 
We have all we can do to keep our machines 
running." 

Many of the operators said they were forgetting 
about collections entirely in an effort to keep 
their machines running. 

One big West Side operator said he had in- 
structed his men to make collections whenever 
they had to make a repair but not to make 
separate collection calls when a machine was 
working. 

"If we can keep the machines running, we'll 
come out all right," was his answer, and it 
seemed to be shared by more than one operator. 

The arcade pieces and games in such locations 
as supermarket plazas or other semi -outdoor loca- 
tions were virtually out of commission entirely. 
Even if the game worked, nobody would risk 
playing with the thermometer hovering at well 
below zero and winds whipping along at 15 to 
35 miles per hour. 
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CURFEW SHALL NOT RING 
WHEN LONG -PLAY STARTS 

MEMPHIS -The City Attorney's office has a dilemma on its 
hands trying to decide whether it is legal to play a juke box without 
coins after the 1 a.m. curfew set by law as the time play on them 
is to stop. 

The law is not clear on the question. 
Here's how the unique issue arose: 
Location owner John J. Ogden Jr., operator of the Whirlaway 

Club, 3045 Lamar, put a tape on the juke box coin slot at 1 a.m. 
and adjusted the machine so it would play continuously without 
money. 

Ogden said he had some friends at the club at a private party. 
Routine Check 

At 1:45 a.m., Vice Squad Lt. C. Y. McDaniel went to the club. 
He said he was on a routine check, saw couples dancing to the 
juke box. 

He cited Ogden before the City Licensing Commission, which 
grants beer licenses and has authority to suspend or revoke them, 
charging he had violated the city ordinance prohibiting play of juke 
boxes after I a.m. 

No Violation 
Ogden contended before the commission he had not violated 

the ordinance because the juke box was closed to the public by the 
tape over the money slot, that it was not being played by the 
public but by him for a private party group. 

The licensing commission scratched its head, said it had never 
had a case like that before and asked City Attorney Frank B. 
Gianotti to advise them whether there was a violation. The issue 
hadn't been decided at press time. 

IIIII II 11 1111111 III II anal II 1111111 IIIII IIIII II 11 1111111 II II IIIII 11 1111111 11 1111111 IIIII II IIIIIIIII II II 1111111 Il llllllln n IIONllllllllllll 1111 1111111 IIIIIIIII II 1111111 

Seek Cut -Rate Disks 
KIEL, West Germany -West 

German operators have new 
entertainment for their regular 
association meetings -the "pop 
concert," juke box style. With 
the hiking of disk prices, Ger- 
man operators are launching a 
drive for off -beat, cut -rate disks 
suitable for juke box play or 
adaptation. Operator associations 

are prepared to place bulk 
orders for suitable disks cover- 
ing all members of the associa- 
tion. Moreover, they are seeking 
promising titles for production 
under the phonograph operators 
disk production project which 
is now under study in various 
versions. Operators double as 
off -beat disk scouts, bringing 
their discoveries to association 
meetings for group audition. 

BASEBALL GAMES 
King of Swat 5110 
Four Beggar 125 
Official Baseball 275 
Dluxe Baseball BS 

Star Slugger 125 
Super Slugger 125 
Yankee Baseball 245 
Mid. Del. Baseball 395 
Bally Big Inning 150 
Bally Heavy Hitter 175 
Bally Ball Park 245 
Bally Batting Practice 245 
C.C. Bull's -Eye 

Baseball 145 
C.C. Super Home Run 95 

GUNS 

Bonus Gun 5195 
Bally Sharp Shooter 250 
Bally Spook 295 
C. C. Ray Gun 350 
Carnival 135 
Dale Gun 65 
Ex. Space Gun 95 
Crusader 245 
Genco Gun Club 295 
Gen. Circus Gun Rifle 275 
Keeney Sportsman 150 
Keonoy Alr Raider 150 
Mitl. Shooting Gallery 225 
Pop -Gun CIr<us 225 
Sharp Shooter 275 
Safari Gun 175 
State Fair 195 
Seebure Bear Gun 165 
Torbure Coon Hunt 165 
Two Gun Fun 250 
United Sky Raider 230 
Vanguard 215 pa}rol - Indian Scout - 

Shooting Gallery 135 Midget Racer -Santo Fe 
United pirate Gun n7 115' Express. 

Roa 
rn Express 

y peed Boat 

Jet 
Nof Rod 

Americs Boet 
T Fora 

Trainer Spachip 
rse sande 

Ty 

Ho 
S it-DOwn Drlve- 

Yo 
Scientific 

375 
Scientific Boat 325 
Tuona rvllla Trolley 375 
Turnpike Auto Test 675 
Tusko Elephant 495 

NEW ALL -TECH RIDES 

Chuck Wagon -Cow Pony -Fire Engine - Highway 

WRITE FOR PRICES. 

Vat.AND O 
MACHINE EXCHAN 

2029 PROSPECT AVE CLEVELAND 15. OHIO hC. 
All Phones: Tower 1 0715 

NEWLY ELECTED OFFICERS and guests of the South Carolina 
juke box operators' association at the group's first organization 
meeting in Columbia recently include: A. L. Witt, Greenville, 
S. C., second vice -president; A. W. Bradford, Sumter, S. C., 
first vice -president; A. H. Connell, Beech Island, S. C., nominat- 
ing committee; Royce A. Green, Andrews, S. C., president; Mrs. 
Avna O. Fisher, Columbia, secretary- treasurer; Robert H. Blun- 
dred, Music Operators of America, managing director. 

OPERATORS AND DISTRIBUTORS attending the South Carolina 
juke box association's initial meeting last week included Gene 
Trout, Kenneth Flowe, L. F. LeStourgeon, Clinton Bozard, Hal 
Shinn, Roy S. Melvin, G. H. Harrison and W. Lewis Blackwell. 

NEW for '63! 
DELUXE 

6POCKETS 

BUMPER 

POOL ® 

NEW DESIGN! 

NEW MECHANISMS! 

V ol 
y 

or 
r esf rib 

vt write-- - 

VALLEY SALES CO. 
333 Morton St. Bay City, Michigan 

Say You Saw It in 

Billboard 

You're in business to make money. 
Billboard is in business to help you. 

Weekly dollars and sense information in every 
area of your fast -paced industry ... profit ideas 
-current trends and forecasts -legislation affect- 
ing your operation -new machines -new products 
-new services -new money- making ideas. 

Get tomorrow's news today. Get It fast. 
Get it often. Get Billboard. 

Subscribe Today 

BILLBOARD, 2160 Patterson Street, Cincinnati 14, Ohio 
Please enter my subscription to BILLBOARD for 

1 YEAR S15 3 YEARS $35 New Renew 
Payment enclosed 2 EXTRA issues for cash Bill me later 

Above subscription rates are for U. S., Canada and Europe. 
Other overseas rates on request. 

840 

Company_ 

Name 

Address 

City Zone_ State 

Type of Business Title 

Name Lee Wilkie 
Head of Georgia 

Vendors Council 
ATLANTA - Lee G. Wilkie, 

Southern Venders, East Point, 
Ga., was elected president of 
the Georgia Automatic Mer- 
chandising Council, at the 
group's third annual meeting 
here recently. Wilkie succeeds 
William Martin, who was re- 
tained as a council officer and 
elected vice -president. 

John C'. Edenfield, Automatic 
Vending Company, Thomaston, 
was elected secretary- treasurer 
and Cecil Huxford, Koffee Kup, 
Inc., Atlanta, was elected to the 
council's board of governors. 
Newly elected to the board is 
Joseph Fitzpatrick, the Seeburg 
Corporation, Savannah. 

Named committee chairmen 
for 1963 are: Wilkie, public 
health committee; Huxford, 
legislative committee; Martin, 
public relations committee, and 
Fitzpatrick, membership com- 
mittee. Richard W. Funk, legis- 
lative counsel of the National 
Automatic Merchandising Asso- 
ciation, was guest speaker at the 
meeting. The Georgia group is 
an affiliate of NAMA. 

OPERATE 

UNITED 

Shuffle Alleys 
and 

Bowling Alleys 
WELCOME EVERYWHERE 

UNITED MANUFACTURING CO. 
3401 N. California Ave. 

CMcago 18. nl. 

OPERATE 
WILLIAMS 

`TOM TOM' 
2 Moving Targets. 

Fast scoring and 
keen competition 

for 1 or 2 players. 

See your Williams Distributor 

Eleetronlc Mfg. Corp. 
4242 W. Fillmore St. 

Chicago 24, 111. 

See the 

I 

BIG 3 FOR 
'63 BIG IN STYLE! 

BIG IN DESIGN! 

BIG IN APPEAL! 

Capri 100 
With full 
Dimensional Stereo 
Model 11 
DeLuae Stereo 
Monaural 
Phonopreph 

1100111,11 

Capri 100 

Capri 100 
Model 40S 
DeLuae Stereo 
Monaural 
PhonoOraph 

NEW 4PLAYHR MAGIC! 
GOTTLIEB'S ALL NEW 

GAUCHO 
NEW Extra Ball Feature 

Coin Return 

Playboard Auto-Clamp 

and Many Other Features! 

See Page 49 
ORDER TODAYI 

Completely Reconditioned 

WANT TO BUY 
OLYMPIC-PREVIEW-FASHION 
SHOW -CONTEST -A LOHA -LAHC- 
ERS - FOTO FINISH - FLYING 

CIRCUS - LIBERTY BELLE- BIG 

CASINO-OKLAHOMA -SHOW BOAT 

-TROPIC ISLE -COVER GIRL 

Completely Recandltloned 

WILLIAMS OFFICIAL BASEBALL 

$295 

Completely Reconditioned 
WILLIAMS WORLD SERIES 

BASEBALL (1962) 
$375 

NATIONAL 
COIN MACHINE EXCHANGE 

1411 -13 Dirersey, Chicago 14, III. 

BUckingham 1 -8211 
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MUSIC MACHINE PROGRAMMING 

Even Minus 0 

Cold Can't Halt 

Some Records 
CHICAGO -Despite the sec- 

ond coldest day in Chicago's 
history last week (in 1936 the 
temperature his minus 18, heat- 
ing last week's minus 17) several 
hot new singles were starting to 
get action among juke box op- 
erators here. 

A spot check of Singer One 
Stop showed that "Jive Samba" 
by Cannonball Adderley on 
Riverside was starting to take 
off. The disk started on the 
South Side with rhythm and 
blues stops but is now going pop. 

Interestingly, Riverside's dis- 
(Continued on page 48) 

Mass Operators 

View the Newest 

Wurlitzer Phono 
BOSTON - The Wurlitzer 

factory outlet here drew 50 op- 
erators this week for the show- 
ing of the new 2700 model. The 
show was held on two days and 
operators were escorted to a 
luncheon at Hotel Kenmore 
where they were given a chance 
to discuss the new machine. 
James R. Hunter, Boston man- 
ager, and Robert Sweeney, sales 
manager, who hosted the affair, 
reported that the reception was 
excellent. Refreshments also 
were set up in the showroom, 
where operators who were un- 
able to attend the luncheon at- 
tended during the two days. 

Hunter and Sweeney later 
journeyed to Springfield, where 

(Continued on page 48) 

DOUBLE -PLAY DISKS 
Twatldd action may be expected from the following records. Fer the Luka box tweeter eter 
limned to from 100 to 200 sides per machine, they maximum programming 
effectiveness. Records listed below have both sides either en the Hot 100 or hava recently 
been on the Net 100. See Spotlight Reviews for additional information en double-play disks. 

IT'S UP TO YOU 
/ "--< RICK NELSON, IMPERIAL 5901 >- 

I NEED YOU 

SEND ME SOME LOVIN' -K SAM COOKE, RCA VICTOR 8129 > 

BABY, BABY, BABY 

CALL ON ME -< BOBBY BLAND, DUKE 360 > 

THAT'S THE WAY LOVE IS 

I'M GONNA BE WARM THIS WINTER -< CONNIE FRANCIS, MGM 13116 > 

AL DI LA 

YOUR USED TO BE 

BRENDA LEE, DECCA 31454 

SHE'LL NEVER KNOW 

I WANNA BE AROUND 

TONY BENNETT, COLUMBIA 42634 > 
I WILL LIVE MY LIFE FOR YOU 

I REALLY DON'T WANT TO KNOW 

"Little Esther" Phillips, Lenox 5560 > 

AM I THAT EASY TO FORGET 

ALL I HAVE TO DO IS DREAM 

13121 ' Richard Chamberlain, MGM > 

HI -LILT, HI -LO 

Recent 
STEREO RELEASES 

for Music Operators 

SEEBURG ARTIST OF THE WEEK 
HUGO MONTENEGRO -MONTENEGRO -70 
Time (Pop Instrumental) 

Raehmaninoff Rhapsody /Cry Me a River Dark Eyes /My Prayer 
Flight of the Bumble Bee /Palm Canyon Drive Fantasy Impromptu /Because of 
You I Concentrate on You /Be My Love 

All titles listed above are custom 331/2 sterol singles packaged ter the lute box 
Olhw peubgen er read companies may get weekly little.: of their eroded by sanding 
meta. to Joke Rex Reviews, Billboard, 1544 Rroadwey, New York 26, N. Y. 
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Frequent Disk Changes Key 
In R.B. Stop Music Menu 

By BOB LATIMER 
DENVER -The answer to programming r. &b. 

records is a simple one according to Charles 
Cousins, operator of Cousin's Coin Phonograph 
Company, here. 

"Just change records twice as often as usual, 
and leave the top three or four favorites from 
last week on," is his succinct instruction. "By 
sticking to that system we get the most consistent 
returns, year after year." 

Cousins has many locations in Denver's Five 
Point area, a Negro section of Denver which 
attracts many white patrons to popular show bars, 
rib restaurants and lounges. In such stops, Cousins 
programs around 90 per cent of his music menu 
in progressive r. &b. records, and has, on occasion, 
been known to go 100 per cent. 

Programming Technique 
Changing records every week, or at least every 

10 days in most stops isn't difficult because of 
the concentrated nature of the locations. Doing 
his own programming, Cousins has found it best 
to listen to each new record, primarily rock and 
roll, for the beat, and then select those which he 
enjoys personally. Transferring these records to 
the head of the music list usually shows con- 
sistently good results. 

So long as the platters have the beat, their 
earnings will pay fairly close. There will always 
he three or four standouts, of course, out of each 

week's changes, and these are dropped to the 
second week, after a look at the playmeter indi- 
cates that they do deserve the spot. 

In r. &b. music, just as in any other, there are 
numerous old favorites. Many older rock and roll 
tunes already fall into this category, as do even 
some of the original twists, plus many novelty 
and beat numbers which go back to the Fats 
Waller era. 

Checks Play 
Cousins programs plenty of these as a matter 

of course, keeps a close check on the play, and 
finds that even old favorites must be varied 
around once every two weeks, in order to get a 
steady return. 

Cousins doesn't mind the heavy record- changing 
schedule which his weekly change requires, since 
most of his machines are concentrated in the same 
area, at best only a few blocks apart. 

A congenial, affable man with other business 
interests in the Five Points area, he frequently 
chats with his music patrons, spending as much 
time as possible in locations, and always honors 
every request if it is at all possible. 

Frequently, this has meant buying records 
shipped air express from New York City or Chi- 
cago in order to come up with the requested 
numbers. "Plenty of change" is a simple maxim 
which shows the best dollar return where race 
records are concerned. 

Request Menu Pays Off 
By BOB LATIMER 

DENVER - "A route opera- 
tor's dream" is the best descrip- 
tion for a novel experiment in 
programming now in its eighth 
month at A -1 Skyline Music 
Company, king -size route oper- 
ation here. 

Johnny Knight, a 13- year -vet- 
eran of music- menu -program- 
ming, uses two methods of 
selecting a profitable line -up of 
records for his routes, which ex- 
tend throughout the mountain 
city. Under conventional prac- 
tice, half a dozen collectors, re- 
sponsible for stops which are 
primarily in taverns and cocktail 
lounges, do the programming on 
the spot, changing an average of 
eight records at each call and 
relying at least partially on lo- 
cation- owner comments and re- 
quests for the menu make -up. 

On- the -spot conferences with 
location owners, in this way, re- 
quire a considerable amount of 
time, and often, for one reason 
or another, are likely to pose a 
time -wasting strain on the col- 
lector. 

The second method is the 

Irate Ops Hit 
State Tax Bill 

BOSTON - More than 100 
cigaret and vending machine op- 
erators stormed a hearing at the 
State House on a bill that would 
impose a $50 annual tax on 
vending machines. Operators in 
the industry testified that tax 
would put many of the smaller 
operators out of business. They 
categorized the tax plan as 
"penny wise and pound foolish." 
A spokesman for the industry 
told the Committee on Taxation: 
"You will lose more money 
with operators being put out of 
business than the tax will bring 
in." 

A show of hands was called 
for to indicate the position of 
the operators. It was overwhem- 
ingly against the tax proposal. 
The committee will consider the 
evidence and report the matter 
out next week. 

eight -month experiment already 
mentioned, which is a single 
large route which is pro- 
grammed entirely by request. As 
Bud DeBaca, route supervisor 
explains it: "We wanted to see 
if it was possible to get enough 
requests along a major route to 
take care of the entire program- 
ming load, "so we went around 
to location owners, primarily in 
taverns and restaurants, explain- 
ing that if they would call us once 
a week with specific requests, 
we would make up the music 
menu entirely on that basis." 

Knowing that it is difficult to 
get people to make the effort 
of a phone call, Knight ap- 
pointed one girl in the A -1 Sky- 
line Music Company office to 
spark -plug the program. Her job 
is not only to receive calls with 
requests, but to telephone the 
location owners, re- explain the 
program, and ask for requests. 

With 30 or 40 telephone calls 
made on this basis every week, 
it wasn't difficult to get location 
owners in the habit of making 
such calls, and the program 
grew steadily. 

Other Chores 
The sole success of this pro- 

gram was based on the fact that 
somebody is always on top of 
it according to DeBaca. Along 
with making the telephone calls, 
and receiving all of the requests, 
the office girl is responsible for 
typing up the labels, locating 
the actual records, putting them 
in proper sequence in envelopes 
for each stop, and thus handing 
the collector a package ready 
for installation. 

In this way, the collector has 
probably as easy a role as could 
be found anywhere in the juke 
box industry. In taking the pre- 
selected selections from the of- 
fice he usually had enough for 
the change already listed. 

If a customer had only re- 
quested four numbers, the other 
four in the average of eight in- 
stalled, were simply taken from 
popular hits or old favorites, and 
placed on the spindle. As ex- 
perience has proved, A -1 Sky- 
line Music Company can easily 
change records over the full 
route in about a third the time 
normally required. 

"The experiment hasn't been 

completely successful," DeBaca 
admitted, "again, because loca- 
tion owners get lax about tele- 
phoning their requests, are not 
available when we check with 
them, and at that point, the sys- 
tem bogs down. When we get 
too many instances in which the 
customer is slow to co- operate, 
we are then sure to lose part 
of the efficiency of the program. 

This system has paid better 
returns than normal program- 
ming, probably because it is still 
new enough that co-operating 
location owners urge their cus- 
tomers to play the selections, 
and probably drop in odd 
change of their own, now and 
then. 

However, costs of maintain- 
ing the program are high if for 
no other reason than the fact 
that the girl on duty has little 
time for anything else. 

Also one drawback has been 
that location owners, even bar- 
tenders who are in continuous 
contact with their own custom- 
ers all too frequently guess 
wrong on what their traffic 

(Continued on page 48) 

Wico Item: 
Shin Guard 
For Bowler 

CHICAGO - Wico Manu- 
facturing Corporation has intro- 
duced a new Universal Shin 
Protector Pad, designed to keep 
bowlers from tearing their 
clothes and banging up their 
legs when inadvertently hitting 
the front of a howling alley. 

Ed Ruber, Wico sales man- 
ager, said the pads can be used 
on all ball bowlers, are rubber, 
blue and come with an optional 
metal mounting strip. The pads 
are $5.50 each, plus 75 cents 
for the strip. 

Wico is also introducing a 
new I6 -ounce spray can of 
Multi -Color or Tri -Color paint. 
Ruber said that such paint was 
not previously available in spray 
form because of spraying the 
small multi -color paint particles. 
The paint is now available in six 
colors and lists for $1.60 a can. 

Copyrighted mate 
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Coast Ops Win. a Round 

In Battle of Pico Rivera 
LOS ANGELES - Western 

Vending Machine Operators' As- 
sociation has obtained a more 
favorable license set -up in Pico 
Rivera, members of this group 
were told by President Phil 
Sreden at the regular monthly 
dinner meeting held at the Nika- 
bob Restaurant here Tuesday 
night (29). 

Sreden, who conduted his 
first meeting since his election 
six months ago and following 
his recovery from an illness, 
said that the tax representative 
and attorney, Eugene Zola, had 
obtained a license of $2 per ma- 
chine up to $25 for penny ma- 

chines. The ordinance has had 
two readings and is scheduled 
for the third and final one at 
an early date. The municipality, 
however, will not change the 
$5 per 5 -cent machine at this 
time. 

The change in Pico Rivera 
was declared to be fair, im- 
posing no hardship upon the 
operators in that area with fewer 
than 12 machines. 

Zola reported that he had 
also contacted El Segundo and 
had been advised that the busi- 
ness license structure in that 
section is being revised. Zola 

Continued on page 48 

EPPY WAREHOUSE SPECIAL MIX 
THIS IS THE BEST MONEY CAN BUY 
WE MIX OUR FAMOUS 100 ASSORTED PLATED CHARMS WITH OUR 
BEAUTIFUL PLASTIC SERIES . GIVING YOU A TOTAL OF 150 ASSORTED 
SUBJECTS IN THE BIGGEST VARIETY YOU HAVE EVER SEEN - 50% 
PLASTIC -50áo PLATED. 

F.O.B. JAMAICA OR FROM YOUR o NEAREST EPPY WAREHOUSES. Epps Per 

CI- -IARM9 1. Thousand 

91-151441h Plec, Jmlc 36, N.Y. PACKED 5,000 TO A BAG 

ou 
HEADQUARTERS 

Whatever your bulk vending requirements might 
be, we can serve you. 
Always a complete stock of outstanding North- 
western machines, parts and supplies. 

Write today for complete information and price list. 

BIRMINGHAM VENDING CO. 
520 Saoud Avenue, North Birmingham, Alabama 

Phone: FAirtax 4 -7526 

FEBRUARY 9, 1963 

Hectic Pace Brings 
Awards for L. A. Op 

By SAM ABBOTT 

HOLLYWOOD -Leo Weiner, who operates one of the three 
largest bulk vending routes in the Los Angeles area, seems to get 
more than 365 days out of a year. 

He has accomplished so much 
one wonders how he gets it all 
into a single calendar. In the 
past few years, besides operat- 
ing his West Coast Enterprises, 
he has received "Awards of 
Merit" from the Masonic orders 
-Scottish Rite and Shrine and 
has been honored by such or- 
ganizations as Boy Scouts, B'nai 
B'rith, National Vendors Asso- 
ciation, and Western Vending 

Machine Operators Association 
for service. Added to these - 
and most important to him - 
are hours spent with his family 
which includes, in addition to 
his wife, Harriet, a daughter, 
Debra, 9, and sons, Kerry, 11, 
and Wayne, 7. 

The Weiners recently moved 
into their new hilltop home 

Continued on pace 48 

"AWARD OF MERIT" and other honors won by Leo Weiner, 
Los Angeles bulk operator, are displayed in home surroundings 
with daughter Debra, 9, at piano, son Kerry, playing clarinet, 
and Mrs. Weiner. -Photo by Sam Abbott 

New Headquarters 
For Coast NAMA 

CHICAGO - The National 
Automatic Merchandising As- 
sociation's Western office is 
moving to new quarters at 10889 
Wilshire Boulevard, Los Angeles. 
The new phone will be GRanite 
7 -5547 (area code 213). The 
offices are under the direction 
of Sidney S. Kallick, NAMA's 
Western office manager and 
counsel. Service will be extended 
to member companies in Ari- 
zona, California, Idaho, Mon- 
tana, Nevada, New Mexico, Ore- 
gon, Utah, Washington, Wyo- 
ming, Alaska and Hawaii. 

OIIASILI f IMGER 

lOOL THEM WIiH, 
A R[ALLOO KING 

i /NG R' 

ti« tr`I` 

S3800 per thous. in capwbs 

AT YOUR NEAREST WAREHOUSE 
OR DIRECT FROM 

AAL GOGGENBEIM 
15907 Ar[her Are., r0.9oa 510. 

lamaica a1,N.r. 21211E.96491 

For Added Income 

- 

10, 

Delivers d Quality 

Comb iti îOt 

HARMON AMMO 

HANDY 
POCKET 
COMB 

VENDOR 

-r-:, 
Prodder a needed service 

and lits In well on lota 
lion with olher rendors. 

woo, 
PRICE OF MACHINE 

10c Operation 

1 to 2 machines...S26.40 
2 machines d up .. 21.40 

COMBS AVAILABLE 
Write for Prices 

Prices quoted are net F.O.B. Brook- 
lyn. Deposit required with order, 
balance C.O.D. 

J. SCHOENBACH 

Factory Distributor of Bulk and Bali Gum 
Vendors, Merchanekte. Parts, Globes, 
Siam° Vendors. Folders, Cidarette and 
Candy Mach.net, Sanaare vendors and 
Sanitary Merchandise. EVERYTHING ENE 

OPERATOR REQUIRES. 

715 Lincoln Place, BROOKLYN 16, N.Y. 

PResident 2.2900 

when answering ads . . e 

Say You Saw It in 

Billboard 

ROCKET OR 

JUMBO 5 
I 

Entirely new, especially designed items 
comprise half of our New Jumbo Charm 
Assortment. The other half is Deluxe 
Rings which vend perfectly because of 

All (HARM VENDING an insert containing an extra prise. 

THIS IS All NEW. 

BE THE FIRST IN YOUR TERRITORY. BIG PROFITS. 

Atlas has the perfect machine for Jumbo Charms. 
Write for information on how to convert other 
Vendors. 

FREE illustrated 
Sheets on all 
Feature lÇharma, 
Rings d Bulk 
Gharms. The 

PENNY KING 
Company 

2534 Mission St., Pittsburgh 3, Pa. 

World's Largos!. Selection of Miniature Charm 
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MANDELL GUARANTEED 

USED MACHINES 

N.W. Model 4a, 1c or Sc 51430 
N.W. Deluxe, lr or St Comb 1].00 
H.W. 10 -Col. tc Teb Gum Mech. 19.00 
N.W. Model -37, lr Porc. Don - 

verfed for 100 cf. B.G. 63 
Silva' Kino, 1 f B.G. or Mdss 8.50 

0 

ABT Guns 70.00 
Mills 1t Tab Oum 14.00 
MoaI au Peanut, tt bso 

MERCHANDISE 8 SUPPLIES 

P1sechlo Huh, Jumbo Queen, 
.77 

Pistachio Nuts, Jumbo Queen, 
Wnita Jo 

Pistachio Nuts, [stye Tulle JS 
i0 Nurs, V 
to Nuts, She 

Cashew , 
Peanuts, 

t 

b 

MCixed N Bby Chicks 
Raeinbow PeanuH 
B ridge MIx 

igÌcrÌy 
Be used 

Bems 
ci a 

e 
Dema 

MaM,sooct, Hnhey -ers 

Complete lin 01 Parrs, Su pelles, 
grenas, Globes, Brackets. Cherms. 
Everything for the operator. 

One -third Deposit, Balance G.O.D. 

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY 

World Famous 
VICTOR 
Standard 
TOPPER 

For Ball 

rim and 

Charms. 

Abo 

available 
for Peenoh 

and Bulk 

Candles. 

sold 4 

to a case. 

Stamp Folders, Lowest Prices, Write 

MEMBER 
NATIONAL VENDING 

MACHINE DISTRIBUTORS, Inc. 

NORTHWESTERN 
SALES AND SERVICE CO. 

MOE MANDELL 
446 w 360. $l New York 18. N. Y 

IOr,Oocre 4.6067 

when answering ads . . . 

Say You Saw It in 

Billboard 

Bulk Vend Boom Era Dawning 
CHICAGO -The spectacular 

boom in major equipment vend- 
ing often overshadows what has 
been an even more phenomenal 
growth in bulk vending during 
the past few years. 

A typical example is Jack 
Nelson of Logan Distributing 
Company, one of the Midwest's 
leading bulk vending outlets. 
Nelson is finishing 1962 with 
sales almost double the previous 
year and an even better outlook 
for 1963. 

In the past month, Logan has 
had consistently good business 
-particularly unusual in that 
(1) January is generally a slow 
month; (2) this January in 
particular has wen the worst 
winter weather in years -almost 
the worst in the city's history. 

Whereas bulk vending opera- 
tors usually spend the winter 
vacationing and repairing ma- 
chines, things have taken a new 
turn. 

Inside Now 
The big boom in supermar- 

SUPER 60 
NO BREAKING 
NO CRUSHING 
NO MISSING 

Try one . Learn why other 
operators find the SUPER 60 their 
favorite capsule vender. 
Getting the Northwesterner? It's a 
newsy magazine. Ask to get on 
our mailing list. It's free! 

WIRE, WRITE OR PHONE. 

ligfriggft 
CORPORATION 

2232 E. Armstrong St. Morris, III. 
Phone: 
,Va; 

2 -1300 

HEADQUARTERS 
Whatever your bulk vending requirements might 
be, we can serve you. 

Always a complete stock of outstanding North- 
western machines, parts and supplies. 

Write today for complete information and price list. 

PARKWAY MACHINE CORP. 
715 ENSOR ST. BALTIMORE 2, MD. 

VENDING HEADQUARTERS 

for VICTOR 
THE MOST COMPLETE and FINEST LINE 

of BULK VENDORS 

New Victor 2000 Vendor, Large Capacity . . . 

Holds 2,000 Balls 100Count Burn .. or 600 10c 

Capsules ... Also Available 3 Balls 100 -Count 

Gum for Sc. $24.50 ea. 
Large Stock of Vendors -Parts and Merchandise. 

Write for Prices. 

H. B. HUTCHINSON, JR. 
1784 N. Decatur Rd., N.E. Atlanta 7, Ce. 

Phone: DRake 7 -4300 

ket installations has put ma- 
chines inside instead of in front 
of the candy stores as in years 
past. The result is an almost 
steady volume for most opera- 
tors throughout the year. 

As evidence of Logan's 
growth, the firm just completed 
a major expansion and remodel- 
ing program that enabled it to 
increase its display of floor stock 
by some 25 per cent. 

Overhead storage space was 
added, and the firm's staff was 
increased by the addition of 
Bob Sopownik, new stock, in- 
ventory and serviceman. 

In addition to bulk machines 
and supplies, Logan carries the 
Du Grenier line of cigares, candy 
and coffee machines, plus a line 
of used equipment and kiddie 
rides. 

Nelson says the boom is 

attributed to a variety of factors. 
Chief of these, he feels, is the 
popularity of the multiple ma- 
chine installations in the large 
supermarkets and shopping 
centers. 

Use Fun Banks 

"People used to put three or 
four machines into stores," Nel- 

Melo -Tone in Operation 
At Brand -New Factory 

SOMERVILLE, M a s s. - 
Melo-Tone Vending, Inc., is now 
in operation at its new plant, 
334 Washington Street, Somer- 
ville, where the company has 
built the new 10,000- square -foot 
facility. The plant, when fin- 
ished, said David J. Baker, 
president, will be among the 
most modern in the industry in 
New England. 

Air conditioning and gas heat 
have been installed throughout 
the many offices, money rooms 
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ACORN MAN IN 
SOUTH GETS BID 
TO N. C. MEET 

RALEIGH, N. C. -Lee Smith 
of Southern Acorn Sales, ex- 
clusive distributor for Oak Man- 
ufacturing Company's line of 
Acorn venders in North and 
South Carolina, has been in- 
vited through Gov. Terry San- 
ford to attend the North Caro- 
lina Leadership Conference at 
the Sir Walter Raleigh Hotel 
here March 7 -8. 

The honor of being invited 
to the conference was extended 
to Smith because of his associa- 
tion with United Vending Cor- 
poration, of which he is a vice - 
president. He is also a director 
of the National Vendors Associ- 
ation and a board member of the 
North Carolina Retarded Chil- 
dren Association. 

Smith operates from 7,500 to 
8,000 machines and is currently 
placing 3,000 additional ma- 
chines now in production at the 
Oak factory in Culver City, 
Calif. 
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The weather's cold 
BUT THESE ARE HOT! 
Machines empty fast 
with these beautiful, detailed, 

multicolored 

(ORAL 

SNAKES 
with( 
¡j 

Ìerkëd $-r 

Only $50.00 per M Capsuled 

WATER SNAKES, in assorted 
colors. 

ONLY 646.00 per M Capsuled 
Labels available. 

PAUL A. 

PRICE co., INC. 

SS Leone ra 5,4 New;771", N. Y. 
Cortland 7.5147/ 

and repair shop as well as in 

the large garage area. A triple - 
alarm burglar system protects 
the entire plant. The firm oper- 
ates some 400 music pieces 
under the direction of Samuel 
Baker and more than 1,750 
cigaret machines in its routes 
throughout the Greater Boston 
area. 

Baker, former president of the 
Boston division of American In- 
ternational Bowling Corporation, 
has severed his connections with 
that company and will operate 
his firm as he did previously 
for many years when Melo -Tone 
had its headquarters in Arling- 
ton. With the firm as treasurer 
is Israel Spector, formerly head 
of Capitol Vending in Boston. 
Alexander Robbins is vice - 
president. 

Baker, former president and 
organizer of the Music Opera- 
tors Association of Massachu- 
setts, is anxious to re- create the 
group, and with support from 

(Continued on page 46) 

son said. "Now they put in com- 
plete banks of eight or more 
machines. Business of course has 
gone up, and we've expanded 
in the process." 

Nelson also credited the dime 
capsule with stimulating the 
bulk industry. "It gave opera- 
tors confidence to put more ma- 
chines into stores. I wouldn't say 
we wouldn't have had a boom 
without the dime capsule, but 
I don't think it would have been 
anywhere as big." 

25f OR 50$ 

SANITARY VENDOR 

The machine that will bring in extra 
profits for smart operators is this 
new Oak vendor. The machine holds 
144 flot pack products. The Oak 
slip clutch handle is standard equip- 
ment on each machine. Measuring 
261/x" high, 6" wide and 4" deep, 
this machine will refuse coins when 
empty and is equipped with an 

Ace lock and a look protector. 
Available with e 25c or 50c coin 
mechanism. Woll hinge (pot. pend.) 
simplifies servicing. 

- oak 
MANUFACTURING COMPANY, INC. 

lall 01...0 1vr., wirr' air, rollt. 

Write for beautiful color circular giving prices of 
machines and NEW Universal 4-6.8 Multiple Chrome 
Display Stared. 

VICTOR VENDING CORP. 
5711 W. Grand Avenue Chicago 39, Illinois 
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ROSEN 
SPECIALS 

FROM THE 

WORLD'S 
LARGEST 

INVENTORY 
Complete and Ready 
To Co At The Best 
Prices Ever Offered 

Each 

1 ABC Bally S 95.00 
3 Advance CC 50.00 
2 Atlas United 175.00 

1 Blue Ribbon Bally 50.00 

2 Atlas United 175.00 

1 Blue Ribbon Bally 50.00 

3 Championship CC 125,00 

1 Chief United 50.00 

1 Cyclone UN 175.00 

2 Eagle UN 175,00 

2 CC Explorer 95.00 

2 Handicap UN 100,00 

1 Imperial UN 75.00 

1 Jet Bally 95.00 

1 Jumbo Bally 95.00 

1 Ring Pin Bally 95.00 

2 League WI 95.00 

1 Magic Ball 50.00 

15 Rebound Shuffle 50.00 

8 Official Skill Ball 
Mono) 75.00 

15 Rebound Shuffle 50.00 

8 Official Skill Ball 75.00 

1 Rainbow UN 50.00 

3 Regulation UN 125.00 

14 Rocket Shuffle CC 75.00 

3 Royal UN 50.00 

1 SelectAPlay 50.00 

2 Shooting Star UN 75.00 

10 Skee Roll National 125.00 

I Skee Fun Midway 445.00 

1 Super Bonus UN 95.00 

1 Than UN 95.00 

2 Victory Bally 50.00 

All Prices Quoted Crated 
F.O.B. Phila. 

WIRE -PHONE -WRITE TODAY 

Send for Complete Lists From 

World's Largest Inventory 

ARCADE- GAMES -BINGOS 
RIDES -MUSIC -etc. 

DAVID ROSEN 
Exclusive A M I Dist. Ea. Pa. 

855 N. BROAD STREET. PintA. 23, PA. 
PHONE. (09100 21903 
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NAMA School 

Pushes Unit 
Sanitation 

WEST PALM BEACH, Fla. - 
A one -day training school on 
vending sanitation for some 50 
State and local public health 
officials was conducted here 
last week by the National Auto- 
matic Merchandising Associa- 
tion's public health counsel, 
David E. Hartley. 

The school, sponsored by the 
Florida State Board of Health, 
was designed to explain the 
State's new vending sanitation 
regulation adopted there last 
June. 

NAMA worked on the regula- 
tion with Florida authorities. 
The regulation follows NAMA 
recommendations and is uniform 
with the U. S. Public Health 
Service Ordinance and Code. 

Robert T. Cozart Jr., Auto- 
matic Merchandising, Inc., Tam- 
pa, and Doug Hunter, Hunter 
Vending Company, West Palm 
Beach, assisted Hartley in con- 
ducting the school. 

Hartley also recently met with 
officials from Pennsylvania to 
discuss a State regulation for 
food and beverage vending. The 
Pennsylvania association will 
mail questionnaires to operators 
in the State to determine the 
number and types of food and 
beverage venders. The associa- 
tion will also appoint a special 
committee to maintain vending 

Big Companies in News, But Smaller 
Ones Tell the Story, Risman Says 
CHICAGO - Mergers and 

large national operating com- 
panies may be making most of 

the news, but 
it is with the 
small, inde- 
pendent op- 
erating com- 
pany that the 
future of the 
vending in- 
dustry rests. 

That's the firm opinion of 
Louis J. Risman, recently elect- 
ed president of the giant Na- 
tional Automatic Merchandising 
Association, and one of the 
articulate spokesmen for inde- 
pendent firms. 

Last fall in San Francisco, 
Risman stood before the 1,800 - 
member association and empha- 
sized his point noting that small, 
independent firms did some 84 
per cent of what was an esti- 
mated vending industry volume 
of $2.7 billion in 1961. 

The gross for 1963 is ex- 
pected to surpass this, possibly 
hitting $3 billion. If Risman's 
prediction holds true - and it 
has every indication of doing so 
-the independent firms should 
at least hold their own and very 

BILLBOARD 

MAN IN 
NEWS 

industry liaison with the State 
board of health. 

The Pennsylvania association 
is an affiliate of NAMA. 

CLEAN MUSIC FOR EXPORT 
MODEL 222 Seeburg 160 Sol. Stereo 

% 

S 

MODEL 201 Seeburg 

05' S KDSeeburg 2.l OB Se g S0S MODEL S 0e MODEL Wu 04 Sel. 

WRITE FOR PRICES OCEAN -CRATED F.O.B. NEW YORK, 
NEW ORLEANS, SAN FRANCISCO 

DUNCAN SALES CO. 
(Formerly Known as Music Systems -Est. 1930) 

737 Carnegie Avenue, Cleveland 15, Ohio, CHerry 1 -3801 

LOUIS J. RISMAN 

probably will increase their 
share of the market. 

No Easy Road 
Risman doesn't see any easy 

road. He feels the independent 
firms must use proper manage- 
ment and aggressive sales and 
promotion to succeed. By doing 
this, he feels, they have ad- 
vantages over national firms. 

These he lists as mobility, 
ability to make spot decisions, 
and the ability to participate 
fully in community affairs. "Re- 
member that competiticn with 
national companies is not at the 
national but at the local level," 
he emphasized. "Ours has al- 
ways been an industry of small, 
locally owned businesses." 

Risman has been a member 
of the NAMA board of direc- 
tors since 1953, a member of 
the executive committee since 
1957 and has served as senior 
vice -president. In addition, he 
has been a member or chairman 
of almost every vending corn - 
mittee of the association. 

He is president of Mystic 
Automatic Sales Company, Inc., 
Medford, Mass., a cigaret vend- 
ing service company which he 
founded in 1932. 

when it comes to BASEB 
the 
name 
is 

Wialei/M4 
coming soon... 
ALL NEW for 1963 

Williams 

MAJOR 
LEAGUE 

9tiatima ELECTRONIC MANUFACTURING CORP, 

4242 W. FILLMORE ST. CHICAGO 24, ILLINOIS 

He is also president of five 
additional companies. These in- 
clude: Automatic Candy Serv- 
ice Company, a full -line auto- 
matic vending service company 
providing local industry with 
complete automatic meal and 
refreshment service; Vendoma- 
tic Corporation; L. J. Risman, 
Inc., and H. C. Brown, Inc., 
both wholesale tobacco and 
candy firms, and Risman Realty 
Corporation, which owns vari- 
ous properties in the Medford 
area. 

Characterized as a man who 
works hard for his business, in- 
dustry and community, Risman 
contributes much of his time to 
charitable and civic causes. 

He is vice -president of Law- 
rence Memorial Hospital Board; 
director of the Middlesex Coun- 
ty National Bank and the Med- 
ford Chamber of Commerce, 
and a member of the Advisory 
Board of the Salvation Army 
and the Executive Board, Fells 
Council, Boy Scouts of America. 

He is also past president of 
the Rotary Club of Medford; 
past director of the Hebrew 
Home for the Aged and a past 
vice- president and founder of 
the Medford Jewish Community 
Center. 

Community Work 
Risman has chaired fund rais- 

ing committees for such activi- 
ties as the Combined Jewish 
Appeal, hospital building fund, 
cancer drive, Boy Scout mem- 
bership and the Salvation Army 
camp drive. 

He is the recipient of two 
citations: The "Outstanding Man 
Award," presented in 1957 by 
the Medford Lions Club, and 
the "Brotherhood Award," pre- 
sented by B'nai B'rith in 1958. 

Born February 20, 1908 in 
Medford, Risman attended pri- 
mary and secondary schools 
there and graduated from the 
Bentley College of Business in 
Boston where he majored in 
accounting and finance. 

He is married to the former 
Mollie Perlmutter. They have 
two daughters and five grand- 
children. 

Gambling Charge 

Costs Owner $100 
BEAUMONT, Tex. - T. J. 

O'Quinn, operator of the Der- 
rick Nite Club here, was assessed 
a $100 fine and court costs on a 
charge accusing him of per- 
mitting gambling on premises 
under his control. 

Justice of the Peace Wallace 
McCasland said a plea of guilty 
was entered for O'Quinn by Guy 
Carriker, the night club's attor- 
ney. 

O'Quinn was accused of al- 
lowing bets to be placed on 
shuffle alley games being played 
at the club. The charge against 
him was filed by the sheriff's 
department. 

McCasland said another such 
charge against O'Quinn and 
similar charges against Floyd J. 
Lanelos and Sherill Dean Cline, 
bartenders at the club, are sched- 
uled to be dismissed on motions 
by the district attorney's office. 
The district attorney's office said 
the charges are being dismissed 
because of "insufficient evi- 
dence" 

They Showed, Too 
PHILADELPHIA - Allan 

and Rossi, ABC -Paramount re- 
cording stars, were headliners at 
the recent Variety Club awards 
dinner here. Their names were 
inadvertently omitted in last 
week's account of the festivities. 

BARGAINS 
FOR THE WEEK 

GAMES GAMES 
250 OF THEM 

Received a Large Lot of Drink 
and Coffee Vending Machines in 
Trade, also a Large Lot of 
Phonographs. 

WHAT DO YOU NEEDI 
Unitest Minl -Bowl, 
Advance 354938 

Bally Challenger Bowler 350.00 
Bally Sfrtke 16930 
Rowe 2700 Cigarette Vendee, 

repatnled Hammerlold finish 
and Z:ri eTr 725.00 Duónnier 12 Cel. Cigarette Vendee 139.50 DuGnnler 16 Col. Cigarette 
Vanden 149.5° 

Keene 22 Col. Cigarett e 

E. leehr ' Cigarette 
125.00 

Vsnde 1]2.00 
Smoke Shop V -27 200.00 

Write or Call Us Culled. 
MAIn 1.3511 

Wrifa for Our Price Llsf on Full Line of CoinOperated Ma<hlnes. 

OIT R 1 au TORS.11e. 

2315 Olive St., St. louis 3, Mo. 

\. Phone: MAin 1.3511; Cable: Cendist 
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IT PROMOTES 
ITSELF 

From its colorful, play- inviting 
dome display to its glowing stereo 

promotion panel, the Wurlitzer 
2700 is a beautiful advertisement 

for itself. By sight, by light and 

by sound, it sells music around the 

clock in every location it graces. 

IT HELPS SERVICE 
ITSELF 

Another Wurlitzer exclusive. The 

program unit lowers in a vertical 
position to speed title strip changing. 

Record changing is almost 
automatic. Tone arm adjustment 

and needle changing are simple, 
high-speed operations on this 

phonograph that practically takes 

care of itself. 

YW RLITZIR,' r. s.,r.. 1t1tlGEE>l, 
TEN my TUNES 

... AND MANI 
HOW IT TAKES IN MONEY 
A galaxy of extra income stimulators headed by the 
Golden Selector Bar actuated Ten Top Tunes feature, 
this greatest of all Wurlitzers is shattering previous totals 
for making money wherever installed. 

WURLITZER 2700 
THE WURLITZER COMPANY / NORTH TONAWANDA. N. V. 

707 YEARS OF MUSICAL EXPERIENCE 

Copyrighted material 
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ISHUFFLEBOARD 
SCOREBOARDS 

Colo operated. 15 it and/or 
SO points (HOna<ofNr). Over- 

'.7.7%:::11:1:2.!%14.1:4* 
l on 
with Cox. 

$159.50 

0 SPECIALS! 
0 POOL SUPPLIES / 5-0z. eumoer POOI e,llf (10).S 9.00 

40:. eumper Pool e,llf 110). 7.30 a,s, 1-lu w/cu 6,11.. 12.50 

/iYScü 
ilf, 1-1s w/cua e,'°. 

si' cues st.9s e.r u l.so ca. 
u7" Cus, 52.95 sa.l ]I.00 dL 
4H^ PNsHC Cvs 330 ,.; 
s2^ PNftlo Cuas ].DOe,.; 
37^ PNsHC Cues ]30sa.1 .PNitic Triangles, 2ys^.... 1.00 / We cem wmPleN IEm eF Peol 

Suppllsi-WrE» for IESr. 

%s Dopdsit, dalanso C.O.D. / or S.D. 

IMARVEL Mantrfecnlriny co. 
2H45 W. FulNrfen Aw. 

Chlc,HO 47, 111. 

PHONOGRAPH PLAST!(S 
we 
Ior 

carrryy 71.111 en i p N.SMa 

Writ. 4, INraun. .. 

Phone: Dickens 2ß424 

ADVERTISINB IN 

SUSINESSPAPERS 
MEANS BUSINESS 

If Enough People Wash, Juke Box OK 
KANSAS CITY, Mo. -Coin operated laundries 

are good juke box locations only if the traffic is 
sufficient to draw as many as 40 or 50 customers 
in the installation at one time. That's been the 
experience of the United Music Company, which 
operates automatic phonographs in several such 
stops here. 

A typical United location is the Norge Laundry- 
Cleaning Village, on Main Street, some 25 blocks 
out of the downtown district. It has 40 washing 
machines, 16 dry cleaning machines, 10 dryers and 
a fairly large assortment of associated equipment. 
The plant handles upwards of 250 laundry loads 
per day, and more than 100 dry cleaning loads, 
which means that an average of 300 persons are 
pulled into the store during the 12 operating hours 
of each day. 

There are bound to be many who like hit music, 
and prefer to while away the time playing the juke 
box, rather than attempting to hear a television 
set over the sound of the washing and dry cleaning 
equipment, or trying to read, or carry on a con- 
versation. 

$15 Average 
Play has been steady enough to amount to 

around $15 per week, sometimes running to as 

much as $25. The juke box is as far removed as 
possible from the noisier machines at the front of 
the store, and the management provided plenty of 
comfortable lounges and wing chairs on which 
music fans can relax while the box is playing. 

A pair of accelerated amplitude speakers, care- 
fully apexed at opposite ends of the front wall are 
a big help as well, providing plenty of sound level, 
beamed into the area directly in front of the juke 
box, but not a problem to those a bit further back 
in the coin -op. 

Used for the purpose is a five -year -old box, a 
100 -play phonograph in relatively good condition, 
protected from vandalism by the all -glass front of 
the store, where it is continuously visible. 

Old Favorites 
Programming for the location is a matter of pro- 

viding plenty of middle of the road hits, of the 
type most likely to appeal to housewives, rather 
than teen -agers; plenty of old favorites, and sur- 
prisingly, a large amount of waltz music. This 
probably has a psychological aspect, appealing to 
weary housewives. 

Records are not changed as often as in standard 
locations, actually less than half as often, and the 
commissions run lower than in tavern locations. 

EUROPEAN NEWS BRIEFS 
Ops Protest TV Show 

HAMBURG - The German 
trade is organizing a protest 
campaign against an anti -payout 
television program on the quasi - 
state controlled TV network. 
The TV show "Panorama" pre- 
sented West Germany's 225,000 
payout machines as an unmiti- 
gated evil which should be 
wiped out forthwith. Panorama 
claimed children were squander- 
ing lunch money and workers 
substantial amounts from their 
wages on the so- called "Geld - 
schluecker" -money swallowing 
machines. The trade accuses the 

"Prolit-kletAPAI" From 

Chicago coin 
"ALI. STAR" BASEBALL ROYAL CROWN BOWLER 

CITATION PUCK BOWLER 

CHICAGO DYNAMIC INDUSTRIES. INC. 1725 W. DIVERSEM. CHICAGO 14 

0. \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ . \ \ \\ \_may 
0 WORLD WIDE -World's Greatest 

0 

Selection of Quality Equipment 
p 

0 c. 

AMUSEMENT GUNS 
C. C. RAT GUN ..$29S RALLY DERBY GUN 5150 

C. C. PONY EXPRESS 

MIDWAY SHOOTING LGALLERY 175 WMS. HERCULES 

SHARPSHOOTER 

195 

355 

UN. CARNIVAL GUN 125 WMS. TITAN .. 295 \ 
SHUFFLE ALLEYS PHONOGRAPHS / 

UNITED ATLAS 5225 ROCK-01A 1475 -200 5475 0 I UNITED CHIEF 95 ROCK -OLA 1468 -120 425 / 
/ UNITED EAGLE .... .... 185 ROCK -OLA 1458 -120 345 

OUNITED HANDICAP REG'L 145 ROCKALA 1454 -120 255 / UNITED NIAGARA 245 ROCK -OLA 1448 -120 195 / / UNITED REGULATION 125 ROCK -0LA 1465 -200 295 / 
ROCK -0lA 1455 -200 225 / 

0 
/ SPECIAL! SEEBLß6 

WE CARRY THE MOST COMPLETE 

g 

3W1 Chrome LINE OF PHONOGRAPHS, GAMES / 
WALL BOXES, onl $34.50 and VENDING / 

O I" EQUIPMENT. / 
Write for / 

- s? complete / 
r.n 

i 
Terms: 1/5 Deposit 

. Sight C.O.D. / 
._ t._ 

(ftl[ 
"GAMES" (hop 

2732 W. FULLERTON AVE , CHICAGO 47, ILL. EVerglade 4 -2300 

TV show of being biased, un- 
informed and deliberately reck- 
less with the facts. The payouts 
are defended as being relatively 
harmless compared with some 
of the murder films screened on 
TV. 

Kids Not Tax Exempt 
COLOGNE -"Mom and Pop 

coin machine establishments 
which use the proprietors' chil- 
dren in regular employment, 
slots are required to treat the 
children as regular employees 
for tax purposes, according to a 
court ruling. The same social 
security taxes must be paid, and 
their wages must be calculated at 
the prevailing wages for the jobs 
they fill. More and more Ger- 
man operators are contracting 
to "mom and pop" operation 
where older children are 
groomed for route work, while 
dad does servicing and mom 
runs the office. 

Dr. Jutzi Reaches 70 
BAD KREUZNACH - Dr. 

Friedrich Jutzi, the "grand old 
man" of the German coin ma- 
chine trade, has celebrated his 
70th birthday. A director of the 
Seitz- Automatenbaugesellschaft. 
Dr. Jutzi has spent his entire 
working life in the coin machine 
field. After receiving his doc- 
torate in jurisprudence, Dr. 
Jutzi joined the Seitz firm. In 
1927 he took charge of the coin 
machine branch. He has served 
as an officer in the leading 
German coin machine organiza- 
tions, including the Verein 
Deutscher Automatenfachleute 
and the Verbandes der Deuts- 
chen Automatenidustrie e.V., 
Cologne. Dr. Jutzi is the leading 
legal authority in the German 
trade and one of its top finance 
experts. 

Ops Press Expansion 
FRANKFURT -German op- 

erator associations are encour- 
aging phonograph operators to 
diversify into vending and even 
in -plant feeding as the most 
promising avenue to continued 
solvency. Trade studies show 
that an increasing number of 
German operators are success- 
fully blending phonograph op- 
eration and vending. These 
studies also claim there is fan- 
tastic opportunity in the vending 
field. A recent study indicates, 
for example. that there arc only 
1,700 hot beverage machines in 
all of West Germany (at the 
end of 1962). West Germany 
has only 33 hot beverage ma- 

chines per million population 
compared with 98 for Holland, 
236 for Switzerland, and 979 
for the United States. Most of 
Germany's hot beverage vend- 
ing machines are concentrated 
in factories, leaving a vast open 
field for operator enterprise. 

U. S. Ops Like Antilles 
AMSTERDAM -The Dutch 

colonial office reports that it is 

receiving inquiries from Ameri- 
can coin machine firms inter- 
ested in establishing "Best -of- 
both- worlds" manufacturing fa- 
cilities on the Dutch Antilles, the 
six islands, including Aruba and 
Curacao, off the Venezuelan 
coast. The attraction of the 
Antilles is that they offer a 
"back door" to the European 
Common Market, while provid- 
ing geographic proximity to the 
Latin American market. The 
Antilles automatically acquire 
Common Market membership as 
a Dutch possession. This means 
that U. S. firms locating on the 
Antilles can operate in the 
Common Market and enjoy si- 
multaneously proximity to Latin 
markets. Moreover, labor is 
cheap and plentiful in the An- 
tilles and manufacturing sites 
still reasonably priced. "It is a 
paradise," observed a Dutch co- 
lonial official, "but like all para- 
dises it won't last long." 

Russians for Wurlitzer 
HELSINKI -The Wurlitzer 

distributor in Helsinki, Pohjoi- 
suminen Saehkoe - osakeyhtioe, 
is a celebrity among phonograph 
connoisseurs in the Soviet Union 
without probably being aware 
of the fact. A high percentage 
of phonographs now in opera- 
tion in the Soviet Union are of 
U. S. manufacture, and the 
largest number of the U. S. 
machines are estimated to be 
Wurlitzers. In fact, to many 
Russians, Wurlitzer is synono- 
mous with phonograph. Finally, 
most of the Wurlitzers arriving 
in Russia are shipped from 
Helsinki. The Finnish distribu- 
tor is well known in the Russian 
trade as the Reds' link to Wurl- 
itzer. He gets mail from Moscow 
simply addressed to "Gsopodin 
Wurlitzer -Helsinki." 

Push Phonos as Cultural 
PARIS -French operators are 

pushing a campaign to popu- 
larize phonographs as a cultural 
ploy. The operators are mar- 
shalling statistics showing that 
phonograph locations do better 
financially on the average and 
have a higher "prestige image" 
than non -phonograph locations 
in the same areas. Further 
studies are being conducted 
with the aim of establishing 

Barney Blatt Dies; 

Veteran Music Op 
BOSTON - Word .has been 

received here of the death 
of Barney Blatt in Port Char- 
lotte, Fla., January 25. A long- 
time resident of Brookline, he 
went to Florida two years ago 
because of a heart ailment. He 
was the father of Arnold Blatt, 
Brookline music operator and 
the brother of Louis Blatt, now 
of Meredith, N. H. 

The brothers entered the mu- 
sic business after World War I 
and became New England dis- 
tributors for Seeburg phono- 
graphs. During the 1950's they 
operated under the firm name 
of Atlas Distributors and were 
distributors for the AMI line. 
Services were held January 29 
at Levine Chapel in Brookline. 
A memorial week was also held 
at the home of Arnold Blatt, 
160 Lancaster Terrace, Brook- 
line. 

Melo -Tone 
Continued from page 43 

the local music operators is will- 
ing to set up the machinery. 

"Today, as never before, the 
industry needs a protective or- 
ganization," Baker said. "This is 
particularly true of the small 
operator who is now faced with 
greater demands for advance 
commission and new equipment 
as well as having to contend 
with the modem mobile facili- 
ties in use by distributors." 

Baker sees a good year ahead, 
but contends it will be one of 
great challenge as public tastes 
change and relocation hazards 
face locations and operators. 
New trends in the music busi- 
ness, he believes, need new ap- 
praisals by operators, not only 
concerning business, but in the 
important field of public rela- 
tions and a good public image. 
These goals can only be reached 
through an organization such as 
the area once boasted. 

that phonograph playing in- 
creases interest in culture. There 
is no effort to equate phono- 
graph pop with Bach, Brahms, 
and Beethoven. But the French 
studies do show that (1) phono- 
graph patrons also listen to 
more serious music than non- 
phonograph location patrons; 
and (2) the cultural content of 
phonograph music is rising 
steadily, as is established by 
Seeburg's introduction of the 
LP console. 

Ban de Gaulle Spoofs 
MONTE CARLO - Prince 

Rainier has requested Mone- 
gasque juke box operators to 
remove disks offensive to France 
and especially to General de 
Gaulle. Rainier's request is the 
result of the virtual settlement 
he has reached with de Gaulle 
on Monaco's tax and customs 
dispute. France has threateneed 
to strip Monaco of its status as 
a tax sanctuary in reprisal for 
the influx of foreign firms into 
the principality. Rainier has ne- 
gotiated a settlement requiring 
foreign firms to pay taxes and 
customs to France, but contin- 
uing the exemption for bonafide 
Monegasque citizens. Juke box 
operators have been program- 
ming disks spoofing General de 
Gaulle as Jean d'Arc and a 
paper tiger and France as a 
gallic Goliath facing a resolute 
David (Prince Rainier). Now, 
however, Rainier is stressing to 
Monegasque jukemen that while 
he appreciates their patriotic 
fervor, the time has come to 
trim sails and cultivate de 
Gaulle. 
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TOP COMBINATION 
FOR EVERY LOCATION 

NEW 

PHONOGRAPH 

The music system that's set- 
ting the pace in sales and loca- 
tion appeal. Outstanding styl- 
ing, play -stimulating features 
and a realistic price make it 
the preferred phonograph 
among operators, locations 
and the public alike. 

THE 

RIVIERA 
WORLD'S LEADING 

CIGARETTE 
SELLER 

"Personalized" location panel. 
Large 800 -pack, 20- column ca- 
pacity. Vends every type of 
pack or box. Say -A -Match 
feature reduces operating cost. 
Available in four distinctive 
color combinations including 
new rich Executive Walnut. 
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ROWE AC SERVICES 
in S. Michigan Avenue, Chicago 3, Illinois, ANdover 3 -0555 

See Your 
ROWE AC SERVICES 
Distributor 
Atlanta, Georgia 
FRIEDMAN AMUSEMENT COMPANY 
Birmingham, Alabama 
BIRMINGHAM VENDING COMPANY 
Boston, Massachusetts 
TRIMOUNT AUTOMATIC SALES CORP. 
Bristol, Virginia 
ROANOKE VENDING EXCHANGE, INC. 
Buffalo, New York 
SHELDON SALES DISTRIBUTING CORP. 
Charleston, West Virginia 
ROANOKE VENDING EXCHANGE, INC. 
Chicago, Illinois 
ATLAS MUSIC COMPANY 
Cincinnati, Ohio 
ROYAL DISTRIBUTING, INC. 
Cleveland, Ohio 
MONROE COIN MACHINE EXCHANGE, INC. 
Columbus, Ohio 
ROYAL DISTRIBUTING, INC. 
Dallas, Texas 
SOUTHERN VENDING COMPANY 
Denver, Colorado 
R. F. JONES COMPANY 
Des Moines, louva 
ATLAS MUSIC COMPANY 
Detroit, Michigan 
MILLER -NEWMARK DISTRIBUTING CO. 
East Hartford, Connecticut 
RUNYON SALES COMPANY 
Grand Rapids, Michigan 
MILLER -NEWMARK DISTRIBUTING CO. 
Honolulu, Hawaii 
R. F. JONES COMPANY 
Houston, Texas 
GARDNER SALES CORPORATION 
Indianapolis, Indiana 
SOUTHERN AUTOMATIC MUSIC CO., INC. 

Jacksonville, Florida 
BUSH INTERNATIONAL, INC. 
Kansas City, Missouri 
W. B. MUSIC COMPANY, INC. 
Lexington, Kentucky 
SOUTHERN AUTOMATIC MUSIC CO. 
Los Angeles, California 
R. F. JONES COMPANY 
Louisville, Kentucky 
SOUTHERN AUTOMATIC MUSIC CO. 
Memphis, Tennessee 
SOUTHERN AMUSEMENT DISTRIBUTING CO. 
Miami, Florida 
BUSH INTERNATIONAL, INC. 
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 
PIONEER SALES á SERVICE, INC. 
Montreal, Quebec, Canada 
R. C. GILCHRIST (QUEBEC) LTD. 
Nashville, Tennessee 
HERMITAGE MUSIC COMPANY 
New Orleans, Louisiana 
J. H. LYNCH CO., INC. 
New York, New York 
RUNYON SALES COMPANY 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 
AUTOMATIC MUSIC DISTRIBUTORS 
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 
DAVID ROSEN, INC. 
Phoenix, Arizona 
GARRISON SALES CO., INC. 
Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania 
BANNER SPECIALTY COMPANY 
Richmond, Virginia 
ROANOKE VENDING EXCHANGE, INC. 

St. Louis, Missouri 
CENTRAL DISTRIBUTORS, INC. 
Salt Lake City, Utah 
R. F. JONES COMPANY 
San Antonio, Texas 
SANTONE SALES COMPANY 
San Francisco, California 
R. F. JONES COMPANY 
Santurce, Puerto Rico 
BUSH INTERNATIONAL, INC. 
Seattle, Washington 
R. F. JONES COMPANY 
Springfield, New Jersey 
RUNYON SALES COMPANY 
Tampa, Florida 
BUSH INTERNATIONAL, INC. 
Toronto, Ontario 
GILCHRIST VENDING, LTD. 
Vancouver, B. C. Canada 
R. C. GILCHRIST (VANCOUVER) LTD. 
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FOR SALE 
GAMES & BOWLERS 

Wild West Gun $245.00 
Midway Shooting Gallery 

Deluxe . . 195.00 
United Handicap Shuffle 65.00 
Chicoin Championship Shuffle 95.00 
Keeney Highstraight .... 125.00 
Miss Annabelle 165.00 
Williams Tic- TacToe 75.00 
Bally U.S.A. (convened) 195.00 
Bally Congress Shuffle 95.00 
Congress Shuffle .... 85.00 

PHONOS 
Worn., 2400, 2404, 2410.0595.00 
Wurlilser 2500, 2504, 2510. 695.00 
Wurlitrer 2300 495.00 
AMI 0200 145.00 
RockOla HideAWay 1440 75.00 

CIGARETTE VENDORS 
Smokeshop, 9 column .. ..525.00 
Eastern, 22 column 45.00 

Call Writ. or We' ablt: L EWJ 

WSmake=sdn iretiIláti r 

lei' one Distributing Co. 

Exclusive Wurlitter Distributor 
1301 N. Capitol Ave. 329 W. Ninth St. 

Indianapolis, Ind. 
Covington, Ky. 

Greater Cincinnati 
Tel.: MElrose 5.1593 Tel.: AX 1.6969 

when answering ads . . . 

Say You Saw It in 
Billboard 

Common Market Nix Jolts Show Hectic Pace Brings Awards to Op 
Continued from page 39 Continued from page 42 

the afternoon. In view of the 
bone -chilling cold that pene- 
trated every cubic foot of the 
high -ceilinged hall, their con- 
tinued presence was a tribute 
to their devotion to their in- 
dustry and their physical stam- 
ina. The turnout was remark- 
able, too, considering the 
weather which was nearly as 
uncomfortable inside the hall 
as it was outside. England was 
beginning to recover from its 
worst cold snap in decades as 
the exhibition got under way. 

Payouts Big 
The show itself was domi- 

nated by payout machines, 
which are legal in private clubs 
here. These machines are the 
mainstay of the United Kingdom 
coin machine economy, which 
in many cases allow British op- 
erators to buy new and late 
model automatic phonographs. 
It is estimated that about half 
of Britain's juke box operators 
also operate the payout ma- 
chines and this percentage is 
growing. In public locations, 
where cash payouts are illegal, 
machines which pay out chits 
redeemable in merchandise are 

We have whatever you need in 

GOTTLIEB GAMES! 
Contact Us Today 

World's Largest Distributor of Pinballs 
Exclusive Gottlieb and R.ckOla Distributor for Eastern 

Pennsylvania, South Jersey and Delaware. 

You can ALWAYS depend 

onACTIVEALI WAYS 

Exclusiva Chicago Area 
Distributor for 

WURLITZER 
PHONOGRAPH 

and PARTS 

AMUSEMENT MACHINES CO. 
666 N. Broad 5t., Philo. 30, Pa. 

POplar 9 -4495 
Write or wire for prices 

IMPORTERS 
SEND FOR 

FREE 
LATEST CATALOG 

64 Pages -Fully 
Illustrated. 

COIN MACHINE 
EXCHANGE, INC. 

, toc Kline 
Cable: "FIRSTCOIN-- Chicano 

CHICAGO 22, ILLINOIS Dickens 2 -0500 

1 
AT LAS ... Reconditioned- Guaranteed .. 

0 MUSIC GAMES VENDING _.____.________ 

NATIONAL CANDY, 10 Col. Slant 265 

VENDING 

.. 

MUSIC 
ROWE Lí000, 4 Flavor 

DuGRENIER K12 fig. (Man.).. 

$595 

145 

A.M.I. 1.100M C50í) $350 
ROWE RV150 (Fresh Bevo) .. 445 A.M.I. CONTINENTAL 2.200 (50c). 745 .. 

A.M.I. 1.200E (50e) 395 SEEBURG El Cig. 200 
CORSAIR (30.011 (lg. 165 
YENDO ICE CREAM #y210, P.S 395 
VENDO MILK #210, P.S. 395 
STONER CANDY, Mod. 180, 6 /M 175 
APCO 4Flavor Ice (Dual Comp.) 1095 

e 

ROCKOLA 1448 245 
RO(KOLA 1455 245 
SEEBURG 220.50 (S0c) 595 
UNITED UPA100 175 
WURLITZER 2400 Stereo (50c) 59S 
WURLITZER 2510 Peron (50c) 595 

GAMES 
Completely Reconditioned 

Gottlieb LIBERTY BELLE 4/p...5465 Genen STATE FAIR Gun $175 
Gottlieb FLIPPER CLOWN 265 (blcoin CLASSIC BOWLER 175 
Gottlieb SEVEN SEAS 175 United NIAGARA S.A ISO 

1/3 Dep ., Bal. e.O.D. or Cable: "ATMUSIC' -(hlta o sI ht Dnft. r___ 
Distributors for 

g 
AMI -ROWE -BALLY 

A Quarter 
Century 

of Service 
BRANCH OF ROWE -AC SERVICES DIVISION 

DES MOINES, IOWA / CHICAGO 47, ILL. / 
1120 Walnut St. 2122 N. Western Ave. 

Ph.s 283-2393 / ARmitags 6-5005 

legal. This practice is not con- 
sidered gambling. All this does 
not bode too well for the future 
of flippers, shuffle alleys and 
other type novelty devices. 

As long as fast action equip- 
ment is regarded with tolerance 
here, the slower earning devices 
won't do too well. However, 
most observers feel the poten- 
tial for juke boxes in the United 
Kingdom hasn't been scratched. 
Best guesses are that some 
16,000 juke boxes are in opera- 
tion and that at least double 
that number could be placed. 

Piano Player Out 
Only recently have pubs been 

opening up as juke box loca- 
tions, with the pianist being re- 
placed by the music machine. 
Pub owners have discovered 
that musical entertainment need 
not be an expense but that 
it actually can be a source of 
revenue. 

To date, British operators 
have not developed the sharp 
competitive practices developed 
by their American counterparts. 
Bonuses and loans are unknown 
and front money of about $8 
a week is fairly common. 
The commission split is a 
straight 50 -50. With the payout 
machine economy, Britain's posi- 
tion in the coin machine world 
is somewhat unique. With Brit- 
ain's failure to win admission to 
the European Common Market, 
it will continued to remain 
unique. 

British coinmen have been 
looking forward to Common 
Market ties, which would enable 
them to buy West German juke 
boxes with a minimum of red 
tape and duty. Had Britain 
joined the Common Market, it 
was also expected that the 
United States would strike some 
sort of deal with the European 
economic entity and that some 
sort of North Atlantic trade bloc 
would enable a free flow of 
automatic phonographs to move 
with little interference. France's 
adamant stand with regard to 
Britain's entry into the Common 
Market has dashed these hopes 
for some time. 

Heavy Import 
While the ATE, on the sur- 

face, seemed to be a giant dis- 
play of payout machines, its im- 
portance in the music machine 
world should not be regarded 
lightly. Seeburg and Wurlitzer 
maintained headquarters in a 
nearby hotel and were con- 
stantly bringing coinmen from 
the hall to their hospitality 
suites. Al Adickes, Rock -Ola's 
man in Hamburg, and the big- 
gest individual seller of juke 
boxes on the Continent, was 
very much in evidence. Distribu- 
tors for Wurlitzer, Rock -Ola and 
Rowe -AMI maintained booths 
on the floor and Automatic Can- 
teen of Great Britain, a subsidi- 
ary of Automatic Canteen Cor- 
poration of America, displayed 
the Rowe -AMI juke box and the 
Rowe cigaret machine. 

Neither was the show ignored 
by European music machine 
manufacturers. Symplay, the 
United Kingdom outlet for the 
Symphony juke box made in 
West Germany by Bergmann 
and Company, showed the Sym- 
phonie 100 -selection floor model 
and wall model. Phonographic 
Equipment Company, Ltd., now 
representing Jupiter, the French - 
made machine, showed three 
models of the unit. Electec, Ber- 
lin - based manufacturer, dis- 
played two juke box models, as 
well as a football game and grip 
test. Another German - made 
phonograph, Fanfare, was dis- 
played by Autslot, Ltd., British 
outlet for the machines. A more 
detailed report of the exhibition 
will appear in next week's issue 
of Billboard. 

overlooking Los Angeles. While 
it is just a few minutes from 
Sunset Boulevard, Weiner re- 
laxes in the amazement that 
such quiet can be so close to 
a busy thoroughfare. 

Weiner was born near Youngs- 
town, Ohio, 38 years ago and 
finished school at Brookfield 
High in that area in 1942. That 
same year, he enlisted in the 
Marines and received basic train- 
ing at Parris Island, S. C., and 
advance combat instruction - 
which he used in the Marshall 
Islands, Saipan and other battles 
up to two Jima - at Camp 
Pendleton in Southern Califor- 
nia. 

When he was discharged in 
November, 1945, he remained 
in Los Angeles. After about a 
year as a window trimmer for a 
drugstore chain, he went into the 
food market business. In the 
meantime, his brother, who was 
studying pre -med at the Uni- 
versity of California, Los An- 
geles (UCLA) had been operat- 
ing 10 penny venders with serv- 
ice on Saturdays. His study load 
increased and Leo took over the 
small operation. He saw the 
profit and potential in bulk 
vending and left the market 
field. 

Early Joiner 
Soon after he started operat- 

ing on his own and had only 
about 100 machines, he joined 
the Western Vending Machine 
Operators Association. He has 

Coast Ops Win 
Continued from page 42 

submitted facts and figures on 
the earnings from machines. 
This will be considered during 
the revision. At the present 
time the rate is $1 per year 
for penny machines and $4 per 
machine for 5 -cent units. Zola 
pointed out that the municipality 
assesses package machines at 
$4 and charges $25 for a retail 
business license. 

Zola has been tax representa- 
tive for the organization for 15 
months. During that time, he has 
been successful in the conver- 
sion of several municipalities 
from a per machine to a flat li- 
cense. 

Aaron Gold announced that 
he had sold his route and mov- 
ing to Tucson, Ariz. He plans 
to have a full -time operation in 
that State. 

Mike Wolohen of PMK Serv- 
ice, Rosemead, was welcomed 
as a new member. 

Sreden cited highlights of his 
more than 20 years in bulk 
vending during a general dis- 
cussion led by Bud Harris. 

Mass. Operators 
Continued from page 41 

they set up a show at the month- 
ly meeting of the Western Mas- 
sachusetts Operators Associa- 
tion. Among operators present 
were: Frank Fendell, Brook- 
line; Gerry Balboni, Springfield; 
Walter Grazick, Greenfield; 
Arthur Sturgis, Boston; George 
Edney and Tom Libbey, Haver- 
hill; Leon Sherter, Newton; Earl 
Westray and Jack Rubin of Bos- 
ton; Jim Stillings, Danvers; Fred 
Koufos, Dedham; Ed Ross Bos- 
ton; Leo A. Denault and George 
Chandler, Rochester, N. H.; 
Martin Oliver, Scarboro, Me; 
Bill Hamel, Manchester, N. H.; 
Tony DeLuca, Cranston, R. I.; 
Bob Lyons, Skowhegan, Me.; 
Arthur Rode, Terryville, Conn.; 
B. J. Onofrio, Bristol, Conn., 
and Romeo Rivard, Lewiston, 
Me. 

served on about every committee 
and was president for two one- 
year terms. He now works 
closely with the association's 
tax representative, Eugene Zola. 

Weiner feels that every bulk 
operator in California, partic- 
ularly those around Los Angeles 
and in Southern California, 
should be members of the as- 
sociation. 

"I feel that the Western Vend- 
ing Machine Operators Associa- 
tion has been the backbone for 
all the crusades against taxes, 
per machine licenses, and any- 
thing that would be unfair and 
discriminatory against the vend- 
ing machine business as far as 
the bulk part of the industry is 
concerned," he says. 

Request Menu 
Continued from page 41 

wants to hear on the phono- 
graph, with disappointingly low 
play. 

Undecided 
It hasn't been decided as yet 

whether A -1 Skyline Music will 
return to more conventional 
methods of programming, on the 
theory that it may require twice 
as much time to create a route 
which programs itself through 
requests. 

The veteran collectors who do 
most of the programming of 
course know their locations well, 
mix regularly with tavern and 
restaurant patrons, and have 
thus a feel for possible play suc- 
cess which isn't easily gained 
otherwise. 

One sure fact which has come 
from recent experiments is that 
old favorites should be given a 
larger percentage of the music 
menu. In experimenting along 
these lines, Skyline Music Corn - 
pany has found that old favor- 
ites frequently show returns 
equal to those of new hit num- 
bers, and consequently, an aver- 
age of four new hits and four 
old favorites go on at every rec- 
ord change. 

Knight is convinced, as well 
as DeBaca, that making selec- 
tions from radio station favorite 
lists are no real help, inasmuch 
as these reflect the opinion of 
teen -agers, who are not the 
group most likely to drop large 
quantities of coins in the box. 

Minus Zero Cold 
Continued from page 41 

tributor here reported he was 
getting calls for a "Jive Samba" 
LP which he didn't even have 
in stock, and wouldn't for some 
time. 

The Kingston Trio was doing 
well with a new Capitol disking 
of "Greenback Dollar." Other 
good juke box sides were "Love 
for Sale" Art Lyman, Hi -Fi, and 
"Big Wide World," Teddy Ran- 
dazzo, Colpix. 

Over -all buying, however, was 
reported down from last year 
by Singer. "Operator collections 
are off, and so is he record 
buying," was the comment of 
Singer's manager, Gus. 

New Choice Vend Hq. 
HARTFORD, Conn. -Choice - 

Vend, Connecticut division of 
Seeburg Corporation, will move 
into new plant facilities on Turn- 
pike Road in suburban Windsor 
Locks in March. Construction 
is near completion now. The 
new plant will contain 268,000 
square feet of space, about two 
and a half times the present 
Hartford facility's availability, 
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PLAYBOARD AUTO. 
CLAMP-No more screws to 
hold the playboard I Just pull the 
lever and litt the board! Gives 
immediate access to interior 
mechanism. Trulya service man's 
dream. 

KEW 

FRONT DOOR- Heavier! 
Sturdier! Coin return on door. 
Only one return for either one or 
two chutes. Beautiful dimen- 
sional effect. 

HEW 

KIGZ3O i.]M AI 

DOUBLE -ARM LOCK - 
Stronger! Twin steel bars lock 
in two places for maximum pro- 
tection. Moulding clamp for 
added safety. 

sri 

New "Nard- Cote" 
Fiaish Extends Playboard 

Life to as All -Time 
High! 

DOUBLE -SIZE CASH BOX- EXTRA -BALL FEATURE - 
Much larger! Holds twice as Hitting the Roto -Star earns the 
many coins as conventional box. player an extra ball. Exclusive 
Easily removed from new "step play -maker adds more player 
down" cabinet design. appeal. 

SEE THE MAGIC OF 

THESE PLAY -MAKING, 

PROFIT- MAKING FEATURES: 

Extra ball feature made by hitting Roto -Star 

Making rollovers advances Roto -Target value 

Hitting Roto -Target scores indicated value; 
re -sets target values 

Bulls -eye targets turn pop bumpers on and off 

4- places to spin Roto -Targets 

Stainless cabinet trim All the deluxe Gottlieb features 

SEE 

YOUR 

DISTRIBUTOR 
1140-50 N. KOSTNER AVE. CHICAGO 51, ILL. 

Y. Alwayi Profitable to Operato Gottlieb Games! 
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SENSATIONAL NEW / /ri:YY.II 1- PLAYERS GAME 

earns up to a week in average location 
Want to see slow spots come back to life in a hurry ? Want 

to see top locations turn into big money bonanzas? Get 

TABLE HOCKEY, the real player -to- player hockey game 

that keeps customers grinning, grunting and going back 

for more. "Beat you next game" repeat play appeal 

and extremely fast play result in collections never 

believed possible with strictly competitive play 

equipment. Fun to play without previous practice 

or knowledge of hockey, TABLE HOCKEY appeals 

to all types of players, men and women, young 

and old. Long location life is assured by 

exciting combat action and the fact that 

scores are usually close, keeping players 

in a competitive spirit month after month. 

Give yourself the get -well break you've 

been looking for. Get TABLE HOCKEY 

going for you today! 

AMUSEMENT BARGAIN ATTRACTS PLAY! 
A single dime entitles 2 players to match their skill in a fast and furious 
hockey game, and the dimes keep clinking into the cash -box hour after 
hour, day after day, month after month. 

FAST PLAY INSURES FAST PROFITS! 
Automatically timed play period is 3 minutes (adjustable), but players 
actually battle to cut the time, because first player to score 5 gets the 
winner light, and the game is ready for another coin and clash of skill. 

BIG MONEY IN SMALL SPACE! 
Table Hockey fits into pinball space -50 in. by 26 in. -but takes in 
double or triple the collections of expensive equipment which require 
double or triple the space. 

PLAYED WITH MINIATURE HOCKEY STICKS 

AND Y. IN. GLASS BALL PUCK 

ON ILLUMINATED FORMICA PLAYFIELD 

NO FREE -PLAY COIN -CHUTE OR COUNTER 

U.S. AND FOREIGN PATENTS PENDING 

RULES AND SCOREBOARD COPYRIGHTED 1962 

See your distributor... or write BALLY MANUFACTURING COMPANY 2640 BELMONT AVENUE, CHICAGO 18, ILLINOIS 
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READ HOW OUR 

ELECTRONIC DETECTIVE 

LOONS OUT FOR BOTH 

OPERATOR AND 

LOCATION: 

Seeburg's 'Private Eye' is 

a special light, clearly visi- 
ble, locked into the circuit 
of the Income Totalizer. 

Every time a coin is ac- 
cepted by the LP Console, 
or by any Stereo Consol- 
ette, the light winks on 
briefly. 

The bigger the coin, the 
longer the wink. 

Any attempt to block off 
the Income Totalizer's 
counting mechanism, any- 
where, positively shuts off 
the' Private Eye.' 

Operator or location can 
instantly check the Income 
Totalizer, any time, by 
dropping a coin In the LP 
Console or any Consolette. 
As long as he gets a wink 
from the'Private Eye,' he's 
sure the Income Totalizer 
is counting accurately. 

1" WATCH 
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beeburg's exclusive automatic Income Totalizer, 
like a cash register, adds up every coin accepted 
by the LP Console and all Stereo Consolettes. How 
can you be positive it's tamperproof? The amaz- 
ing `Private Eye' tells you instantly.. Exclusive 
... in the revolutionary new Seeburg LP Console 
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FRANC IS C LAUDA 

118 IDDLENECK RD 

PORI WASI1IMGOt L I 1,1 Y 

1133 132102n 

CLARK'S CLAN: Group of top rock ond roll stars gather with syndicated deejay 
Dick Clark at taping of Clork's show. Left to right: Jimmy Clanton, Dion, Chris 
Monte, Gene Pitney, Dick Clork, Mork Valentino and Brian Hyland. 

NEW EPIC In session at Bradley Studio, Nashville, Bobby 
Vinton (seated, center) goes ovm now arrangement with 
Epic's Bob Morgan. Bobby is currently on the charts with 
his waxing for Epic of "Trouble Is My Middle Name." 

BUSY BEE: Snuffy Garrett, Liberty's exec tUt. direzior. 
confers with singer Molly Bee ot label's Hollywood studio 
Molly's latest single is "She's Now to You." 

WINE E ROSES: At New York party honoring Henry Mancini 
and his score of "Days of Wine E Roses" movie. he's 
greeted by one of town's tallest deeioys, Don Cope, of 
WVN.1 Don gingerly downplays Scotch and sodo. 

Wow 

FIRST SESSION: The Wonderers recently cut their first session for United Artists, 
with manager Roy Rifkin, arranger Allan lorber and several writers on hand for 
the waxing. Group had been on personal appearance tour when date was 
scheduled. 

IRON CURTAIN: Rodio Free Europe 
listeners like to dial the jazz-pop 
record show deejayed by Eva Stan- 
kovo, Czech refugee. She makes 
music progromming selections from 
charts appearing in Billboord. Show 
is beamed to countries behind 
Europe's Iron Curtain. 

BACKBREAKER: New teen dance fad, the limbo, is demon- 
strated in Allentown. Po., at Hess department store by 
pretty Pot Morovek, fashion model, while Hess record buyer 
David Hess, holding Chubby's top-selling album, and Joseph 
Kuti watch. 

EUROPE-BOUND: Off on promotional tour of Europe is 
MGM's Pat Thomos. She'll appear on rNAIN-TV shows in 
Rome, London, Hamburg, Paris, et. Seeing her off are 
Clorence Avant. her manager (le(t), and MGM exec Gene 
Moretti (right). 

ARRIVAL( G r ou p of top 
German talent in music- 
ecord field arrives in New 

York for meetings with MGM. 
Reor, left to right: Peter 
Kraus, Polydor stor; Werner 
Schordenberger, composer; 
MGM's Danny Davis; Sie- 
mens' Clous Petermonn. 
Front: Gus Backus and wife, 
record producer Gerhard 
Mendelson. Singers will wax 
soon in Nashville. 

SINGING MEDIC: Richard Chambmloin, TV's "Dr. Kildare," 
listens intently to playback of his first album. Right, Jesse 
Kaye, of MGM, who was in charge of wax session. 
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